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FABRICS Woven f'abrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by

weight of cotton" weighing not more than 200g/m2.

3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twill

s208.43.00
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) FABRICS -Pile tabrics, including "long pile" t'abrics and teny
iabrics" knitted or crocheted of man-made fibres

6001 .9 r .00

? YARN Synthetic trlament yarn of polyesters 5402.33.00

4. FABRICS Dyed knitted or crocheted labrics 6006.32.00

5.

FABRICS

Synthetic staple fibres, not carded, combed of aramids 5503.1 r.00

Woven fabrics of cotton,containing 85% or more by

weisht of cotton, weighing not more than 200g/m2.

6. Plain weave, weighing not more than 100 g/m2 s208.2 r.00

7- Plain rveave. weighing not more than 100 gim2 5208.22.00

8. Plain rveave, weighing not more than 100 y'm2 5208.4 r .00

9. Plain rveave. rveighing not more than 
.l00 

g/m2 5208.42.00

KNITTED
FABRICS

--Pile t'abrics,including "long pile" fabrics and terry

thbrics. knitted or crocheted

10. knitted or crocheted fabrics of wool or flne animal hair 6006. r 0.00

ll knitted or crocheted f-abrics of Unbleached or bleached 6006.21.00

12. YARN Cotton swing thread. whether or not put up for retail sale

- 100% cotton varn"serving thread'
5204.1 L00

13. YARN -' Other ester thread
Ernbroidery thread,poly

s204.19.00

14. YARN Cotton yarn ( other than swing thread),containing 85%

ormore by weight of cotton, not put for retail sale.
s20s.13.00

15. YARN Cotton yarn ( other than swing thread),containing 85%

ormore by weight of cotton, not put for retalf sale.
s205.14.00

r6. YARN Cotton iewing thread, whether or not Put uprfor retail

sale

5204.20.00

17. YARN Cotton serving thread Containing 85% or more by weight

of cotton.
5204. t I .00

t8. FABRICS Woven f'abrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by

weight of cotton, weighing not more lhan200glm2.
5208.42.00

19. FABRICS Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including
woven fabrics obtained tiom materials of heading 54'04
----Dved

s407.42.00
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ffiiyarn,including
woven fabrics obta-ined from materials of heading 54'04FABRICS

ffiffiEbt',ct ot\y'lthAic fl I ament yarn, i ncl udi ng

woven fabrics obtained from materials of heading 54'04

ffierEb;lct ot\yrthetic tllament yarn, including

rvoven fabrics obtained tiom materials of heading 54'04

5508.10.00Silt"gm,tad of man-made staple fibres of synthetic
FABRICS

5513.23.00*ovEi- fabri.s 
"fuolyester 

staple fi bres

5514.22.00ffibers,containingless
than 85% by weight of such fibers' mixed mainly or

solely with cotton, of a weight exceeding 170 glmZ

--3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twit of
ster staple t'ibets,--65%S polyestet 35% cott

FABRICS

ACCESSORIES
@les of other materials'

Plastic ring,
/buckle/Silicon
Label/String

8531.90.00ratus (fbr examPle'

bells" sirens. indicator panels, burglar or f-ire alarms)"Security

tag/Super tag
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I - Of synthetic fibres 6003.30.00

2 - Other, unbleached or bleached 6005.36.00

J - Other, dyed 6005.37.00

4 - Other, printed
- Of artificial fibres 6005.39.00

5
- Of wool or fine animal hair
- Of cotton

6006.10.00

YARN

6 -Elastomeric 5404.11.00

7 -Other, ofpolyester 5402.47.00

8

-- Measuring less than 714.29 decitex but not less than

232.56 decitex (exceeding 14 metric number but not

exceeding 43 metric number)
5205.12.00

9

-- Measuring less ttran 714.29 decitexbut not less than

232.56 decitex (exceeding 14 metric number but not
exceeding 43 mefic number)

5205.12.00

l0
- Measuring less than 232.56 decitex but not less

thanl92.3l decitex (exceeding 43 metric number but not

exceeding 52 meric number)
5206.23.00

u - Of nylon or other polyamides, measuring per single yam

not more than 50 tex
5402.31.00

t2
-. Of nylon or other polyamides, per single yam more than
50 tex

5402.32.00

l3
- Other yarn, single, untwisted or with a twist not

excreding 50 tums per metre
s402.39.00

l4 - Other Embroidery Thread, polyester thread 5204.19.00

l5
-Measuring per single yarn less thariltgZ.lt decitex but not
less than l2i decitex ( exceeding 52 metric number but not
exceeding 80 metric number per single yam)

s206.44.00

l6 - Single yarn 5s09.3r.00

t7 * Unbleached or bleached -- Other 5512.11.00

t8
-- Silk screen imported by VAT registered ceramic ware

or tiles manufacturers
5512.19.10

t9 -- Other 5512.99.00
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20 Re-seal/Self adhesive tape Re-seaVSelf adhesive tape 3506.91.90

2t PI astic Stopper/Nletal Stopper

Articles for the conveyance or packing ofgoods, of
plastics; stoppers, lids, caps and other closures Ofpolymers
ofethylene

3923.21.00

22
Stopper Plastic (Stopper Plastic of
Stopper lids, other closures

Stoppers, lids, caps and other closures 3923.s0.00

23

Collar strip, collar insert, collar
band, collar board/size fastener I
hang tagl string seal/ plastic zipper/
plastic butterfl y/drawstring.

Articles ofapparel and clothing accessories 3926.20.90

24 Elastic/Elastic Binder Other articles of vulcanised rubber other than hard rubber.
5806.32.90

25 Hot melt adhesive tape Re-seaUhot melt adhesive tape 3506.10.00

26

Hang tag, Price ticket, Price tag;

paper tag, paper label, joker tag,
printed label, mach boolg jarcon

label,cardboard label

Paper or paper board label ofall kinds- Printed 4821.10.00

27 Drawcord/Drawstring
Synthetic filament yam single, untwisted or with a tw.ist
not exceeding 50 tums per meter

5402.39.00

28 Elastic/Elastic Binder Binder or baler twine 5607.41.00

29 Drawcord/Drawstring/String
Twine. cordage, ropes and cables, whether or not plaited or
braided and whether or not impregnated, coated, covered or
sheathed with rubber or plastics.

3926.20.90

30 Drawcord/Drawstring
Twine, Cordage, Rope and cables for fishing trawler and
factory ship 5607.49.t0

3l
Woven Tape/Cotton tape/ Cotton
Ribbon/Fabric Ribbon.

Woven fabrics of cotton 5806.3 r.00

32

Badge Labels, badges and similar articles of textile materials, in
the piece, in
strips or cut to shape or size, not embroidered of Woven

5807.10.00

JJ

Elastic/Elastic Binder Labels, badges and similar articles oftextile materials, in
the piece, in
strips or cut to shape or size, not embroidered ofothers

40t6.99.90

34
Embroidery patch / butterfly badge

of man made fibers
Embroidery of other textile materials or cotton in the piece,
in strips

5810.91.00

35 Drawcord/Drawstrin g/String Garments Clothing Accessories 6217.10.00

36 Rives Rives 7318.23.90

37

Clasps, frames with clasps,

bucHes, buckle-clasps, hooks,
eyes, eyelets and the like, of base

metal,

Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle clasps, hooks,
eyes, eyelets and the like, ofbase metal, ofa kind used for
clothing or clothing.

8308.90.00

38 Eyelets Hooks, eyes and eyelets 8308.10.00
39 Cotton combed knit grey yarn. Container seal r 8309.90.20

40

Security Tag/ Security Seal/ Sensor

Tagi RFID TaglRFLabel
Discs-tapes, solid-state non-volatile btorage devices, smart
cards and other media for the recording of sound or of
other phenomen4 whettrer or not recorded, including
matrices and masters for the production of discs, but
excluding products of chapter 37.-Proximity Cards and

tags.

8523.s9.20

4t

Security taglSuper tag Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example,

bells, sirens.

indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms),

8531.90.00

42 Adhesive tape Re-seal/Self adhesive tape 3919.10.90
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43
Stickers Tag --. Fibre reinforced polymer (FRp) sticks and profile

shapes 3916.90.20
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44
Drawsting/Elastic - Other

-Of polyethylene or polypropylene 5607.29.00

45
Ring tape/ Rubber tape/ Tup tap.

- Plates, sheets and strip 4008.21.00

46
Label (All kinds), (Apparel) (17
ASM) - Articles ofapparel and clothing accessories 4818.50.00

47 Drarvsting/ Drawcord/Cotton card - Ofother synthetic fibres 5607.50.00

48
Drawstring lDrawcord / Cotton
card. - Other 5607.90.00

49
Lather Patch,/Fakeeath er /Form
Patch

- Split leather 4104.49.t0

50
RIid Tag, Rf Tag, Rfid Label,
Rfid sticker, Pocket tag.

RFID TAG imported by InduiEEl -IRC h6iiil vat
compliant 100% export-oriented textile industry.

8s23.s9.20

5t Zipper (nylon/plastic) Zipper (nylon/plastic) solid fastener pants 9607.19.00
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90ToPolyester I 0% Interlock

-Of synthetic fibers Dyed

Yarn (carded)

Single yarn of uncombed fibers,Measuring 714.29 decitexor more ( not

100 % cotton /bci cotton yarn.

combed knit grey
yarn.

combed knit grey
yarn.

-- Single yarn of uncombed fiben: Measuring less than 192.31 decitex but
not less than 125 decitex exceeding.

52 metric number but not exceeding 80 metric number single yarn of
combo fibers.

- Single yam of ,.rncombed fibers: Measuring less than 214.29 decitex but
not less thar:.232.55 decitex (exceeding l4 metic number but not

- Single yam ofuncombed fibers: Measuring less than 232.56 decitex but
not less than 192.31 decitex (exceeding 134 metric uumber but not

exceeding 52 metic oumber)

Cotton yarn(other than swing thread )containing less than 85%by
ofcottoq not put up for retail sale.

- Single yarn of uncombed fibers Measuring 714.29 decitex or more (not

Other yarn single, with a twist exceeding 50 turns per meter of or other

Artificial yarn of viscose rayon untwisted or with a twist not exceeding 120

+ synthetic missed
CVC, PC Yarn.

Yam ofsynthetic staple fibers, not put up for retail sale.

- Containing 85% or more by weig[t of polyester staple fibers,
5509.21.00

Silk yarn and yam spun from silk waste, put up for retail sale; silk worm

Yarn of synthetic staple fibers, not put up for retail sale.

- Containing 8570 or more by weight ofpolyester staple fiber of 5509.51.00

85% Cotton 15% Viscose yam/81o/oCotton 15% Synthetic yam.

1007o Grey m6lange yam.

--Containing 85olo or more by weight of cotton

85% Cotton l0olo CVC 57o PC Yam

85%Polyester 15%Mesh

//Eq{s
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27 )lip/spring
Other articles ofplastic-and articles ofother materials ofheading nos'

39.01 to 39.14 ofother
3926.90.90

28 Draw rins /Accessories Drawstring / Accessories 6217.10.00

29 Wr en label/Label
Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motit's

-Other embroidery of man-made fibers.
5810.92.00

30 astic Button -Button of plastic not covered with textile material. 9606.21.00

31

Belt.

--Narrow fabrics made of velvet impregnated with rubber for covering
weaving spindle.

s91 l.l0.l0

32 -Embroidery Braids in the piece. 5808.10.00

JJ -Embroidery without visible gound. 5810.10.00

34 ---Other Embroidery of cotton 5810.9r.00

35
Pric taglPrice Ticket

(Printed) -Pictures,designs and photographs 49il.91.00

36 Secur r SeaU Sensor Tag

Discs-tape*otid:itate non-volatile storage devices, smart cards and other

media for the recording ofsound or ofother phenomen4 whether or not

recorde{ including matices and masters for the production ofdiscs, but
excluding Products ofchaPter 37.

---Proximitv Cards and tags.

8523.59.10

37 detal Button Button of a base metaVplastic, not covered with textile materials 9606.10.00

38 rdges, Leather
articte ofapparel and clothing accessories, ofleather or ofcomposition

leather... other clothine accessories
4203.40.00

39 rdges, Rubber Ottrer articles ofvulcanized rubber other than hard rubber-other 4016.99.90

40
Button

Brrttr
loulds & other parts

r Moulds / Blanls
Button Moulds & Ottrer parts Button Moulds/Blanls 9606.30.00

4l Stol rer (As Garments
\ccessories)

@ crown corks, screw caps and pouring

stoppers). oacking accessories, of base metal--other
8309.90.10

42 Tag pi Brush pin/Head pin
Fittingfor loose-leaf binders of base metals, staples in sffips for

packagtng.
8305.90.00

43 Iron Seal 8308.90.00

44 Metr stand metal Clips Ottrer articles of iron or steel, forged or stampe{ but not further worked. 7326.90.90
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Woven Fabrics of artificial staple Fabrics, containing 85%
or more bv weisht of

{oa.)-lot t q{{fft "fcm fr<aq
eiE. qq. cslv
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KNIT FABRICS
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a rvidth not exceeding 30cm,
containing by weight 5oZ or more of elastomeric yarn or

other than those ofheadine 60.01
Knitted or crochoted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30cm,
other than those of headine 60.0 I or 60.02
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30cm,
other than those ofheadine 60.01 or 60.02
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30cm,
other than those of headine 60.01 or 60.02
Other Knitted or crocheted fabrics

Other Knitted or crocheted fabrics

Other Knitted or crocheted f'abrics

Other Knitted or crocheted fabrics

Other Knitted or crocheted fabrics

Other Knitted or crocheted fabrics

Knit Fabrics (Including those made on gallons knitting
machine) other than those of headine 60.04.
Other Knitted or uocheted Fabrics

Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30cm,
containing by weight 5olo or more of elastomeric yam or

other than those ofheadine 60.01

6004.10.00-
6004.90.00

Other Knitl.ed or crocheted fabrics

Other lfuitted or crocheted fabrics

Other Knitted or crocheted fabrics

Woven Fabrics of Cotton, Weighting not n\ore than200glm2 5212.12.00

Woven Fabrics of Cotton. Weighting not more than200glm2 521 2. I 3.00

Woven Fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including woven
Fabrics obtained from materials of headine 54.04
Woven Fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including woven
Fabrics obtained from materials of heading 54.04, Other
woven Fabrics, contaiuing 85%o or more by weight of non-

Woven Fabrics of synthetic filament yam, including woven
Fabrics obtained from rnaterials of heading 54.04, Other
woven Fabrics, containing 85% or more by weight of Nylon

Woven Fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including woven
Fabrics obtained from malerials of heading 54.04, Other
woven Fabrics, containing 85% or more by weight of

Staple Woven 5516.14.00
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I Paper or paDerboard label ofall kinds .- printed 4821.10.00
e lEftkutRqt
6{lvlcFF

2 Woven L bel, Labels, Badges and similar articles of textiles materials, in
the oiece. in strios or cut to share or size. not embroidered.

5807.10.00

3 Collarbor
Inlav/Col

riCliplCollar
u insert

Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of
headine Nos. 39.01 to 39.14 of other

3926.20.90

4 Stopper, lastic Article of the conveyance or packing of goods, of plastic;
stonners- lids- caos and other closures ofolastics.

3923.50.00,
8309.90.90

5 Hanger Other articles of plastic and articles of other materials of
headine Nos. 39.01 to 39.14

3926.90.99,
3926.20.90

6 Adhesive lape Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other
flat shapes. ofplastics. weather or not in rolls ofother.

3919.90.99

7 Sequenct Other olates. sheets. film. foil and strio. of plastics--other 392t.90.99
8 Fake fur/ rtificial fur Anificial fur and articles thereof. 4304.00.00
9 Sewing 1 rread Cotton sewing thread, containing 85% or more by weight of

cotton . weather or not put up for retail sale
5204.1 1 .00

l0 Drawstrir r. Draw card Twine, cordage, ropes and cables, weather or not plaited or
braided and weather or not impregnated, coated, covered or
sheathed with rubber or plastics of other.

5607.90.00,
5402.39.00

ll Embroid,
Sequencr

Patch

y Thread,
Join, Embroidery

Woven fabrics of metal thread and woven fabrics of meta
llised yarn of heading 56.05, of a kind used in apprel,
embroiderv in the niece. in strios or in motifs.

5810.99.00

t2 LacelLac fabrics ofTulles Tulles and other net Fabrics, not including woven, Knitted or
Crocheted fabrics; Lace in piece, in stripe or in motifs, other
than fabrics ofheadins 60.02 to 60.06

5804.10.00,
5404.90.00

13 Interlinir Textile fabrics, impregated, coated, covered or laminated
with plastic, fusing interlining materials other than those of
headins 59.02.

5903.20.10

t4 Zipper lv tal Slide fastners and parts thereof fitted with chain scoops of
base metal.

9607.1 1.00

l5 ZipperP ler fastncrs and parts thereof fitted with chain scoops of base

metal.
9607.20.00

l6 Security
garments
Garment

ilarm for
as Readymade
accessories)

Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus, other than those

ofheading 85.12 or 85.30

8531 . 10.00

l7 Collar & luffRib Other Knitted or crocheted fabrics ofother 6006.90.00
l8 Meta Bu 0n Button, of a base metal/plastic, not covered with textile

materials .

9606.22.00

t9 Sank/Sn D Button Button. oress-fasteners. snao-fasteners and Dress-sfuds . 9606.10.00
20 Washing varning Labels Labels, Badges and similar articles of textiles materials, in

the oiece. in strips or cut to share or size. not embroidered.
5807.10.00

zt Security
Super Ta

ag (NFD), Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices,"smart
cards" and other meria for the recording of sound or of other
phenomenq whether or not recorded, including matrices and
masters for the production of discs, but excluding products of
Chapter3T-Proximity Cards and tass.

8523.59.10

')') Sewing Thread Cotton sewing thread, containing 85% or more by weight of
cotton.

5401.10.00,
ss08.10.00,
5508,20.00,
5401.20.00

23 Coller B, , Insert 62L7.L0.00

24 Tissue Pr rcr (Anparel)l 4818.50.00

25 Poly Bag 3923.29.30,
3919.90.00

26 Gum Ta1

Tape(ex<

insulatio

:/Skotch
pt electric
Tane)

3919.10.00,
3919.90.00

27 ElasticiE utic Binder 4015.90,00

28 Price Til 4821.90.00

29 Back Bo .d 4823.90.99

30 Carton 4819.10.00,
4819.20.00

3l Hane Ta Striker/Barcode 5807.90.00

32 Coller & luffRib 6001.10.00,
6002.90.00
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