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SL Description Of Raw Materials As Per BCT-2023-2024 Materials Commercial Name H. S. Code
No
1. | -Products suitable for use as glues or adhesives, put up for
retail sale as glues or adhesives, not exceeding a net weight Bias 3506.10.00
of l kg 2k )
% Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other | Size Sticker, Plastic Sticker, Gum
flat shapes, of plastics, whether or not in rolls. ---- Other Tape, Poly Tape, Polyester Tape, 3919.90.99
Transparent Tape, Plastic Tape
& Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of plastics;
stoppers, lids, caps and other closures, of plastics
-- Of polymers of ethylene Of Polymers Of Ethylene 3923.21.00
-- Of other plastics
4. Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of plastics; g
stoppers,lids, caps and other closures, of plastics - Other e o TS0
5. | Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of | Plastic seal/Plastic Tag/ Plastic
heading Nos.39.01 to 39.14. --- Other seal with string/Plastic Hang
Tag/Plastic hangtag string/Plastic 3926.20.90
Hanger/Plastic Fastener
(All kinds )
6. | Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of ; .
26.90.99
heading Nos. 39.01 to 39.14.-Other R C fe P £ s
7. | Articles of apparel and clothing accessories (including e
gloves, mittens and mitts), for all purposes, of vulcanised gloves, Mitts, Vulcanised Rut;ber 4015.90.00
e viipmenin e other than Hard Rubber
rubber.-Other
8. | Other articles of vulcanised rubber other than hard rubber. - Elastic 4016.10.00
Of cellular rubber
9. | Other articles of vulcanised rubber other than hard rubber.- Rubber Badge/Rubber Patch 4016.99.90
Other
10. | Articles of apparel and clothing accessories, of leather or PU Patch/Leather Patch/Lather
ofcomposition leathe. Label/Rubber Patch/ Jacrum 4203.40.00
- Other clothing accessories Label/Belt ( All Kinds )
11. | Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not Hang Tag/Papet: Tag/Pa_per
printed.- Printed LabeUPaPer Sticker/Price ; 4821.10.00
Tag/Price Ticket/Hang Tag with
String with seal (All kinds )
i ; textil , and ; 5604.10.00
12. Ru.bber thread‘ and cord, ?extlle covered; te 1 e yarn, an Rubber Thread And Cord, Textile
strip and the like of heading 54.04 or 54.05, impregnated, O el
coated, covered or sheathed with rubber or plastics.
13. | Twine, cordage, ropes and cables, whether or not plaited or
braided and whether or not impregnated, coated, covered or Drawstring/ Drawcord 5607.90.00
sheathed with rubber or plastics. - Other
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SL Description Of Raw Materials As Per BCT-2023-2024 Materials Commercial H. S. Code
No Name
14. | Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or
crocheted fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other ;
than fabrics of headings 60.01? to 60.06. . Lace Fabric 5804.10.00
- Tulles and other net fabrics
15. | Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or 5804.21.00
crocheted fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other Of man-made fibres
than fabrics of headings 60.02 to 60.06.
16. | Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow
fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an :
R rhtisns (bolducgs) s Y Ribbon 5806.32.90
~Other
17. | Braids in the piece; ornamental trimmings in the piece, without
e_ml?roidery, other than knitted or crocheted; tassels, pompons and Pompom Lace 5808.90.00
similar articles.
-Other
18. El_llbroidgr)f in the piece, in strips or in motifs- Embroidery Eihodary Lace 5810.10.00
without visible ground
19. ir;-ltz;?:iery in the piece, in strips or in motifs -- Of other textile B ey Taice Fabiic 5810.99.00
20. | Rubberised textile fabrics, other than those of heading 59.02.- Adhesive tape of a width not 5906.10.00
Other exceeding 20 cm 5 5
21. | Warp knit fabrics (including those made on galloon knitting
machines), other than of headings 60.01 to 60.04 - Other, dyed H e e o
22. | Other made up clothing accessories; parts of garments or of
clothing accessories, other than those of heading 62.12 Seizer 6217.10.00
. — Accessories-
23. | Curtains (including drapes) and interior blinds; curtain or bed Eyelet With Tape, Washer 6303.91.00
valances. -- Of cotton With Tape =
24, | Chain and parts thereof, of iron or steel. Other parts Metal Chain 7315.90.00
25. | Nails, tacks, drawing pins, corrugated nails, staples (other than
those of heading 83.05) and similar articles, of iron or steel, ;
whether or not »%ith heads of other material, but excluding such e g Fin s
articles with heads of copper.
26. | Sewing needles, knitting needles, bodkins, crochet hooks,
embroidery stilettos and similar articles, for use in the hand, of Tag Pin, safety Pins, iron 7319.90.00
iron or steel; safety pins and other pins of iron or steel, not and Garments related Pin S
elsewhere specified orincluded.--Other
27. | Fittings for loose-leaf binders or files, letter clips, letter corners,
paper clips, in(.iexing_ tags and similar office articles, of base Tag Pin 8305.90.00
metal; staples in strips (for example, for offices, upholstery,
packaging), of base metal. - Other, including parts
28. | Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes,
eyelets and the like, of base metal, of a kind used for clothing or
clothing accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches, books, Badge Metal /Metal
awnings, leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other made | Badge/Buckle, D-Ring, O- 8308.90.00
up articles; tubular or bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and Ring
spangles, of base metal.
- Other, including parts
29. | Stoppers, caps and lids (including crown corks, screw caps and
pouring stoppers), capsules .for bottles, ‘threaded bungs, bung Metal Stopper 8309.90.99
covers, seals and other packing accessories, of base metal. ----
Other
30. | Sign-plates, name-plates, address-plates and similar plates, Badge Metal /Metal
numbers letters and other symbols, of base metal, excluding those Badge/Buckle, D-Ring, 8310.00.00
of, heading 94.05. O-Ring
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SL Description Of Raw Materials As Per BCT-2023-2024 Materials Commercial Name H. S. Code
No
31. | Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells,

sirens, indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those of Alarm Tag \\’,(SSFSUPH L 8531.80.00
heading 85.12 or 85.30. - Other apparatus
32. | Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells,
sirens, indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those of Alarm Tag XSSFSUPM Tig 8531.90.00
heading 85.12 or 85.30 - Parts
33. | Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button
moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks. Pl g L el
34. | - Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button h :
moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks. S utton./ Ston Plastic 9606.21.00

Button

- Of plastics not covered with textile material

35. | Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button
moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks. Metal Button 9606.22.00
-- Of a base metal, not covered with textile material

36. | Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button
moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks--Other
37. | Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button Button Mulds And Other Parts 9606.30.00

Button 9606.29.00

moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks. Of Button, Button Blanks
38. | Slide fasteners and parts thereof.--Other Rubber Badge/Rubber Patch/
; 9607.19.00
Zipper Puller
39. | Slide fasteners and parts thereof. - Parts fasteners and parts 9607.20.00
Fabrics
1 Woven Fabric Printed Woven Fabrics 5407.54.00
2 81% Polyester 17% Viscose 2% Spandex Viscose 215 Fabri 5407.92.00
GSM.WIDTH 56/57” T Rgprics
3. 100% Cotton Shera Knitted Fabrics 6001.21.00
Other Knitteq Orl Crocheted Fabrics Knitted Fabrics 6006.22.00
-Of Synthetic Fibres.
Y 100% Cotton Knitted Fabric Knitted Fabrics 6006.24.00
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(A) Knit Fabrics
Woven fabrics of cotton, 5208.33.00 5208.11.00
containing 85% or more by Unbleached of Plain
01 weight of cotton, weave, weighing not more
weighing not more than 200 than 100 g/m2
g/m2.
Woven fabrics of cotton, 5208.49.00 5208.31.00
containing 85% or more by Dyed of Plain weave,
02 weight of cotton, weighing not more than
weighing not more than 200 100 g/m2
g/m2,
Wove.n fabncs of cotton, Woven Fabrics of Other 5209.12.00 5208.59.00
03 containing 85% or more by . .
. Printed Fabrics
weight of cotton
. Woven Fabrics of 5209.21.00 5209.12.00
Woven fabrics of cotton,
- Unbleached 3-thread or 4-
04 containing 85% or more by thread twill. includin
weight of cotton P g A ¥ @
cross twill 207 SRl
Woven fabrics of cotton, . 5209.32.00 5209.21.00
05 containing 85% or more by Woven Fabrics of WW
. Bleached Plain weave |
weight of cotton
Woven fabrics of cotton, Woven Fabrics of Dyed 5209.42.00 5209.32.00
06 containing 85% or more by 3-thread or 4-thread twill,
weight of cotton including cross twill
Woven fabrics of cotton, 5407.72.00 5209.42.00
07 containing 85% or more by Woven Fabrics of Denim
weight of cotton
Other woven fabrics, 5501.10.00 5407.51.00
Woven fabrics of synthetic containing 85% or more
08 filament yarn, including by weight of Unbleached
woven fabrics or bleached textured
polyester filaments
Other woven fabrics, 6002.40.00 5407.41.00
Woven fabrics of synthetic containing 85% or more
09 filament yarn, including by weight of filaments of
woven fabrics Unbleached or bleached
nylon or other polyamides
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Woven fabrics of synthetic Other woven fabrics, 6006.20.00 5407.72.00
10 filament yarn, including containing 85% or more
woven fabrics obtained from by weight of synthetic
materials of heading 54.04 filaments of Dyed
Woven fabrics of artificial Woven fabrics obtained 6006.31.00 5408.10.00
11 filament yarn, including from high tenacity yarn of
woven fabrics viscose rayon
Pile fabrics, including "long 6003.20.00 6001.91.00
1 pile” fabrics and terry fabrics, Looped Pile fabrics of
knitted or other cotton
crocheted.
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of . . 6003.30.00 6002.40.00
. . Containing by weight 5%
a width not exceeding 30 cm, .
- - or more of elastomeric
13 Containing by weight 5% or L
. yarn containing rubber
more of elastomeric yarn or thread
rubber thread,
14 Knitted or crocheted fabrics of Knitted of Crocheted 6003.40.00 6003.20.00
a width not exceeding 30 cm Fabrics of Cotton
15 Knitted or crocheted fabrics of Knitted or Crocheted 6004.10.00 6003.30.00
a width not exceeding 30 cm Fabrics Synthetic Fibers ‘
16 Knitted or crocheted fabrics of Knitted of Crocheted 6005.22.00 6003.40.00
a width not exceeding 30 cm Fabrics of Artificial Fibers
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of Knitted or Crocheted 6006.21.00 6004.10.00
a width exceeding 30 cm, Fabrics containing by
17 containing by weight 5% or weight 5% or more of
more of elastomeric yarn or elastomeric yarn but not ELGRENCE
rubber thread containing rubber thread Bofoq it
Warp knit fabrics (includin . . 6006.32.00 6005.22.00 SISISA
18 thcaasz made on ga(lloond : Warp Knit Fabrics of dyed S |
s . cotton
knitting machines)
Other knitted or crocheted Kn.itted or Crocheted 6006.91.00 6006.21.00
19 fabrics Fabrics of Unbleached or
bleached cotton
Other knitted or crocheted Kn'itted or Crocheted . 6006.32.00 6006.32.00
20 ) Fabrics of dyed Synthetic
fabrics :
fibers
(B) Accessories
Narrow woven fabrics, 5806.32.10 5806.32.10
other than goods of
. fabrics consisting of warp
01 Ribbon without weft assembled
by means of an adhesive
(Bolduc's})
02 Clasps, frames with clasps, 8308.10.00 8308.10.00
buckies, buckie-clasps,
hooks, eyes, eyelets and
Eyelets the like, of base metal, of
a kind used for clothing or
clothing accessories
03 Slide fasteners and parts 9607.11.00 9607.11.00
. there of 9607.19.00 9607.19.00
Zipper Fitted with chain scoops
of base metal and other
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(A) Knit Fabrics
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width . 5407.52.00
exceeding 30 cm, containing by Othgr wovoen fabrics,
01 weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn or contaln.lng 85% or more by
weight of textured
_rubber thread, other those of polyester filaments of Dyed
heading 60.01
Other woven fabrics, 5407.61.00
containing 85 % or more by
Warp knit fabrics (including those made weight of polyester
02 on galloon knitting machines), filaments of Containing 85
other than of headings 60.01 to 60.04 % or more by weight of
non- textured polyester
filaments
05 Pile fabrics, including "long pile" fabrics Looped Pile fabrics other of 6001.92.00
and terry fabrics, knitted or crocheted. man-made Fibers
Containing by weight 5% or 6002.90.00
06 Warp knit fabrics {including those made more of elastomeric yarn
on galloon knitting machines) containing rubber thread
or other
07 Warp knit fabrics (including those made Warp Knit Fabrics of other 6005.37.00
on galloon knitting machines) dyed Synthetic Fibers
08 Other knitted or crocheted fabrics xvrtal;rc:;";;:ctl):fbse?: 6005.42.00
Of synthetic fibres 6006.33.00
ther knit heted fabri Of yarns of di nt
09 Oth ted or crocheted fabrics ya Csor;ucigffere %ﬁ@_j‘m
o ::3:2?;:32?9 ﬁff?;r:::tlc filament yarn, of synthetic fibres 6006.34.00
‘obtained from materials of heading 54.04. Printed I
Containing by weight 5% or 6004.10.00
11 Other knitted or crocheted fabrics more of elastomgru.c yam
but not containing
rubber thread
12 Other knitted or crocheted fabrics Printed of Other 6006.90.00
14 Unbleached or bleached Knitted or Crocheted 6006.41.00
Fabrics of Bleached or
Unbleached and dyed
artificial fibers
15 Of other textile materials Looped Pile fabrics of other 5801.90.00
man-made Fibers/Velvet
(B) Accessories:
Other plates, sheets, film, 3920.20.10
foil and strip, of plastics,
non-cellular and not
03 Heat Transfer Label reinforced, laminated,
supported or similarly
combined with other
materials in printed form
Other articles of plastics 3926.20.90
. and articles of apparel and
04 Seal/string clothing accessories and
other
/[5T #Tet : o5 //
‘773162:1 1
?ﬂ:ﬁ}w ?IE Wgs%m



/198t TR-05//

JtoreR e

BCT 2022-23 st
JIOTNET I

G35 GATIG

IR Ao

10

Hang Tag

Paper or paperboard labels
of all kinds, whether or not
printed or printed

4821.10.00

11

Ropes Binder

Twine, cordage, ropes and
cables, whether or not
plaited or braided and

whether or not
impregnated, coated,
covered or sheathed with
rubber or plastics or other

5607.29.00

12

Elastic Tape

Narrow woven fabrics,
other than goods of Other
woven fabrics, containing

by weight 5% or more of
elastomeric yarn or rubber
thread

5806.20.00

13

Elastic Tape

" Narrow woven fabrics,
other than goods of Other
woven fabrics, containing
by weight 5% or more of
elastomeric yarn or rubber
thread

5607.50.00

14

Ribbon

Narrow woven fabrics,
other than goods of fabrics
consisting of warp without
weft assembled by means

of an adhesive (Bolduc's)

5806.32.00

15

Label

Labels, badges and similar
articles of textile materials,
in the piece, in
strips or cut to shape or
size, not embroidered or
other

5807.10.90

20

RFID Tag/Security Tag/Alarm Tag

Discs, tapes, solid-state
non-volatile storage
devices, "smart cards” and
other media for the
recording of sound or of
other phenomena, whether
or not recorded, including
matrices and masters for
the production of discs of
Proximity Cards and tags,
and
RFID TAG imported by
Industrial IRC holder VAT
compliant 100%
export-oriented textile
industry

8523.59.10
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21 RFID Tag/Security Tag/Alarm Tag Discs, tapes, solid-state 8523.59.20

non-volatile storage
devices, "smart cards" and
other media for the
recording of sound or of
other phenomena, whether
or not recorded, including
matrices and masters for
the production of discs of
Proximity Cards and tags,
and
RFID TAG imported by
Industrial IRC holder VAT
compliant 100%
export-oriented textile
industry
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SL | Name of the Raw Materials according to the Commercial name of the | Heading/H.S Yearly
No. - BCT 2022-2023 Raw Materials . Code No. Import
Pile fabrics, including "long pile" fabrics and terry fabrics, knitted or I 4T @
crocheted. 237 sifgmy
01 | -- Of man-made fibres Knitted Fabrics 6001.92.00 RG]
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1 Knit Fabrics: : 6003.20.00 7SR Aol 8
Knit fabrics Of Cotton m
2 Knit fabrics of synthetic fibers ’ 6003.30.00 W
3| Kanitfabrics Aificial fibers 6003.40.00 COIIF |
4 Knit fabrics of containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yam but not containing 6004.10.00
rubber thread
5 Knit fabrics of dyed cotton 6005.22.00
6 Knit fabrics of unbleached or bleached cotton 6006.21.00
7 Knit fabrics of dyed, fibers 6006.32.00
8 Pile Fabrice Knitted or Crocheted fo cotton 6001.91.00
Fabrics
01 Twill Fabrics, Cross Twill Fabrics 5208.33.00
02 Woven Fabrics & Other Printed Fabrics 5208.49.00
03 Twill Fabrics, Cross Twill Fabrics 5209.12.00
04 Woven Fabrics 5209.21.00
05 Spandex Twill Fabrics 5209.32.00
06 Denim Fabrics 5209.42.00
07 Polyester Fabrics 5407.72.00
08 Nylon Fabrics 5501.10.00
09 Viscose Rayon Fabrics 5504.10.00
10 Knitted/Crocheted Fabrics 6002.40.00
11 Cotton Knitted/Crocheted Fabrics 6003.20.00
12 Knitted/Crocheted Fabrics Bleached of Unbleached 6006.31.00
Accessores
01 Label 5807.10.00,
5807.90.00
02 Button 9606.10.00,
9606.29.00
03 Rivets 8308.20.00
04 Eyelets 8308.10.00
05 Hang Tag 4821.90.00
06 Zipper 9607.19.00
07 Tag Pin 7319.90.00
08 Butter fly/Collar Insert 3923.29.90
09 Drawstring/Draw Cord 5607.29.00
10 Velcro Tape 3919.90.99
1 Ribbon 6001.99.00
12 Lace/Crochet 5804.29.00
Mechanically made of lace of other textile materials
13 Elastic 5806.20.00
(all kinds of elastic for RMG)
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