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4 Nylon Mash Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including woven | 5407.69.00
fabrics
obtained from materials of heading 54.04.
- Other woven fabrics, containing 85% or more by weight of
textured polyester filaments:
-- Other
2 Drawcord Twine, cordage, ropes and cables, whether or not plaited or | 5607.90.00
braided and whether or not impregnated, coated, covered or
sheathed with rubber or plastics.
- Other
3. Polyester Mash Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or | 5804.10.00
Fabrics/Net Fabrics | €rocheted fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other
than fabrics of headings 60.02 to 60.06.
- Tulles and other net fabrics
-- Of other textile materials 5804.29.00
4. Polyester Ribbon Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; | 5806.32.10
narrow fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by
means of an adhesive (bolducs)
--- Imported by industrial IRC holder VAT compliant satin ribbon
manufacturing industry
5. Velcro Tape Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; | 5806.40.00
narrow fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by
means of an adhesive (bolducs).
- Fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an
adhesive (bolducs)
6. Embroidery Lace Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs 5810.91.00
- Other embroidery :
-- Of cotton
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7. Embroidery Lace Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs 5810.92.00
- Other embroidery :

-- Of man-made fibres

8. Knitted Mash Fabrics | Warp knit fabrics (including those made on galloon knitting | 6005.90.90
machines), other than of headings 60.01 to 60.04

- Of artificial fibres :
--- Other
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Accessories:
1 | Velcro Tape Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading Nos.
39.01 to 39.14. 3926.10.00
- Office or school supplies :
2 Velcro Tape, Woven Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow fabrics
Tape, Drawcord consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive
5806.39.00
r (bolducs).
---Of other textile materials
3 | RFID, TAG, Sticker, Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, "smart cards" and
Level, Logo other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena, whether or
not recorded, including matrices and masters for the production of discs, 8523.59.20
but excluding products of Chapter 37. R
--- RFID TAG imported by Industrial IRC holder VAT compliant 100%
export-oriented textile industry
4 | Woven Level, Twine, cordage, ropes and cables, whether or not plaited or braided and
Drawcord whether or not impregnated, coated, covered or sheathed with rubber or
plastics. 5607.50.00
---Of other synthetic fibres
Drawstring, Woven Labels, badges and similar articles of textile materials, in the piece. in strips
. : 5807.10.00
5 | Level or cut to shape or size, not embroidered
L --- Woven J
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1 # Sewing Thread all kinds 5204.11.00,5204.19.00,5401.10.00,5401.20.00,5508.10.00, 3ofea vifxmr
5 5508.20.00,5402.19.00 SIET
4 | Poly Bag 3923.21.00,3923.29.90,6305.33.00,3923.29.10
3 '; Label all kinds 5807.10.00,5807.90.00
4 | Tissue Paper 4818.50.00,4818.90.00
5 | Adhesive Tape, Printed Gum Tape, 3919.10.00,3919.90.20,5906.10.00, 3926.90.90,6217.10.00
Elastlc Tape, Reflective/Non
e reflective Transfer/Reflective Tape
6 | Pin Tag/ Hang Tag 7319.90.00
17 | Button 9606.21.00,9606.29.00,9606.22.00,9606.10.00
'8 | Zipper & Puller 9607.11.00,9607.19.00,9607.20.00
9 TElastic/Elastic Band/Expose Flat 6217.10.00, 4015.90.00,5806.20.00
| Elastic/Knitted Elastic
10 Stopper 3923.50.00,8309.90.90
11 T/C Interlining 5903.10.10,5903.10.90,5903.20.10,5903.90.10,5903.90.90,
- 5903.20.90
12 Hanger/Hanger Connector/Clip/ 3926.20.90,3926.40.00,3916.90.90,3926.90.99,
| Plastic & Metal Item
13 P.P Band 3923.10.00,3923.21.00
14 Lace/Collar & Cuff Rib 5804.10.00,5804.21.00,5804.30.00,5804.29.00,6001.10.00,
o 6002.90.00, 6217.10.00
D Collar Insert/Butter Fly/Tie 6215.20.00,4203.40.00
16 Neck/Back Board 4811.90.90,4808.10.00,4823.90.99
17 Rivet/Buckle/Ribbon/ 7318.29.00,5806.32.10,5806.32.90,5811.00.00,5208.11.00
| Ties/bow ties/Neck Tice i
18 Price Ticket/Price Sticker/Swing 4821.10.00,4821.90.00,4823.90.10
sl Ticket/Sticker \
19 | Carton 4819.10.00, 4819.20.00
20 | Eyelet/Hooks/Cotton Drawstring 8308.10.00,8308.90.00, 6217.10.00,6217.90.00
21 Shoulder Pad/Tag/Pad printing ! 6217.10.00
o plate/ Woven Cord/Draw Cord |
22 " Lather Pad/Lather Patch/Foke 4107.19:00,4107.11.00,4107.99.00
1 [ Leather/Pu Leather patch
23 Fake Far/Metal Clip/Metal Chain 4304.00.00,7315.12.00
24 Sewing Needle 7319.40.00,7319.90.00
125 | Heat Transfer Seal 4908.10.10,4908.10.90,4908.90.00
126 Rubber Band 4002.49.00
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1 | Woven 5208.11.00-5212.25.00,5209.11.00-5209.32.00,5407.11.00-5408.34.00, TR
Fabrics 5512.11.10-5516.94.00,5007.10.00-5007.90.00,5801.10.00-5811.00.00,
2 | Woven 5308.23.00, 5208.31.00, 5208.32.00, 5208.33.00, 5208.39.00, 5208.41.00, 5208.42.00, | FAeCATE
& Fabrics 5208.43.00, 5208.51.00, 5208.52.00, 5209.21.00, 5209.22.00, 5209.31.00, 5209.32.00,
5209.39.00, 5209.42.00, 5209.49.00, 5210.21.00, 5210.31.00, 5210.41.00, 5211.11.00,
5211.59.00, 5212.12.00, 5212.13.00, 5212.15.00, 5212.23.00, 5212.24.00, 5212.25.00,
5403.41.00, 5407.10.10-5407.94.00, 5408.34.00, 5512.11.00, 5512.21.00, 5513.29.00,
5513.39.00, 5513.41.00, 5514.11.00, 5514.12.00, 5514.22.00, 5514.30.00, 5514.41.00,
5514.49.00, 5515.11.00, 5516.11.00, 5516.13.00, 5516.21.00, 5801.10.00, 5801.22.00,
5801.36.00, 5802.11.00, 5809.00.00, 5007.10.00
3 | Lace fabric 5804.10.00,5804.21.00,5804.30.00,5804.29.00,6001.10.00,6002.90.00, AT
6217.10.00
4 Articles of HALATS
plastic(plastic 3926.90.99 %“ o
seal) Bﬁﬁf'
5 Proximity AT I
Cards and
8523.59.10 AR
tags /Barcode \
seal(rfid)
6 | Metal clip 8309.90.20 LA
7 | Butter fly 4002.19.00 LIS
8 Color insert 4002.49.00 FATIET
9 | Paper& ALAET
Paper
St 4821.10.00
inlay
10 | Embroidery AL
eIt 5810.10.00
visible
ground A
11 | Reflective § AT
tape, Mobilon 5906.99.10, 3919.10.90
Tape
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A. FABRICS
| | Knitted Fabrics Woven pile fabrics and chenille fabrics, other than 5801.32.00
fabrics of heading $8.02 or 58.06.
-= Cut corduroy
2 | Knitted Fabrics Textile fabrics, impregnated, coated, covered or $903.20.90
laminated with plastics, other than those of heading
59.02.- - With polyurethane 1 v g
- Other 3fin vfow
3 | Knitted Fabrics Textile fabrics, impregnated, coated, covered or $903.90.90 CTeRYY
laminated with plastics, other than those of heading s |
59.02.
= Other
4 | Knitted Fabrics Textile fabrics otherwise impregnated, coated or 5907.00.00
covered; painted canvas being theatrical scenery,
studio back-cloths or the like,
5 | Knitted Fabrics (iauze, other than narrow fabrics of heading 58.06. 5803.00.00
: Fhreea afsfeTs A BisTaTeTe TN (A3 Q03¢-2038 WAWEY) O | e
(A) Accessories:
Brassieres, girdles, corsets, brace, suspenders, garters
and similar articles and parts thereof, whether or not
| | bnop knitied or crocheted. 6212.90.00
- Other
Heat Transfer Seal, Other plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of plastics,
3 Label, Logo, non-cellular and not reinforced, laminated, supported 3920.10.90
Reflective/ Non or similarly combined with other materials. RAT
Reflective --- Other
Paper, paperboard, cellulose wadding and webs of
cellulose fibres, coated, impregnated, covered, surface-
coloured, surface-decorated or printed, in rolls or eaf v o
3 | Paper Adhesive Sticker | rectangular (including square) sheets, of any size, 4811.49.00 T3fen vt
other than goods of the kind described in heading m«ﬁ ‘
48.03, 48.09 or 48.10. '
=Other
4 | Heat transfer Label - Transfers (decalcomanias), vitrifiable : Other 4908.90.00
s | Leather Patch f)tha articles of leather or of composition leather. 4205.00.90
Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading
58.07; narrow fabrics consisting of warp without weft
¢ | Elastic Tape/Elastic assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs). Other $806.20
Webbing woven fabrics, containing by weight 5% or more of 20.00
clastomeric yam
or rubber thread
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Sticker

PPaper or paperboard labels of all Kinds, whether or not
printed. - Other:
= Other

4821.90.90

Hanger Plastic Hanger/
Plastic Hook/Hook

Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials
of heading N0s.39.01 to 39.14.
« Other

3926.20.90

9

Inlay Hanger

Paper or paperboard labels of all Kinds, whether or not
printed.
- Printed

4821.10.00

10

Woven Tape/Twill
Tape

Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading
58.07; Narrow fabrics consisting of warp without wefl
assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs).

== Of other textile materials

5806.39.00

Super Tag/ Magnetic
detector

Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for
example, bells, sirens, indicator panels, burglar or fire
alarms), other than those of heading 85.12 or 85.30.

- Parts

8531.90.00

Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for
example, bells, sirens, indicator pancls, burglar or fire
alarms), other than those of heading 85.12 or 85.30.

« « Other apparatus

8531.80.00

12

Super Tack

Nails, tacks, drawing pins, corrugated nails, staples
(other than those of heading 83.05) and similar articles,
of iron or steel, whether or not with heads of other
material, but excluding such articles with heads of

copper.

7317.00.00

13

String

Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials
of heading Nos. 39.01 to 39.14.
- Other

3926.90.99

14

Paper String

Other paper, paperboard, cellulose wadding and webs of
cellulose fibres, cut to size or shape; other articles of
paper pulp, paper, paperboard, cellulose wadding or
webs of cellulose fibres. «- Other :

= Other

4823.90.99

15

RFID Sticker/Label/
Security Tag/ RFID
Tag/Paper

Proximity Cards and tags

8523.59.10

16

Plastic Bag with RFID

Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices,
*smari cards" and other media for the recording of
sound or of other phenomena, whether or not recorded,
including matrices and masters for the production of
discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37.

-~ RFID TAG imported by Industrial IRC holder VAT
compliant 100% export-oriented textile industry

8523.59.20

Anrticles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of
plastics; stoppers, lids, caps and other closures, of
plastics

== Other

3923.29.90

17

Printed PP Packing Box

Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of
plastics; stoppers, lids, caps and other closures, of

plastics.
- Boxes, cascs, crates and similar articles

3923.10.00
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Other made up clothing accessories, knitted or cee e
18 | Collar & Cuff (Knitted) | crocheted; knitted or crocheted parts of garments or of 6117.90.00 e
clothing accessories. - Parts ' '

ot 20O BPFT IS MIBGIHA BT -08, o, ok 8 o] A fHaAfET wrara @j
S3jope

v Y ofaes, [ Ty sraw |
s B oot o Ty =fTeara
v/, 0T caTuIlTa CaTS, (MEY!, CEWAl, UIA-30u3 | 97 Larecic s N Q

wﬁm-a(so)aoq/am-as/ml:/aooe/mﬁ'-a/ao{o 9(95 ! ;) wifa: ;Ma/aoaa &

W™ g WA @ gareay FETEE W ([EPTE

3-q,  #fireawrg, 20T WA, /53R Eweem /o /i e, mr/vrmfe . (EEAng /4% wTerwaD, 0

v. wurofs, fafsanta, faferanla awras, ardt m-q/qq, 32 %5 ), C1F2-3q, Taal, U1a1-3320 |

>. FITT WG, ar0w 35 aRwaEn, wal (whse), ol (Bfafrs wunfy as afearade it
WIATHTE 27T T WAy A &) |

So-3b. TH/izerd eSemra feRfirere, e, vrer/ wvwd 2eeEs, e SEfree, 53w/ ¢ 2hnws, e/
Taa Brers, Seremdl/oTareted wEsd, R, seIRTRae /Ry, BFres) s wesE, (oph,

PG |
3, 9] sfvewra, IE0W IS SfEa, vt (v, vret (SR sravtes stiw waefea ) |

1‘,\”‘7/7” S [Nmmlb}) t_qs

DA A ) B =
V" #% s\
CJ“:‘ w"""';c—-"-""""‘ é t [/
% _\"
= 1‘5 -‘ o ﬂ" \



/] -0 //
SIelSETOR} FRFATTH AP
JTOW IS FAAT , 5T (M)
©8Y/S, GIaA JIIBT, BT |
www.cbe.pgov.bd

Y -0 (50)30/ITA-T5/MRs e /*M-00/2058/ D O A b wifrl: 20/33/2038 s

o3 ofebTEINGBIM 3 ol B st g
T b/, SO CRTIGTA CAIS, CAZH, (ORI, TTI-30b) |

o1 IS ARG R @ Ty 3 o /AT AE(HE /e , TIfAdl: 23/d0/3vve s |
09| X-fF e wfiy H 000305084-0904, TIffd: 03/04/2055 cHY

o8| efSBITA IS MG R ooy Afe Thiw 7M-d¢ @ 0 CIOIF &M &S] MG AfEGBITT 4
CATS YL FIBIATILZA T @ GEBT (PTG IS AIRGICH TROATer+{4a e Sred w1 2om:

SL | Commercial name Name of the Raw Materials according to the
No. of the Raw BCT 2024-2025 H.S. Code No.
Materials

Carlons, boxes, cases, bags and other packing containers, of
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