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SL - DESCRIPTION OF GOODS Description of Goods According to Bangladesh HS CODE Annual Import
NO. Customs Tariff 2022-2023 Availability
Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat shapes, of plastics,
whether or not in rolls.
01 STICKER PLASTIC - Other 3919.90.99
Other plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of plastics, non-
cellular and not reinforced, laminated, supported or
similarly combined with other materials.
02 HEAT TRANSFER TAPE/LABEL - Other 3920.10.90
Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat shapes, of plastics,
whether or not in rolls.
03 SEAM SEALING TAPE — Self adhesive tape in rolls exceeding 20cm imported by 3919.90.10
industrial IRC holder
VAT compliant manufacturers
Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading Nos. 39.01 to
39.14.
04 PLASTIC BUCKLE | — Other 3926.20.90
Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of plastics; stoppers, lids, caps
and other closures, of plastics.
05 PLASTIC STOPPER/PLASTIC - Stoppers, lids, caps and other closures 3923.50.00
GRIP/LIDS/CAPS/ PEARL
Woven fabrics of artificial staple fibres.
07 48% LENZINGTM LEYOCELL, 39% --Dyed 5516.22.00
MODACRYLIC, 12% ARAMID, 1%
ANTI-STATIC, 220 GSM, WIDTH:
60.5” Requirement
Other woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres. AsPer UD &
08 65% MODACRYLIC, 33% COTTON, - Other 5515.29.00 Export L/C
2% ANTI-STATIC, 2/1 TWILL
24s/2*24s/2, 270 GM/M2,WIDTH:57/58,
Twine, cordage, ropes and cables, whether or not plaited or braided and whether or
not impregnated, coated, covered or sheathed with rubber or plastics.
09 DRAWSTING/DRAW CORD [ - Other 5607.90.00
Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow fabrics
consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs).
10 TWILL TAPE/WOVEN -- Of coton 5806.31.00
TAPE/WEAVING TAPE
Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07;
narrow fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled
by means of an adhesive (bolducs).
11 ELASTIC, ELASTIC BINDER - Other woven fabrics, containing by weight 5% or more of 5806.20.00
elastomeric yam or
rubber thread
Other made up clothing accessories, knitted or crocheted; knitted or crocheted
parts of garments or of clothing accessories.
12 PRINTED PANEL - Other
6117.80.90
- Parts 6117.90.00
Other made up clothing accessories; parts of garments or of clothing accessories,
other than those of heading 62.12.
| -Parts 6217.90.00
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Slide fasteners and parts thereof.
Bidl ZIPPER, PULLER — Fitte d with chain scoops of base metal 9607.11.00
- Parts 9607.20.00 Requirement
Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button As ger UD&
moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks. Export L/C
15 SNAP, MOULD, BUTTON - Pres s-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs and 9606.10.00
parts therefor
- Button moulds and other parts of buttons; button blanks: |  9606.30.00
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-- Cast, moulded, stamped or forged, but not further worked
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i 01 | PLASTICS ID CARD HOLDER / Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of plastics, stopper, 3923.10.00
i COVER/ PLASTICS STOPPER lids, caps and other closures, of plastics.
- Boxes, Cases, Crates and similar articles
- Sacks and Bags (Including cones) _
02 | PLASTICS ID CARD HOLDER / --- Others 3923.29.90
COVER/ TWILL TAPE WITH
PLASTICS
03 | PLASTICS ID CARD HOLDER / Other plates, sheet, film, foil and strip, of plastics 3921.14.00
COVER -~ Of regenerated cellulose of other plastics ,
04 | HIT TRANSFER TAPE/LABEL Others Plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of plastics, non-cellular 3920.10.20
and not reinforced, laminated, supported or similar combined with
other materials.
--- Imported by Industrial IRC Holder VAT compliant personal
hygiene products Manufacturing Industries
05 | HIT TRANSFER TAPE/LABEL Others Plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of plastics, non-cellular 3920.92.90
and not reinforced, laminated, supported or similar combined with
other materials A Wetota
8 38y
N --- Others o o ST
. 06 | D-RING, O-RING Other article of plastic and acrylic of other material of heading nos. 3926.20.90 TSI |
39.01to39.14
--- Others
07 | D-RING, O-RING Other article of Vulcanised rubber other than hard rubber 4016.95.00
-- Other inflatable articles
08 | D-RING, O-RING Other articles of vulcanized rubber other than hard rubber 4016.99.90
— e - ,,_-- Others - — O —
09 | D-RING, O-RING Other made up clothing accessories; parts of garments or of 6217.10.00
SILICON TAPE/LABEL /PLUG clothing accessories, other than those of heading 62.12
(Accessories)
I ) - Accessories
10 | D-RING, O-RING Other article of Iron or Steel 7326.90.90
S I .z~ Others
11 | RUBBER LABEL Rubberised textile fabrics, other than those of heading 59.02. 5906.99.90
--- Others
12 | RUBBER LABEL Other article of vulcanized rubber other than hard rubber 4016.10.00
U 7 Other : B
13 | RUBBER LABEL Compounded rubber, unvulcanised, in primary forms or in plate, 4005.99.00
sheets or strip.
. -- Other
14 | MOULD Other article of copper 7419.91.00
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15 | MOULD Moulding Boxes for metal foundry; mould bases; moulding pattern; 8480.20.00
moulds for metal (other than ingot moulds), metal carbides, glass,
mineral materials, rubber or plastics
o o - Mould bases »
16 | SECURITI ALARM/TAG/LABEL Disco, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, smart card 8523.59.10
and other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena
whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the
production of discs but executing products of chapter 37.
| _--- Proximity cards and tags
17 | FSECURI}I_RII_\hM/TAG/LABEL Disco, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devnces smart card 8523.59.20
and other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena
whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the
production of discs but executing products of chapter 37.
~-- RFID TAG imported by industrial IRC holder VAT compliant 100%
W _export oriented textile industry
18 | BELT KINTTED Other made up clothing accessories; parts of garments or of 6217.10.00
clothing accessories, other than those of heading 62.12
) o - Accessories o
: 19 | INTERLININGS Textile fabrics, impregnated, coated, covered or laminated with 5903.90.90
plastics, others than those of heading 59.02.
--- Others
20 | SEWING THREAD Cotton, carded or combed cotton sewing thread, whether or not 5204.11.00
put up for retail sale
B -- Containing 85% or more by weight of cotton
21 | SEWING THREAD Cotton, carded or combed cotton sewing thread whether or not 5204.19.00
put up for retail sale
N ~_-- Others TR Wiy
22 | SEWING THREAD Artificial Filament yarn (other than sewing thread) not put up for 5403.39.00 @ 38fen
retail sale, including artificial monofilament of less than 67 decitex wifEmt
-- Others TSR |
23 | SEWING THREAD Artificial Filament yarn (other than sewing thread) not put up for 5403.49.00
retail sale, including artificial monofilament of less than 67 decitex
v e -~ Others 7
24 " SEWING THREAD Sewing Thread of man-made staple fibres, whether or not put up 5508.10.00
for retail sale
) . : - of synthetic staple fibres o
25 SEWING THREAD Artificial staple fibres, carded, combed or otherwise processed for 5507.00.00
, , spinning
26 . SEWING THREAD Synthatic filament yarn (other than sewing thread), not put up for 5402.61.00
retail sale, including synthetic monofilament of less than 67
decitex.
27 | SEWING THREAD Synthatic filament yarn (other than sewing thread), not put up for 5402.62.00
retail sale, including synthetic monofilament of less than 67
decitex.
28 | SEWING THREAD Synthatic filament yarn (other than sewing thread), not put up for 5402.51.00
retail sale, including synthetic monofilament of less than 67
decitex.
| 29 | SEWING THREAD Synthatic filament yarn (other than sewing thread), not put up for 5402.52.00
‘ retail sale, including synthetic monofilament of less than 67
| decitex.
30 | SEWING NEEDLE 7 Sewing needles, knitting needle, bodkin;, crochet hooks, 7319.90.00
.
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embroidery stilettos and similar article, for use in the hand, of iron
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31 | GUM TAPE self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, stripe and other flat 3919.90.20
shapes, of plastics, whether or not in roll
I --- Performance Tape/Closure/Side Tape 7“%‘ e
32 | VELCRO Other article of plastics and article of other materials of heading 3926.20.90 \gm'
Nos 39.01 to 39.14 TSTET |
N O M Others B
33 | HAN/PRICE TAG, BARCODE, Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not printed 4821.90.90
PRICE TICKET / LABEL | --Others
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i 1 All Kinds of Woven Fabrics 5208.11.00-5208.59.005209. 11 00— 5209.59.00,
| 5210 11.00-5210 69.30, 521 1.11 00-5211.58.00, WA ww g
; 5212,1100-5212 25 00, 5209 11 00-5308 26.00, | eore oAl
j 540710.10-5407. 94.005408.13 00-5408 34 00, RIS
; 5512 11.10-5512.98.50, 5513.11.00-5513 49 0O,
5514.11.00-5514.49.305801.10.06-5801.90.00
2. | AllKinds af Kni< Fabrics 6001.10.0(%acs 6001 59 00. 600290.00,
6003 20 00 2378 4003 90 00, 6004, 10.00 WETS
6014.90.00. 6006.24 00 €8T 6006.50.00
..... i i
_Accessories - ] : - B - I
3. | Label @Il Kinds) 75807 1000-58079000 T eifr wavz e
4. inteding 5603 10.10-5803 90 00 S R
5..._| Button {me 9506 _1000—9606.30.00_ '
6 Sewing Thread(AIl sorts) 5401 10.00, 5204.11.30.5508. 10.005508 20 00, e
o o 5401.20.0C
.. TissuePaper 4803 .00 .0C o
8 ' PVCTape 3921.19.00, 3926.90.72 ] |
F 8 j__l__mrass Pin/S: wor Hand Pin | 7318.20.00, 72i6.80.00 L
l 10 j Color Ban/Calor Insert 3926.20.90 o
1 11, | Poly Bag/Blester Bag 38232890, 3923.21.00
' 12 Gurr Tape‘Scose 3819.10.00, 3819.90.00
| Tape/Taslin tap
13| Paper Band 4821.10.00, 4821.80.00
14 iron Sealitetal Clip 8308.90.00
15 P.P Band " 3919.10.00 -
16, Pading 5811.00.60 |
' 171 Zpper 9607 11 00-8607.20.00 ]
18. ' Elastic/Elastic Binder 4015.90.00 j
19, | Hanger 3926.20.90, 3926.90.99 o
20 Velcro Tape 3619.90.00
21. Plastic Stoper, Metal Stoper 3923.21.00,8309.8020 |
22, | Orawsting/dracard/Twik Tape 6217.10.00 4 i
23 | Belt (lathen; . 4273.30.00- - |
P 24 Price Tickel 4821.90.00 ;
1 .| Pin (Tap) 1 7319.30.00 )
2.& Metal Seal 8339.90.20
| 27| BackBoard 48239099 ]
2. "Metal Clip/metal Chain - 7326.18.00 |
29, | z,a_c; ) 5804.29.00, 5804.30.00 s
30! Canton o _4819.10.00, 4818.20.00
3 THooks : 8308.10.00
2 | Hangtag/Price 4821.10.00. 4821.90.00, 5807.90.90
Tag/Priceticket/Hangtag, |
Stiker/Barcode ; _ - S—
733, Colter&CafRb 6001.10.0%p02.90.00 -
! 34. . Addhave Tap/TansilTap | N 4807.£0.00..3919.10.00. . -
35.  Eyelets “8308.10.00
36. ' beck Te 6215 20.00
. 37. _LeatherPach %9%;29%0 .
38 Rivels 4d
39 | Buckle 8308.90.00
40.  Stons/Sequance 2513.20.00, 25131000 ]
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