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Discs,Tapes,solid-statenon-volatilestoragedevics,..
of sound or of other phenomena, whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the

of disclo but excluding products of chanter 37.

RFID TAG imported by Industrial IRC holder VAT
compliant 100% export-oriented textile industry

l" {?'



r

771brar- ou //
$EM6 <RqI6q-IT{SIT

sr6qqre<:ffi, EFFI (qfr'l) ElsI I

e8t/), cc$ry{ftot,ursl t

sFr q(- a()e)ev rerc rsm*/ba/"ttil-o>/qo oa t fi \ro

o). eBbrq<{FI

ot.
S-$FI

asaQ6qq1\evtR=l

o8.

rqq6rfir{{(<l("rtcE f)ft
q(cqF'fiv, qHrdqv, fifr{otq, qF[w$tq, <lsEtl-GE t t

sqefsFT-qcfuffi'/bb, slG{-)b/o8l>bbb & r

ooog j199b-o9oc, qft'tt-,9)/)o/qo)b & r

srA+a)atlpelqots E' r

o

o

o

o
ot-Rq x rg stRlto9. c.-11'l q\ v vllxl

o 8 . <s eRccmd fr6T "Ie|* <ffiq e;fuo q<- )c s \o mrcrrrp qe$Trd( {qr tsfos' <i-{qff :ftffim ro:q* ql{ s

,atu.,aq.rdv <o 4A?qrE q\rqlifi{t{T Frq Erflrr FdI qfiI 8

M

ffiIl{sfrfft q{u.qq.ros
6:i\ (tL

ACCESSORIES: .

n+lra? inorornic acids and other lnorganrc o XYPGI Uuupvurst vr "-" ----_--
-Silicone dioxide
-Other

2811.22.00
I Silica Gel 

I

,tnei n"t shapes, of plastics' whether or not ln
Self-adhesi
rnllc

ve platesn sheets film' lbil' tape' rnP

All Kinds of TaPe I -Self Adhesive tape in rolls exceeding 20cm-imported by

inauttti"t IRC hoider VAT compliant manufacturers
3919.90.10

2

Other plal
sunnorted

*,sh*t' frt., foil and striP, of P lastics, non-cellular 8no not reruuruEut

or similarly combj4eq with oilgl

I rn6"r,"iJ* lAT complaint plastic products manufacturing 3920.63.10
J PVCA{on Printed

3920.99.90
| -Other

4 Seem TaPe
ffiand other closures, of

ffito. the conveYance or Packing or ,ooosr or

mers of ethylene
r^r- ^r Loozrin-,s^" tq,oi-]Ildff-

3923.21.00
5 Polyethilene sheet,/ Foam Sheet- ,- I -ur pot:

rlther rrficles of olastics.and anlctes or lEl ualsl rorr vr uL-!'-D ' --- -

| -OfRce or school suPphes

I -eni"[t 
"r "pparet 

ana clothing accessories (including

I sloves. mittens andmiG
3926,10.00

6 Hanger

3926.30.00
fittings for fumiture, qgqchwork or the tike

7 Hanger 3926.40.00
8 lIe Stafuettes anq otnEr

3926.90.99
9 Shinetuock stnng I -'--- -

::Vulca
10

i-od rrrtrher thread and cord 4007.00.00
Cord I Vulcanized rubber thread and coro

-hrarnrrrrrrr€N 

[SErr
aw furskins (including heads' tails' pawl allo ollltsr PrErst

other than raw hides and skins or 4301.10.00
ll I -(JI mInK, WllUlE, wrrrr vr vtrt.vEv "'*-' ---- - r

t_

-iifi^ iat filr qnd erticles thereot. 4304.00.00
Fur It2

Other articles of wood. 4421.10.00
C- T- Wooden Hanger I -ctoTe? 
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ffiin"r;td"ge' ropes and cables' w-h€ther or,n9:-p-rarrtu

coated. covered or sheathed wim ru lrlastrlt. 5607.90.00
l4 Draw cord/Draw string -- | ffihrins! lqne in the Dlece. ltr

Tu[es and other net fabrics' not incluorng yovcIrt

strios or in motifs than hnrics or neao't 5804.30.00
l5 Lace ffi nnnsisfino of warn without

Nr"tot woven fabrics, others than gooo

weff assembled by means of an adhesive
o Il€aur[E,
Di

I .iUUo, manufacturing industrY
5806.32.10

16 Tape
5806.39.00

-of other textile materials
t7 Tape {EIq(- ob ///EflI{
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cFls
Labels, badges and similar articles of textile materials, in-the piece, in strip or cut to shapes or size, not
embroidered.

t8 All Kinds of Label -Woven (Printed) s807.10.00
Articles of natural or cultured pearls, precious or semi-precious stones (natural, synthetic or
reconsfrrrcfed)-

19 Pearl -Of natural or cultured oearls 7116.10.00
Nails, tacks, drawing pins, corrugated nails, staples (other than those of heading 83.05) and similar
articles, of Iron or steel, whether or not with heads of other materials, but excluding such articles with
heads ofcoooer

20 Super Tack
-Nails, tacks, drawing pins, comrgated nails, staples (other than those of
heading 83.05) and similar articles, of Iron or steel, whether or not with
heads of other materials. but excluding such articles with heads of copper

7317.00.00

Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets, and the like, of base metal, of a
kind used for clothing or clothing accessories, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for
other made un articles: tubular or bifurcated rivets and soansles. of base metal.

21 Buckle -other, including parts 8308.90.00
Discs, Tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devics, "smart cards" and other media for the recording
of sound or of other phenomena, whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the
oroduction of discs. but excludins oroducts of chanter 37.

22 RFID - Proximity Cards and taes 8s23.59.10
Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells, sirens, indicator panels, burglar or

fire alarms). other than those of headine 85.12 or 85.30

23 Suoer tas -parts 9606.22.00
Slide fasteners and oarts thereof -Slide fasteners.

24 Zipper -Fitted with chain scoops of base metal 9607.11.00
25 Zipper -Other 9607.r9.00

FABRICS:
Artificial Monofilamnefi of 67 decitex or more and of which no cross-sectional dimension exceeds 1

mm; strip and the like (for example, artilicial straw) of artificial textile metarials of an apparent width
not exceedins 5 mm.

I Printed oven fabric
-Printed
-Other woven fabrics, containing 85% or more by weight of polyester
filaments.

5407.54.00

Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing less than 85% by weight of such fibres, mixed
mainlv or solelv with cotton. of a weicht exceedins l70ulm2

2 Bleached -Of polyester staple fibres, plain weave. 5514.11.00

Glimped yarn, and strip and the like of heading 54.04 or 54.05, gimped (other than) those of heading
56.05 and glimped horsehair yarn); chenille yarn (including flock chenille yarn); loop wale-yarn.

5208.33.00

-1 Taffeta
- Glimped yam, and strip and the like of heading 54.04 or 54.05, gimped
(other than) those of heading 56.05 and glimpedhorsehair yam); chenille
varn (includins flock chenille varn): loop wale-varn.

5606.00.00

Textile fabrics impregnated, coatedo covered or laminated with plastics, other than those of heading
s9.02

4 Textile Fabrics -other s903.20.90
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a which not exeeeding 30 cm, other than those of heading 60.01 or
60.02

5 Linine Fabric -Other t 6003.90.00
YARN:

Silk yarn (other than yarn spun from silk waste) not put for retail sale.

I Millanj - Silk yarn (other than yam spun from silk waste) not put for retail sale.
5004.00.00

Artificial Monolilamnent of 67 decitex or more and of which no cross-sectional dimension exceeds I
mm; strip and the like (for example, artificial straw) of artificial textile metariats of an apparent width
not exceeding 5 mm.

2
Cotton

- Artificial Monofilamnent of 67 decitex or more and of which no cross-
sectional dimension exceeds I mm; strip and the like (for example, artificial
straw) of artificial textile metarials of an apparent width not exceeding 5

mm.

540s.00.00
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EF: i\ TTDFIITqT{FTqTFTIl.t (BCT loll-to\?) GfislriFpdurqlrr{r{rq e ft6EI s{D.qrf. trFlv'
Synthetic filament tow.

J Acrylic Polyester Yam -Of polyester 5501.20.00
Synthetic staple fibres, not carded, combed or otherwise processed for spinninq.

4
Acrylic Polyester Wool Nylon

Yarn
-Of polyester 5s03.20.00

Artilicial staple fibres. carded. combed or otherwise Drocessed for spinnins.

5 Viscose Rayon Yam - Of viscose rayon
5s04.10.00

Synthetic staple libres, carded, combed or otherwise processed for spinninq.

6
Acrylic-Marino wool Yam

-Of nylon or polyamides 5506.10.00

Yarn (other than sewins thread) ofartificial staole fibres. not out uo for retail sale.

7 Viscose Nvlon Polyester Yam - Other 5510.30.90
Metalised yarn, whether or not gimped, being textile yarn, or strip or the like of heading 54.04 or
54.05, combined with metal in the form of thread, strip or powder or covered with metal

8
Lurex

- Metalized round yarn. 5605.00.10
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Yearly Import
Entitlement

Unconrbecl ( ablecl L-otton Yanr, Witlr>=85"h Clotton. Nprs. >80rnn Per Sinsle yarn s205.35.00
5205.4 t "00

Requirement of
Export LC & UD.

8t Clonrbed C'abled c--otton Yarn, with >:85o/o Cotton, Nprs, <:l4mn per Sinele yarii
8e Contbed C a b I ed Cotton Yarrr, W i th>:8 5ToCotton.Nprs.> I 4ntn B ut<=4 3 nrn

P.Sing.Yarn _
5205.42.00

88 clombed cabled cqtton Yarn, with >=857o cotton, Nprs, >l20mn Per Single Vain 5205.48.00
8C Ljncombed Singlc Cotton Yarn. With <85% Cotton, Nprs. <=l4rnn 5206.I 1.00
8g Uncornbed Single Cotton Yarn, With <85o/o Clotton, Nprs, >43mn But <:52nin 5206. r 3.00
8q Uncombed Single Cotton yant, With <85o/o Cotton, Nprs, >52mn But <=80mn s206.14.00
8b Uncombed Single Clotton Yarn, With <85o/o Cotton, Nprs, >80mn 5206. 15.00
8b Combed Single Cotton Yarn, With <85% Cotton, Nprs, <=l4nrn 5206.21.00
Co Combed Single C'otton Yarn. With <85o/o Cotton, Nprs, >43mn But <=52nrn 5206,23.00
c) Corrrbed Single C'otton Yarn, With <85oh Cotton. Nprs. >80nrrr 5206.25.00
(t LJnconrbed Cablc'd Cotton Yarn, With <85oh Cotton. Nprs. <=l4ntrr 5206.3 r .00
c9 Uncombed Cabled Cot]g! lg!L591%99!on,Nprs,>43rnn Bur<=52mn Pr Single yarn s206 33 00
c8 Uncombed cabled cotton Yarn.<850/o Cotton,Nprs.>52mn But<=80rnn P.Single yanr 5206.34.00
cc Uncorrbed (labled Cotton Yam. With <85% Cotron, Nprs. >80mn Per Sinsle yarn s206.35.00
cg Combed Cabled Cotton Yanr. with <85o Cotton, Nprs. <=l4mn Per Single yarn 5206.41.00
cq combed cabled cotton Yanr.<857o cotton,Nprs.>43rnn But<:52nrn Per Single

Yarn
5206.43.00

CE Combed Cabled Cotton Yarn.<857o s206.44.00
cb Combed Cabled Cotton Yarn, With <85o/o Cotton, Nprs, >80mn per Sineie yarn 5206.45.00
9o ACRYLIC OR MODACRYLIC,NES s50r.30.90
g) Synt.ltaple Fibres,of Nylon or other Polyamides,carded,combed or processecl ss06. r0.00
va Synthetic Staple I--ibres, Of Polyesters, Carded, Cornbed Or Processecl 5506.20.00
Ve Acrylic or l\4odacrylic Synthetic Staple Fibres.Clarded,combed or processeci ss06.30.00
v8 Carded Wool 5 105. 10.00
va Cotton, Cardcd Or Conrbed 5203.00.00
gg Single Yarn, With >:91ohAftificial Staple Fibres, Nprs 55 r0.l 1.00

uq Yarn, Artificial Staple Fibres. Nes, Nprs (Exl. Wool/Cotton) I 5s 10.90.00
(.r) F brics :

Requirement of
Export LC & UD..

Woven Fabrics, >=85uh Synthetic Fibres, Nes 55 2.99.00
Dyed Woven Fabrics, <85oh Synthetic Fibres + ('ottolt. Nes. =<lj\pJM2 55 3.29.00
Other woven f'abrics 55 1. r9.00

8 Mixed mainly or solely with viscose rayolt staple fibres 55 5. r 1.00
c Woven labrics o1'synthetic staple fibres, nes 55 5.99.00

Unbleached or bleached woven fabrics, >=85'/o artificial staple fibres 55 6. r r.00
c Cotton Wadding And Articles Thereof 5601 .21 .00
b Dyed Woven Fabrics Of Synthetic Filament Yarn, >:85% Nylon.. 5407.42.00
b woven Fabrics of High renacity Synthetic Filament Yarn, of viscose Rayon s408.10.00
)o Dyed Woven Fabrics Of Artificial Filament Yarn. Nes 5408.32.00
)) Printed Woven Fabrics. Containing <85% Silk 5007.90.00

)a. Urrbleaclrecl l'lain Cotton Woven Fabrics With >=85% Cotton, >=200glMZ 5209. r r .00
)e Denirn, With >=857o Clotton. >=20091M2 5209.42.00
)8 Coloured Woven ('otton Fabrics, Nes, W th <85% Cotton, :<20091M2 52t0.49.00
)c Coloured Plain Cotton Woven Fabrics W th <85% Cotton, >200e/M2 521 1.41.00
)g Coloured Woven Fabrics Of Cotton, >200glM2, Nes 52t2.24.00
)c Dyed Woven Fatrrics. <85o/o Synthetic Filaments, Mixed With Cotton 5407.82.00
)b Pririted Woven Fabrics, <85u/, Synthetic Filaments, Mixed With Cotton 5407.84.00
)b woven Fabrics Of Metal rhread And woven Fabrics of Metallizeo yanr- r.les s809.00.00
lo OTH.KNITI'ED OR CROCHETED FABRICS OF COTTON DYED 6006.22.00
l) woven Fbrcs.with>=85o/u carded wool or of Fine Animal Hair. =<300g/M2

Weight
5 u t.l l.00

ta. other woven Fabrics of carded wool or carded Fine Anirnal Hair, Nes 5 r r r.90.00
woven Fabrics with>:85%combed wooliof Fine Animal Hair,:<200glM2 weight 5l 12.l 1.00

t8 Unbleached Plain Cottorr Woven Fabrics With <85% Cotton, >200g/M2 s211.11.00
tc Bleached Woven Cotton Fabrics, Nes, With >:85oh Cotton s208.29.00
t\9 Unbleached Woven Cotton Fabrics, Nes, With >:85o/o Cotton s208. t 9.00
tq Unbleached Woven Cotton Fabrics, Nes, With <lsohCotton, >200gl[z 521 L 19.00
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Cotton Seu'ing Thread, With >:85% Cotton I szo+. r r.oo
Cotton Sewing l'hread, With <85% Cotton. s204.19.00
Plastic Reflective Tape. s906. r 0.00

8 Plastic Side'fape 39t9.90.20
c Snap Buttorr 9606.29.00

Hook & Eyelets 01'lron or steel 8308.10.00
1 Rivets Of Iron or steel 8308.20.00
E Photo in lavlBarcode 4821.90.00
b Sequence/pompom 6 r r 1.90.00
)o Buttons Of Iron or steel 9606.22.00
)) Woven Labels. 5807. r 0.00
)t Plastics Buttons, 9606.2 r.00
\9 Caftons Of CorrLrgated Paper. 4819. r 0.00
)8 Inner Cartons Of Non-Corrue,ated Paper. 4819.20.00
)a' Plastic Sizer 3926.90.99
)v Back Board 48 r 0.13.00
)1 Neck Board 48 r0.92.00
)E Drawesting 5902.10.00
)b Hanger 3916. 10.00
{o Sewing Thread Of Synthetic Staple Fibres ss08.10.00
\) Sewins Thread Of Artificial Staple Fibres 5508.20.00
tt Draw cord s604. 10.00

Felt packing/Tape Shoulder, Twill, Velco 62t7.10.00
t8 Button moulds 9606.30.00
tc' Woven logo Labels 5807.90.00
tv Lace of 'l'extile nrechanically made 5804.29.00
t1 Elastic/Rubber band of apparel clothine accessories 4015.90.00
a.b With PVC firsins interlining of textile s903.10.r0
tb Poly bag (0. lmm) of polypropylene 6305.33.00
9o Ribbon. s806.20.00
s) Garrnents l'agl Se'curity Tae 8531 . 10.00
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MwCapital
Machinery For l00oZ Exoort Qriented
Sweaters Industries Double System
Cornputerized Flat Knitting Machine With
Recommenda_ble Spare and standard

Aece$p!p!
Model: SSRll2 7 Gauge (LL Hook
needle)

Variation SV

SHIMATRONIC Design Systerrr

Model: SDS-ONE APEX3-3

50 Sets

0l Set
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