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c( -ttunrq*qRmoml 5515.1 1 .00

1 Woven Fabrics Mixed mainly or sqlely. y-v-l+ vr::""::r=t'--'r--=--
5s15.12.00

z Woven Fabrics Mt""d T?t*y "=' i",qv- i:'I#'fl -i5i ;'Ci;" :; ; I ; ;; 5515.19.00
J Woven Fabrics ()thers WOven laottus ul rJttr"""" "'*r^- "-'--

fibres' - Of acrylic

or modacrylic staPle fibre3
, .l-^r-.r-. ^- -^t^t.,.',irh mqn-mAde filamentS

s515.21.00
4

Woven Fabrics

-- lvllxli(l lrr4uuJ vr "ovrv'J ' ' ^l':- -::-- . ' - - --"

5515.29.00
5

Woven Fabrics Others Woven tabncs or synmetlu sraPrs rrurw

W";; iabrics of acrylic or modacrylic staple fibres'

5516.12.00
6

Woven Fabrics Woven fabrics of arurlcril srapre uurEs'

iortuit i"g 857o or more by *"igttt of artificial staple

:.^^ o<o./^

5516.14.00
7

Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of artlrlclal sraple lortrs' - \2utr!@uu'5

or more by weight of artificial staple fibres

.-Printed : :
5516.22.00

8

Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of artittctal staple rlDres' -\-ontiuu'ts rsDr

,# i;% bt weight of artificial staple fibres' mixed mainly

or solely with man-made filaments'

5516.24.00
9 Woven Fabrics Pflnted woven raorlus+

s516.32.00
t0 Woven Fabrics 5516.34.00
ll Woven Fabrics

fabrics' of other

than narrow fabrics of
^+L^-o T,,*ad tevfile fahrics

5802.10.00

12

Woven Fabrics

2a^A 5804.10.00

l3

Net Fabrics/mesh
fabric

Tulles and other net tabrlcs, nor lnclusrrrB wur

".o"ft"i"AfuUrics; 
lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs'

other than fabrics of headings
T,,II-. onzl nfher nef fahrics

s810.91.00

t4
Woven fabrics
- Other embroidery

Embroidery in the ptece, m srlp5 or m rrrut

- Other embroidery
Af nnffnn

5810.92.00

15

Woven fabrics
- Other embroidery

Embroidery in the piece' ln strlps or ln morus

- Other embroidery-
nf *^i *o,lo {il+ac

5902.20.00

l6
Tyre cord fabric- Of
polyesters

Tyre cord fabric of htgh tenaclty yarn or nyturr

polyamides, polyesters or viscose rayon'

- Of polyesters _=-----.-

// ffilFr eilst: oY //
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5903.20.90

t7

Woren Fabdcs/
coated/ laminated
fabrics

Textile fabncs,lmpregnateq'Goattu' -uvYErr
f".in"t"O *ith plistii,others than of heading 59'02'

*iirt poirt"thane -Fusing interlining ,materials for

stiffening cuffs at collars)

s903..90.90
Woven
Ealrri cc/nnaf ed fahdcs-.

Textile fabrics,impregnateo,coareo, sovtirt;..r ur

,,,i+h nlocric nthers than ofleading-*utithlOlufethsne-

t8
59;;:Sid; tape (lock loop) imported by Industrial IRC

n"ia"t VAT compiiant hygienic products manufacturing

industry )

6001.10.00

l9
"Long pile" fabrics Pile fabrics, including "long plle" raDncs ano tsny r'aurrvD'

knitted or crocheted
rrl aan -ilatr fqhricq

6001.92.00

20
Knit fabric Pile fabrics, including "long plle" raDrrcs ano tcrry raurrvJ'

knitted or crocheted-
^r *^- *o,{o #ihrac

6004.10.00

2l

Knitted Fabric Knitted or crocheted tabncs ot a wlotn exceecrulg JU uru'

containing by weight 5olo or more of elastomeric yam or

rubber thread, other those of heading 60'01

- Containing by weight 5%o or more of elastomeric yam but

-^1 ^nnfqinino nrhher thread
6004.90.00

22

Knitted Fabric Knitted or crocheted thbrtcs ot a wrom exceeolng ru ullr'

containing by weight 57o or more of elastomeric yam or

rubber thread, other those of heading 60'01

- Other

Knitted Fabric
23

ongalloon knitting

macirines;, other than of headings 60'01 to 60'04 -Of cotton

-Dved

6005.22.00

24
Knitted Fabric ii on-galloon knitting

macirinesl, other than of headings 60.01 to 60'04 -Of cotton

-orinted

6005.24.00

25

Knitted Fabric
ins l ooos'rs'oo

macilines), other than of headings 60'01 to 60'04 
I

-Ofsyntheticfibres I ,,,=====

26

Knitted Fabric @ those made on galloon knitting

machinesl, other than of headings 60.01 to 60'04

-Of synthetic fibres
-others dyed

6005.37.00

27
Knitted Fabric Othe. knitteA or crocheted fabrics-of cotton

-dved

6006.22.00

28
Knitted Fabric Ottrer tnittea or crocheted fabrics --of cotton

-Printed I 

-

6006.24.00

29
Knitted Fabric @ricd -of synthetic fibres

-dved

6006.32.00

30
Knitted Fabric Ottrer t nitt"A.r c.ocheted fabrics -of synthetic fibres

-orinted

6006.34.00

-^^cArrr6G.

31

Silica gel Oth;r Inotga"f a"rttand others inorganic oxygen

compounds of non-metals
-nfhar

2811.29.10
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3919.90.99@ foil, tape,strip and other

flat shapes, of plastics, whether or not in rollsScotch TaPe/Gum
Tape/TapeA'{Ylon/Pol
y/Self-adhesive TaPe/

Velcro/ Velcro TaPe-

(Hook &

Articles fo. the conteyilc-e o-acking of goods' of plastics;

stoDDers. lids, caps and o

Articles for the 
"orr't "ya.ce 

ot pucking of goods' of plastics;

stoppers, lids, caps and other closures, ofplastics'

-others

String, Plastic
Washer/ Size CliP
/Butter flY/ Tag
Pin/SafetY Pins/

ries, of leather or of

oomposition leather.
- Other clothing accessories

Leather Patch, Jakron

Label lLather LabeV

Patch LabeVPu Patch

4821.10.00@ek of all kinds, whether or not

printed.

- Ptirt"d (Price Tag, Sticker, Hang Tag)

Satin Lable,/ Price
Tickert/Hang Tag

/StickerAVast tagl
Joker taglPricetagl
Paper Tagl Adhesive
paperlHologtam
Sticker, sewing tag,

barcode tagl barcode
sticker, paPer Sticker,
Back board/ Carton
Sticker, Sticker/tag

@les, whether or not Plaited or

braided and whether or not impregnated, coated, covered or

sheathed with rubber or plastics. - Of sisal or other textile

fibres of the aenus Agave - Other

@d cables, whether or notPlaited or

braided ana wne*rir or not impregnated, coated, covered or

sheathed with rubber or Plastics.

@ Hke of heading 54.04 or 54.05,

twine, cordage, rope or cables, not elsewhere specified or

s804.21.00

crocheted fabrics; lace in the pieffi, in strips or in motifs,

other than fabrics of headings 60.02 to 60.06-- Of man-made

ffirics, not including woven, knitted or

Na*ow *oven faUrics, other than goods of heading 58'07;

naxrow fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled

by means of an adhesive (bolducs). Woven pile fabrics

(including terry towelling and similar terry fabrics) and

Twill TapeAVoven
Tape/Rubber Thread

ffiing by weight 57o or more of
elastomeric yarn or rubber thread

ll!Er;t<+t11

7 mn'flst: )o //Ghe
D'

ffi



heading 58'07; narrow

iuU.i", consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an

adhesive (bolducs). - Other woven fabrics

Ribbon Tape/ twill
tape/ Woven TaPe/

pipingA/elcro TaPe/

5810.91EmEroiaffi;Glcce, in strips or in motifs

7317.00.00@ nails, staples (other than

iior"'oir,"uaing s3.:0b and simiiar articles, of iron or steel'

."i"tfro or not ftth heads of other material, but excluding such

8308.90.00kle-clasPs' hooks' eYes'

"yei":Lt 
una tlre like, of base metal, o-f a kind used Tt,"'"T'-'q :t

;iltii.g accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches' books'

a*iffi, t"attrer goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other made

,p rttiZiit; i"uulir or biturcated rivets, of base metal; beads and

spangles, of base metal.

Other, including Parts

nadg€/Metal TiPPing /
Ending/d-ring/o'ring
key-ring /iron seaU iron
stick /metal eYleV metal

seaUbuckle metal/ metal
ending / hook /stoPPers

/base metal/ buckles'

, "smart cards"

L- niJ t"g imported by industriJ irc holder vat compliant 100%

exnort-oriented textile industry

and othei media for the recording ofsound or ofother phenomena'

*fr"tfto or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the

production of discs, but excluding nro!u9!s of ChaRtel J7, ^^^,

Security Label/
Rfid label /Rfid tag
Security Tag

@ers and Press'studs, button

moulds and other parts ofthese articles; button blanks

not covered with textile material

oCl
oUI
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Description of Goods Name of raw materials (Bangladesh customs
tariff 2019-2020) w{qrft iirutrlffi{ ltr

Plastic Security tag ,

alarm tag, supper tag,
Security alarm

Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus ,
other than those of heading 85.12 or 95.30.
other apparatus. Parts

8531.90.00

{€ft qr{'lEr

s ttglvst
ErRNr

ffisltrFF

RFID TAG, Security
label, Security Sticker,
Woven Security Level. recording of sound or of other phenomena,

whether or not recorded, including matrices and
masters for the production of discs, but

ucts of Chapter 37.

Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatG@-
devices, "smart cards" and other media foithe

8523.59.10

Plastic Tag PIN Other articles of plastics and articles of other
materials of heading Nos. 39.01 to 39.14. Other
Chain and parts thereof, of iron or steeL 7315.90.00
Screws, bolts, nuts, coach screws, screw hookq
river, cotters, cotter-pins, washers (including
spring washers) and similar articles, of iron or
steel. - Other washers

7318.22.00

Clasps, frames with clasps@
clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the like, of base
metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing
accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches,
books, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or
saddlery or for other made up articles; tubular or
bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and
spangles, of base metal. - Tubular or bifurcated
rivets

8308.20.00

Metal plate

clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the like, of base
metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing
accessori es, footwear, j ewellery, wrist-watches,
books, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or
saddlery or for other made up articles; tubular or
bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and

Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-

of base metal. Other, includi

8308.90.00

river, cotters, cotter-pins, washers (including
spring washers) and similar articles, of iron or
steel.

Screws, bolts, nuts, coach screws, icrew hoots, '7318,29.90
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'09 D-ring Screws, bolts, nuts, coach screws, screw
hooks, river, cotters, cotter-pins, washers
(including spring washers) and similar
articles, of iron or steel. Other

7318.29.90

rsft
s lE&s
ERqI

ffivlr{S

l0 Badge Labels, badges and similar articles of textile
materials, in the piece, in strips or cut to
shape or size, not embroidered. - Woven

5807.10.00

u Cotton string Labels, badges and similar articles of textiG
materials, in the piece, in strips or cut to
shape or size, not embroidered. - Other

5807.90.00

t2 Eight Ring Screws, bolts, nuts, coach screws, screw
hooks, river, cotters, cotter-pins, washers
(including spring washers) and similar
articles, of iron or steel. Other

7318.29.90
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1 All Kinds of Woven Fabrics 5208.1 1.00-5208.59.00, 5209.1 1.00- 5209.59.00,
521 0.1 1 .00-52 1 0.59.00, 52 1 I .1 1 .00-5211 . 59.00,
521 2.1 1 .00-521 2.25. 00, 5309. 1 1 . 00-5309. 29. 00,
5407. 1 0. 1 0-5407.94.00, 5408. 1 0.00-5408. 34.00,
5512.11 . 1 0-551 2.99.00, 551 3. 1 1 .00-551 3.49.00,
5514.11 .00-5514.49.00, 5801 .10.00 -580',1 .90.00

<€fi 11ctopl e
iFfr"nm

mrsfrsF

Accessories :

2 Label (All Kinds) 5807. 1 0.00-5807.90.00, 5807. 1 0.00-5807.90.00,
5807.90.00

<gtfr 1t"telg e

QUtu< Erft1
c{l Ir{S

3. lnterlinq 5903.'1 0. 1 0-5903.90.00
4. Button (metal/olastic) 9606. 1 0.00-9606.30.00
5. Sewing Thread (All sorts) 5401 .10.00, 5403.49.00, 5204.11 .00, 5508.10.00,

5508.20.00, 5401.20.00, 5403.39.00, 5404.19.00

6. Card/Neck/Back board 4821.1 0.00. 4821.90.00

7. Butterfly 3907.99.00, 3926.20.90

8. Tissue Paper 4803.00.00

9. PVC Tape 3921 .19.00

10. Brass Pin/Silver Hand Pin 7319.20.00, 731 9.90.00

11 Color Bon 3926.20.90

12 lnsert 3926.20.90

13. Polv Bao/Blester Baq 3923.29.91 . 3923.29.90, 3923.21 .00

14. Gum Tape/Scose TaPe/Taslin
tao

3919.1 0.00, 391 9.90.00

15. Paoer Band 4821 .1 0.00, 4821.90.00

16. lron Seal/Metal Clip 8308.90.00

17. P.P Band 3919.10.00

18. Padinq 5811.00.00

19 Ziooer 9607. 1 I .00-9607.20.00

20. Elastic/Elastic Binder 4015.90.00

21 Hanger 3926.20.90, 3926.90.99

22. Velcro Tape 3919.90.00

23 Plastic Stoper, Metal StoPer 3923.21.00, 8309. 90. 20

24. Drawstinq/dracard 5402.39.00. 6217 .10.00

25. TwillTaoe 6217.10.00

26. Belt (lather) 4203.30.00

27. Price Ticket 482'1.90.00

28. Pin (Tao) 7319.30.00

29. Metal Seal 8309.90.20

30. Back Board 4823.90.99

3'1. Metal Clip/metal Chain 7 326.19.00t7 31 5.12.00

32. Lace 5804.29.00, 5804.30.00

33 Carton 481 9.1 0.00, 481 9.20.00

34 Hooks 8308.'10.00
Hangtag/Price
Tag/P riceticket/Han gtag,

Stiker/Barcode

4821 .90.00, 5807.90.00

36 Coller & Caf Rib 6001.10.00, 6002 90.00
a-7
JI Evelets 8308.10.00
10JU Neck Tie 6215.20.00
20 Leather Pach 4203.10.00

40 Rivets 7318.23.90

41 i Buckle 8308.90.00

12 Stone/Sequance 2513.1 1 .00


