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100% Polyester 1,712280
BGMEA/ Sharpa Knit Fabrics
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=~ of Raw Materials
Kanitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30 60.02
cm, containingby weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn
or rubber thread, other than those of heading 60.01.
1 | Knit Fabrics - Containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn 6002.40.00
containing rubber thread
2 | Knit Fabrics - Other 6002.90.00
Kanitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30 ~60.03
cm, other than those of heading 60.01 or 60.02
3 Knit Fabrics 0 - Of wool or fine animal hair 6003.10.00
4 | Knit Fabrics - Of cotton 6003.20.00
5 | Knit Fabrics - Of synthetic fibres 6003.30.00
6 | Knit Fabrics - Of artificial fibres 6003.40.00
7 | Knit Fabrics - Other 6003.90.00
Kanitted or crocheted fabrics of a width exceeding 30 cm, 60.04
containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn or
rubber thread, other those of heading 60.01
8 | Knit Fabrics - Containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yam but 6004.10.00
not containing
rubber thread
9 | Knit Fabrics - Othe 6004.90.00
Warp knit fabrics (including those made on galloon knitting 60.05
machines), other than of headings 60.01 to 60.04
10 | Knit Fabrics -- Unbleached or bleached 6005.21.00
11 | Knit Fabrics -- Dyed 6005.22.00
12 | Knit Fabrics -- Of yarns of different colours 6005.23.00
13 | Knit Fabrics -- Printed 6005.24.00
14 | Knit Fabrics -- Fabrics specified in Subheading Note 1 to this Chapter 6005.35.00
15 | Knit Fabrics -- Other, unbleached or bleached 6005.36.00
16 | Knit Fabrics -- Other, dyed 6005.37.00
17 | Knit Fabrics -- Other, of yarns of different colours 6005.38.00
18 | Knit Fabrics -- Other, printed 6005.39.00
19 | Knit Fabrics -- Unbleached or bleached 6005.41.00
20 | Knit Fabrics -- Dyed 6005.42.00
21_| Knit Fabrics -- Of yarns of different colours 6005.43.00
22 | Knit Fabrics -- Printed 6005.44.00
23 | Knit Fabrics --- Shading net imported by agricultural or horticultural 6005.90.10
products manufacturers
24 | Knit Fabrics -=- Other : 6005.90.90
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= of Raw Materials oy
Oth ed or crocheted fabrics .
25 | Knit Fabrics - Ofmi;: fine animal hair 6006.10.00
26 | Knit Fabrics — Unbleached or bleached 6006.21.00
27 | Knit Fabrics - Dyed 6006.22.00
28 | Knit Fabrics - Of yams of different colours 6006.23.00
29 | Knit Fabrics — Printed 6006.24.00
30 | Knit Fabrics -- Unbleached or bleached 6006.31.00
31 | Knit Fabrics -- Dyed 6006.32.00
32 | Knit Fabrics -- Of yams of different colours 6006.33.00
33 | Knit Fabrics -- Printed 6006.34.00
34 [ Knit Fabrics -- Unbleached or bleached 6006.41.00
35 | Knit Fabrics - Imported by Industrial IRC holder VAT complaint 6006.42.10
footwear manufacturing industry
36 | Knit Fabrics -— Other 6006.42.90
37 | Knit Fabrics --- Imported by industrial IRC holder VAT complaint 6006.43.10
footwear manufacturing industry
38 | Knit Fabrics -— Other 6006.43.90
39 | Knit Fabrics --- imported by Industrial IRC holder VAT compliant 6006.44.10
footwear manufacturing industry
40 | Knit Fabrics --- Other 6006.44.90
41 | Knit Fabrics - Other 6006.90.00
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52.11 Woven Fabrics of cotton, Containing less
than 85% by weight of cotton, mixed mainly or
solely with man-made fibres, weighting more
than 200g/m2
1 Woven Fabrics Plain Weave 5211.31.00
2 Woven Fabrics 3-Thread or 4-Thread twill, inciuding cross twill 5211.32.00
3 Woven Fabrics Other Fabrics 5211.39.00
Of Yarns of Different Colours
4 Woven Fabrics Plain Weave 5211.41.00
5 Woven Fabrics Other Fabrics 5211.49.00
6 Woven Fabrics Plain Weave 5211.51.00
7 Woven Fabrics 3-Thread or 4-Thread twill, inciuding cross twill 5211.52.00
- - I Ao @
8 Woven Fabrics Other Fabrics 5211.59.00 5o wifewt
52.12 Other Woven fabrics of cotton, TSI |
weighting not more than 200g/m2
9 Woven Fabrics Bleached 5212.12.00
10 Woven Fabrics Of Yarns of Different Colours 5212.14.00
Weighting more than 200 g/m2
11 Woven Fabrics Of Yarns of Different Colours 5212.24.00
53.09 Woven fabrics of flax. Containing 85% or
more by weight of flax
12 Woven Fabrics Unbleached of Bleached 5309.11.00
13 Woven Fabrics Other 5309.19.00
Containing less than 85% by weight of flax
14 Woven Fabrics Unbleached of Bleached 5309.21.00
15 Woven Fabrics Other 5309.29.00
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55.12 Woven Fabrics of synthetic

staple fibres, containing 85% or
more by weidht of synthetic staple
fibres.

16

Woven Fabrics

Containing 85% or more by weight
of polyester staple fibres:
Unbleached or Bleached

5512.11.00

17

Woven Fabrics

Others

5512.19.00

59.02 Tyre cord fabric of high
tenacity yarn of nylon or other
polyamides Polyesters or viscose
rayon

18

Woven Fabrics

Of Nylon or other Polyamides

5902.10.00

19

Woven Fabrics

Of polyesters

5902.20.00

20

Woven Fabrics

Other

5902.90.00

59.03 Textile fabrics impregnated,
coated, covered or laminated with
plastics,other than those of
heading 59.02

21

Woven Fabrics

Other

5903.90.90

22

Woven Fabrics

59.07 Textile fabrics otherwise
impregnated, coated or covered,
painted canvas being theatrical
scenery, studio back-cloths or the
like

5907.00.00

23

Woven Fabrics

59.08 Textile wicks, woven, plaited
or knitted, for lamps, stoves
lighters candles or the like,
incandescent gas mantles and
tubular knitted gas mantle fabric
therefor whether or not
impregnated

5908.00.00

24

Woven Fabrics

59.09 Textile hosepiping and similar
textile tubing, with or without
lining, armour or accessories of
other materials

5909.00.00

59.11 Textile products and articles,
for technical uses, specified in note
8 to this chapter

25

Narrow

26

Woven Fabrics

fabrics made of velvet impregnated
with rubber for covering weaving
spindle

5911.10.10

27

Woven Fabrics

Other

5911.10.90

28

Woven Fabrics

Bolting cloth, whether or not made
up textile fabrics and felts, endless
or fitted with linking devices, of a
kind used in paper making or
similar machines { for example, for
pulp or asbestos cement)

5911.20.00
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29

Woven Fabrics

Weighing less than 650g/m2

5911.31.00

30

Woven Fabrics

Weighting 650 g/m2 or more

5911.32.00

31

Woven Fabrics

Filtering or straining cloth of a kind
used in oil presses or the like
including that of human hair

5911.40.00

56.02 Felt, whether or not
impregnated, coated, covered or
laminated needleloom felt and
stitch-bonded fibre fabrics.

32

Woven Fabrics

Other

5602.90.00

56.03 Nonwovens, whether or not
impregnated, coated covered or
laminated.

33

Woven Fabrics

Other

5603.11.90

34

Woven Fabrics

Other

5603.12.90

35

Woven Fabrics

Weighing more than 70 g/m2 but
not more than 150 g/m2

5603.93.00

36

Woven Fabrics

Weighing more than 150 g/m2

5603.94.00

Textile fabrics, impregnated,
coated, covered or laminated with
plastics, other than those of
heading 59.02.

7@ A ¢ TBfE
SIfEH GIrSIaS |

37

Woven Fabrics

Other

5903.20.90

42.03 Articles of apparel and
clothing accessories, of leather or
of

composition leather.

38

PU Leather/Faux
Leather/Artificial
Leather Etc

Other clothing accessories

4203.40.00

Textile fabrics, impregnated,
coated, covered or laminated with
plastics, other than those of
heading 59.02.

39

Leather/Coated
Fabric/Laminated
Fabric Etc

imported by Industrial IRC holder
VAT compliant footwear
manufacturing industry

5903.20.20

Rubber thread and cord textile
covered, textile yarn and strip and
the like of heading 54.04 or 54.05
impregnated, coated, covered or
sheadthed with rubber or plastics

40

Woven Fabrics

Other

5604.90.00
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56.07 Twine cordage, ropes and
cables whether or not plated or
braided and whether or not

impregnated coated covered or
sheathed with rubber or palstic

41 Woven Fabrics Other 5607.90.00

Accessories

Electric sound or visual signaling
apparatus (for example, bells,
sirens, indicator panels, burglar or
fire alarms), other than those of
heading 85.12 or 85.30.

Bells/Sirens/Indicator
42 | Parnels/Burglaror | Parts 8531.80.00
Alarm/VST

Discs, tapes, solid-state non-
volatile storage devices, "smart
cards"

and other media for the recording
of sound or of other phenomena,
whether or not recorded, including
matrices and masters for the
production of discs, but excluding
products of Chapter 37.

RFID TAG imported by Industrial IRC
43 | RFID Tag/Alarm Tag | holder VAT compliant 100% 8523.59.20 | eI ¥ea ¢ TofE
export-oriented textile industry PR GRTOTR

44 | Security Tag Other 8523.59.90

Narrow woven fabrics, other than
goods of heading 58.07; narrow
fabrics consisting of warp without
weft assembled by means of an
adhesive (bolducs).

Other woven fabrics, containing by
weight 5% or more of elastomeric
yarn

45 - or rubber thread

Elastic Tape 5806.20.00

58.07 Labels, badges and similar
articles of textile materials, in the
46 piece, in 5807.90.00
Rubber/Rubber strips or cut to shape or size, not
Badge embroidered.

48.02 Uncoated paper and
paperboard, of a kind used for
writing, printing or

other graphic purposes, and non
perforated punch-cards and punch
tape paper, in rolls or rectangular
{(including square) sheets, of any
size, other than paper of heading
48.01 or 48.03; hand-made paper
and paperboard.

47
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48 | Security Tag Others 43802.69.00
85.43 Electrical machines and
Super Tag VST Tack apparatus, having individual
Charcoal functions, not specified or included
elsewhere in this Chapter.
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(A) All Kinds of Fabrics :
Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted
) fabrics; lace in the piece in strips or in motifs, other than fabrics of
g1 | Lace/lace Fabrics headings 60.02 to 60.06.
Hand made - ;
-- Of other textile materials 5804.29.00
-Hand-made lace 5804.30.00
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton, weighing
more than 200 g/m2. 5209.42.00 |
-- Denim
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing less than 85%by weight of cotton, mixed
- mainly or solely with man-made fibres, weighing more than 200 g/m2.
-- Denim 5211.42.00
02 Denim Fabrics N — - -
-- Other fabrics of 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twill 5211.43.00
- Bleached 5211.20.00
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton, weighing
not more than 200 g/m2. %ﬁ
-- Plain weave, weighing not more than 100 g/m2 5208.31.00 =
9
-- Plain weave, weighing not more than 100 g/m2 5208.21.00 3
) Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow @
03 zlbbon/\xoven Tape fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an 5806.31.00 ' ;3’
arrow Woven adhesive (bolducs). SR &
Fabrics Of cotton -Of cotton | @
Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including woven fabrics o ] g
obtained from materials of heading 54.04. 5407.83.00 1 i
Net fabrics, mesh Of yarns of different colours i 3
04 fabrics of machine Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted |
made fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other than fabrics of 5804.10.00 : |
headings 60.02 to 60.06. e
Tulles and other net fabrics ]
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton,
weighing more than 200 g/m2.
. -- Other fabrics 5209.29.0C
. - --Denim 5209.42.00
05 Woven Twill Fabri
ven TWilFabries 1™ Sther fabrics of 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twill 5209.43.00
-- Plain weave 5209.11.00
Other woven fabrics of cotton ;
- Unbleached 52121100
) ) Other woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres. *
06 | Viscose Fabrics -- Mixed mainly or solely with viscose rayon staple fibres 5615.11.00
Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including woven fabrics
07 100% Nylon Fabrics obtained from materials of heading 54.04. 5407.42.00
-- Dyed
08 Organic Fabrics Cotton, not carded or combed 5201.00.00 N
/ [5e "j'é_f -ov//
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(B) Accessories :
Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, "smart cards”
Sticker/RFID Tag and other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena,
09 Security Tag, Alarm | whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the 8523.59.10
Tag, Proximity Card | production of discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37.
--- Proximity Cards and tags
Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells, sirens,
indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those of heading
10 RFID Tag 85.12 or 85.30. 8531.80.00
i - Other apparatus
: Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow fabrics containing of
j warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs)
j - Of cotton 5806.31.00
boon Twill Tape - Of other textile materials 5806.39.00
Other made up clothing accessories; parts of garments or of
clothing accessories, other than those of heading 62.12. 6217.10.00
- Accessories
Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button
12 Snap Button moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks. 9606.10.00
p - Press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs and parts therefor
- Buttons

Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes,
eyelets and the like, of base metal, of a kind used for clothing or
clothing accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches, books,

13 Hook/Buckle awnings, leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other made up 8308.20.00 4
articles; tubular or bifurcated rivets, of hase metal; beads and %
- spangles, of base metal. %
- Tubular or bifurcated rivets fgl
Metal Zipper/ Slide fasteners and parts thereof.

14 Plastic Zipper -- Fitted with chain scoops of base metal 9607.11.00 %
Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading §8.07; narrow o«
fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an 5806.31.00, %’
adhesive (bolducs).

-- Of cotton %

15 Ribbon Typewriter or similar ribbons, inked or otherwise prepared for giving
impressions, whether or not on spools or in cartridges; ink-pads,
whether or not inked, with or without boxes.

--- Other 9612.10.90
--- Computer printer ribbons 9612.10.10
Articles of apparel and clothing accessories, of leather or of composition leather.

16 Lather Patch/Cloth - Articles of apparel 4203.10.00
- Other clothing accessories 4203.40.00
Tuiles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted
fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other than fabrics of
headings 60.02 to 60.06.

17 String -- Of man-made fibres 5804.21.00
Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading Nos.

39.01 to 39.14. 3926.90.99
---- Other
18 Embroidery Patch ETtgfoci:gtetg] in the piece, in strips or in motifs 5810.91.00
Tanned or crust hides and skins of bovine (including buffalo) or

19 Lather Tape equine animals, without hair on, whether or not split, but not but not 4104.11.10

further prepared
-— Split leather
Other plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of plastics. 392119

20 PVC Tape -—- Microcellular PET light sheet having a power saving capacity of 20% or . ' |

more |
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21

Metal Clip

Stoppers, caps and lids (including crown corks, screw caps and pouring
stoppers), capsules for bottles, threaded bungs, bung covers, seals and
other packing accessories, of base - metal.

----Crown corks

LI AN
Liizjia
5
Dlelote, /B

BA

8309.10.00,

Container seal

8309.90.20

22

Adhesive tape

Cellulose and its chemical derivatives, not elsewhere specified or
included, in primary forms.
--Other

3912.90.00

Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not printed.
- Printed

4821.10.00

Labels, badges and similar articles of textile materials, in the piece, in
strips or cut to shape or size, not embroidered
--Other

5807.90.00

Rubberised textile fabrics, other than those of heading 59.02.
Adhesive tape of a width not exceeding 20 cm

5906.10.00

23

Wappen patch/
PU patch

Articles of apparel and clothing accessories, of leather or of
composition leather.
Other clothing accessories

4203.40.00

24

Mark /Metal
patch

Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes,
eyelets and the like, of base metal, of a kind used for clothing or
clothing accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches, books,
awnings, leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other made up
articles; tubular or bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and spangles,
of base metal.

- Hooks, eyes and eyelets

8308.10.00

25

Shank button

Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button
moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks.
-- Of a base metal, not covered with textile material

9606.22.00

26

Jasquard Elastic

Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow
fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an
adhesive (bolducs).

- Woven pile fabrics (including terry towelling and similar terry fabrics) and
chenille fabrics

5806.10.00

27

Silica gel

Other inorganic acids and other inorganic oxygen compounds of non-
metals.

2811.29.90

28

Zipper Puller

Slide fasteners and Parts thereof.
- Parts

©bIGLY 1zl B2IAE & Flola LIRS

9607.20.00

29

Metal seal

Stoppers, caps and lids (including crown corks, screw caps and
pouring stoppers), capsules for bottles, threaded bungs, bung covers,
seals and other packing accessories, of base metal.

--- Container seal

8309.90.20

30

Carton

Cartons, boxes, cases, bags and other packing containers, of paper,
paperboard, cellulose wadding or webs of cellulose fibres; box files, letter
trays, and similar articles, of paper or paperboard of a kind used in offices,
shops or the like

- Cartons, boxes and cases, of corrugated paper and paperboard

4819.10.00

- Folding cartons, boxes and cases, of non-corrugated paper and paperboard
Cartons, boxes, cases, bags and other packing containers, of paper,
paperboard, cellulose wadding or webs of cellulose fibres; box files, letter
trays, and similar articles, of paper or paperboard of a kind used in offices,
shops or the like.

4819.20.00

31

100% Poly lace
fabrics

Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted
fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other than fabrics of
headings 60.02 to 60.06.

- Tulles and other net fabrics

5804.10.00
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