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LA TYARN. Knitting Yam |
01 Synthetie filament varn (other than sewing thread), not put up for retail Lycra@20D 22Dtex 5402.44.00
sale, including synthetic monofilament of less than 67 decitex - High
tenacity vam of nylon or other polyamides, whether or not textured
- Flastometn
-Of oy SRy | 73300 W
02 Other Knitted or crocheted fabrics
--Or artificial fibres— Other 63% Cotton, 37% Polyester | 6006.90.00 W
Jacquard Terry Loop
03 COTTON YARN (OTHER THAN SEWING THREAD), CONTAINING 85% OR 40'SCOMBED 5205.24.00
MORE BY WEIGHT OF COTTON, NOT PUT UP FOR RETAIL SALE. 40’S CARDED
- Measuring less than 192 31 decitex but not less than 125
decitex(exceeding 52 metric number but not exceeding 80 metric
number)
Measuring less than 106.38 decitex but not less than 83.33 60’S COMBED 5205.27.00
decitex(exceeding 94 metric number but not exceeding 120 metric 60’S CARDED \
number)
04. Yarn (other than sewing thread) of artificial staple fibres, not put ug Tor 100%VISCOSE RING 5510.11.00
retail sale. SPUN YARN FOR
- Containing 85% or more by weight of artificial staple fibres : KNITTING, COUNT 50/1
-- Single yam NE \
05. Other knitted or crocheted fabrics FABRICS (95% VISCOSE, | 6006.42.10
—- Imported by Industrial IRC holder VAT complaint footwear 5% ELASTANE) N -
manufacturing industry = TR
Of wool or fine animal hair 100% WOOL KNIT SJ 6006.10.00 \ ia
CTSTTE
- Dyed 45% COTTON, 45% MODEL | 6006.22.00 ‘\
10% WOOL KNIT SJ
06. Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted NYLON SPANDEX LACE | 5804.30.00
fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other than fabrics of FABRIC
headings 60.02 to 60.06.
--Hand-made lace i
07. Pumice stone; emery; natural corundum, natural gamet and other natural
abrasives, whether or not heat-treated.
- Pumice stone kg 10% Free Stone, Sequance 2513.10.00
- Emery, natural corundum, natural gamet and other natural abrasives 2513.20.00
08. Self- adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat shapes, of
plastics, whether or not in rolls-
-- Other — Other Mobilon Tape 3919.90.99
09. Re-seal/Self adhesive tape imported by Industrial IRC holder HOLOGRAM STICKER 3919.90.91
VATcompliant hygiene products or electrical, electronics and home
appliances
manufacturers
OTHER HOLOGRAM STICKER 3919.90.99
OTHER TAPE 3926.90.99
10. Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading Nos. STICKER 3926.20.90
39.01 to 39.14.
-- Other
11 Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading Nos. Heat Transfer Label 3926.90.99
39.01 t0 39.14 3926.20.90
---- Other ‘\
12. Transfers (decalcomanlas),- Other Heat Transfers Sticker 4908.90.00 j
13. Other articles of leather or of composition leather. PUBELT 4205.00.90
--- Other T
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14 Paper or paperboard Tabels of all kinds, whether or not printed BARCODE STICKIR T T T _ \
WO ... .. - '
15 Articles of apparel and clothing accessones, of Teather or of composition | BELT OTHER CLOTHING A0
leather ACEFSSORIES
- Articles of appare |
- Other 4203 29 (4
- Relts and bandohiers 4203 3 ft’; I
- = Other clothing accessonies A20% A (1) | |
16 Dhses, tapes, solid state non volatile storage devices, “anart cards™ and other medin SUCURITY TAG 5235910 .
for the recording of sound or of other phenomena, whether or not recorded, | ‘,
wcToding mamces and masters for the production of discs, bt excluding products l‘ l
of Chapten V7 |
<o Pronty Cards and tags o “
1" —CREID TAG imported by Industiial IRC holder VAT compliant 1007 | SUCURITY TAG URSYS0
export-onented testile industry o ‘
1N - Other ] ) ' SUCURTTY TAG TR l
v Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button moulds | SNAPBUTTON AU |
and other parts of these articles, button blanks '
- Press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs and parts therefor |
- Of plastics not covered with textile material BUTTONS 9606 21 06
Of a base metal, not covered with textile material Metal Stone Button 9606 22 (0 l
- Other BUTTONS 9606 29 00
2 - Button moulds and other parts of buttons, button blanks BUTTONS 9606.30.00
21 Rubbensed textile fabrics, other than those of heading 59.02-
| --Other — Reflective tape Reflective tape 5906.99 10
22 Sewing needles, knitting needles, bodkins, crochet hooks, embroidery |
stilettos and similar articles, for use in the hand , of iron or steel, safety |
pins and other pins of iron or steel, not elsewhere specified or included. i
--Safety pins and other pins *
Safety Pins and other Pin 7319.40 00 |
23. Other made up clothing accessories; parts of garments or of clothing
accessories, other than those of heading 62.12
--Accessories Antitheft (Tag with Plastic Pin) 6217.10.00
24 Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells, sirens,
indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those of heading
85.12 or 85.30- Other apparatus
25 --Burglar or fire alarms and similar apparatus Security Alarm 8531.10.00
26. Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 85.07; narrow fabrics
consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive
(bolducs).
--Of man-made fibres---Other Velvet Tape (DTM) 5806.32.90
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A. | Knitting Yarn ; i et
Synthetic filament yarn (other tahna sewing thread), not put up for 4G qR
Retail sale, including synthetic monofilament of less than 67 ofw
decitex. 9% MWZEWT
1.  Other yarn, single, with a twist exceeding 50 turns per metre: Coolmex Yarn / 5402.51.00
~Of nylon or other polyamides Spandex (Lycra)/ filament/
Polyester Spun Yarn
Synthetic monofilament of 67 decitex or more and of which no
cross-sectional dimension exceeds 1 mm; strip and the like (for
Example, artificial straw) or synthetic textile materials of an
pparent width not exceeding 5 mm.
2. +-Other, of polypropylene Polyester Filament Yarn/ | 5404.12.00
Micro Polyester Yarn
3. (-Other yarn- Mixed mainly or solely with cotton \5(2‘;/:‘ Viscose +50% cotton 5509.92.00
B. Knitted Fabrics:
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of
cotton, weighing not more than 200 g/m2.
4. -unbleached — Plain weave, weighting not more than 100 g/m2 Plain knit Fabrics 5208.11.00
Woven pile fabrics and chenile fabrics, other than fabrics of
heading 58.02 or 58.06
5. -Of man-made fibres — Other weft pile fabrics Other Weft pile knit 5801.33.00
fabrics
Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or
crocheted fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other
than fabrics of headings 60.02 to 60.06
6. -Mechanically made lace — Of man- made fibres made lace of man-made | 5804.21.00
fibres knit fabrics ( in
ieces in strips)
7. -Mechanically made lace ~ Hand — made lace Lace Fabrics 5804.30.00
Textile fabrics, Impregnated, coated, covered or laminated with
plastics, other than those of heading 59.02
8. --Other 100% OXFORD FABRIC 5903.10.90
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Pile fabrics, including “long pile” fabrics and terry fabrics, el o
knitted or crocheted. T R
9. - Other — Of man — made fibres Coral Fleece, 6001.92.00 | gefew sifemt
100% polyester,
Sharpa Fabrics, 100% SIS
polyester, Micro Polar
Fleece and Fur Fabric.
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30 cm,
other than those of heading 60.01 or 60.02
10. | -Of cotton Knitted Fabrics 6003.20.00
11. | -Of synthetic fibres Synthetic Fibres 6003.30.00
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width exceeding 30 cm,
containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn or rubber
thread, other those of heading 60.01
12. | -Containing by weight 5% or more of elastomaric yarn but not Ponte Roma Knit Fabrics 6004.10.00
containing rubber thread / Soft Fabrics
Warp Knit Fabrics (including those made on galloon knitting
machines), other than of headings 60.01 to 60.04
13. | -Of cotton — Dyed Cotton Mesh Fabrics 6005.22.00
14. | -Of cotton — Printed Cotton Mesh Fabrics 6005.24.00
15. | -Of synthetic fibres - Other Dyed and Other Printed Synthetic Mesh Fabrics 6005.37.00
16. | -Of synthetic fibres - Other Printed Synthetic Mesh Fabrics 6005.39.00
17. | -Of artificial fibres — Dyed Artifical Knit Fabrics and | 6005.42.00
18. | -Of artificial fibres — printed Artificial Mesh Fabrics 6005.44.00
Other Knitted or crocheted fabrics
19. | --Of cotton -Dyed Fleece Fabrics + Micro 6006.22.00
Fleece Fabrics+ Pollar
Fleece Fabrics
20. | --Of cotton -- Of Printed Fleece Fabrics + Micro 6006.24.00
Fleece Fabrics+ Pollar
Fleece Fabrics
21. | --Of synthetic Fibres—Dyed Polyester Knitted 6006.32.00
Fabrics (Interloc, Mash,
Ray on Fabrics), Ponte
Roma Knit Fabrics, Soft
Fabrics.
22. | --Of synthetic Fibres—Printed Polyester Interlock 6006.34.00
Knitted Fabrics
73. | --Of artificial fibres — Dyed Ponte Roma Knit Fabrics 6006.42.00
74. | --Of artificial fibres — Printed Ponte Roma Knit Fabrics | 6006.44.00
C. Woven Fabrics:
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of
cotton, weighting not more than 200 g/m2.
25. | --Bleached - 3 thread or 4 — thread twill, including cross twill TWILL FABRICS 5208.23.00
26. | --Dyed-Plain weave, weighing not more than 100 g/m2 TWILL FABRICS 5208.31.00
27. | --Dyed — Plain weave, weighing more than 100 g/m2 Cotton Lyra Fabrics 5208.32.00
28. | -- Dyed- 3-thread or 4- thread twill, including cross twill TWILL FABRICS 5208.33.00
29. | -Of yarns of different colours — Plain weave, weighting more Chambray Fabrics, Twill 5208.42.00
than 100 g/m2 Fabrics and 100%
Cotton Y/D Check
Poplin, Cotton Lyra
Fabrics
30. -- Of yarns of different colours - 3-thread or 4 —thread twill, TWILL FABRICS and 5208.43.00
including cross twill 100% BCI cotton Y/D
Flannel
31. | --Printed -- Plain weave, weighing not more than 100 g/m2. TWILL FABRICS 5208.51.00 |
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Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of e et
cotton, weighing more than 200 g/m2 T G
32. -Unbleached—3-thread or 4—thread twill, including cross twill | CANVAS FABRICS 5209.12.00 Lefew siftmt
33. | --Dyed - Plain Weave Chambray Fabrics 5209.31.00 ISR
34. | --Of yarns of different colours ~- Denim Denim Fabrics 5209.42.00
35. | --Of yarns of different colours --Other Fabrics Woven Fabrics 5209.49.00
36. | --Printed — 3-thread or 4- thread twill, including cross twill CANVAS FABRICS 5209.52.00
Woven Fabrics of Flax.
Containing 85% or more by weight of flax;
37. | --Other. 100% LINED DYED 5309.19.00
WOVEN FABRIC AND
WOVEN OXFORD
FABRIC
Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including woven
fabrics obtained from materials of heading 54.04
38. | -Other woven fabrics, containing 85% or more by weight of Nylon Mesh Fabrics 5407.42.00
filaments of nylon or other polyamides; —Dyed
39. | -Other woven fabrics, containing 85% or more by weight of 11:03% Tagi;a,l) g)I{};?Sltjz/MeSh 5407.52.00
textured polyester filaments. - Dyed S; [:;\%EX ° o
40. | --Other woven fabrics, containing 85% or more by weight of Polyester Mesh Fabrics and 5407.69.00
polyester filaments: - Other }88://: lf c‘)’%’]essst%’lzgf“d Fabrics,
41. | --Other woven fabrics, containing less than 85% by weight of Mesh Fabrics 5407.81.00
synthetic filaments, mixed mainly or solely with cotton
- Unbleached or bleached
42. | --Other woven fabrics, containing less than 85% by weight of Mesh Fabrics 5407.82.00
synthetic filaments, mixed mainly or solely with cotton.
—Dyed
43. | --Other woven fabrics, containing less than 85% by weight of Mesh Fabrics 5407.83.00
synthetic filaments, mixed mainly or solely with cotton.
—Of yarns of different colours.
Woven farics of synthetic staple fibres, containing less than
85% by weight of such fibres, mixed mainly or solely with
cotton, of a weight not exceeding 170 g/m2
44. | .- Ofyarns of different colours—Of polyester staple fibres, 65% Polyester, 35% 5513.31.00
plain weave Cotton Yarn Dyed
Stripe, Poplin
Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing less than
85% by weight of such fibres, mixed mainly or solely with
cotton, of a weight exceeding 170 g/m2
45. --Dyed — 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twill, of CANVAS FABRICS 5514.22.00
polyeser staple fibres
Woven fabrics of artificial staple fibres.
46. | --Containing 85% or more by weight of artificial staple fibres— | 100% Viscose Poplin/ 5516.14.00
Printed 100% Viscose (Rayon)
Printed Woven Fabrics
D. | Accessories :-
Other inorganic acids and other inorganic oxygen compounds of non-
metals.
47. | --Sillica gel imported by VAT registered refrigerator Silica Gel 2811.29.10
manufacturing Industries
Self- adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat shapes,
of plastics, whether or not in rolls-
48. | --Performance Tape/Closure/Side Tape Performance Tape/ 3919.90.20
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49.

Other articles of plastics and articles of tther materials of heading nos.
39.01 to 39.14.
--Office or School supplies

Hanger/ Collar Band

3926.10.00
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50.

Conveyor or Transmission belts or belting, of vulcanised rubber.
_Other — Rubber belt round not exceeding 10” dia/flat

Supplementary Belt

4010.39.10

51.

Paper and paper board, coated on one or both sides with kolin
(China clay) or other inorganic substances, with or without a
binder, and with no other coating, whether or not surface-
coloured, surface-decorated or printed, in rolls or rectangular
(Including square) sheets, of any size.

--Other paper and paperboard — Multi-ply

Car/Neck/Paper/Back
Board

4810.92.00

52.

Cartons, boxes, cases, bags and other packing containers of
paper, paperboad, cellulose wadding or webs of cellulose fibres;
box files, lether trays, and similar articles, of paper or
paperboard of a kind used in offices, shops or the like.
--Folding cartons, boxes and cases of non-corrugated paper and
paperboard

Folding cartons, boxes
and cases

4819.20.00

53.

Other paper, paperboard, cellulose wadding and webs of
cellulose fibres, cut to size or shape; other articles of paper pulp,
paper, paperboard, cellulose wadding or webs of cellulose
fibres.

--Surface Coloured or printed paper or paper board

Sticker

4823.90.93

54.
55.
56.

Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or
crocheted fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motfs, other
than fabrics of headings 60.02 to 60.06-

--Tulles and other net fabrics

--Mechanically made lace-- Of other textile materials
--Mechanically made lace --Hand-made lace

Lace

5804.10.00

Lace

5804.29.00

lace

5804.30.00

57.

Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow
fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an
adhesive (bolducs).

--Of other textile materials

Twill tape

5806.39.00

58.

59.
60.

Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs — Embridery without
visible ground

— Other Embridery of cotton

— Other Embridery — Of man- made fibres

Embroidery

Embroidery

5810.10.00

5810.91.00

Embroidery

5810.92.00

61.

Rubberised textile fabrics, other than those of heading 59.02-
--Adhesive tape of a width not exceeding 20 cm.

Adhesive Tape

5906.10.00

62.

Glass beads, imitation pearls, imitation precious or semi-precious
stones and similar glass small wares, and articles thereof other than
imitation jewellery, glass eyes other than prosthetic articles; statuettes
and other ornaments of lamp worked glass, other than imitation
jewellery; glass micro spheres not exceeding 1 mm in diameter.

— glass beads, imitation pearls, imitation precious or semiprecious
stones and similar glass small wares

Metal Plastic Beads

7018.10.00

63.
64.
65.

Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the
like, of base metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing accessories, footwear,
jewellery, wrist-watches, books, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or saddler
or for other made up articles; tubular or bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads
and spangles, of metal. —

--Hooks, eyes and eyelets.

--Tubular or bifurcated rivets
--Other, including parts.

Eyelets/Hooks/Printing
Accessories/Buckles

8308.10.00

Rivets

8308.20.00

Metal Clip / Ring for
Button, Metal End, Metal
Broch/ Buckles/ Beads

8308.90.00
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Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devlces, “smart cards” and e At
other media for the recording of soud or of other phenomena, whether AT TR
or not recorded, including matrices and masters for rthe production of T
discs, but excluding products of chapter 37.
CHSIIE
66. .-Other - Proximity Cards and tags. Security 8523.59.10
Label/Tag/Hangtag/
Alarm/ super Tag
Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells,
sirens, indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those
of heading 85.12 or 85.30- Other apparatus
67. | --other apparatus Security Tag / Security 8531.80.00
Hangtag/Security
Alarm/Super Tag
Slide fasteners and parts thereof
68. | - Other Rubber Pullar 9607.19.00
69. | -Parts
Zipper Pullar 9607.20.00
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