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NO
FABRICS:
Articles of apparel, clothing accessories and 43.03
other articles of furskin. )
1 Far Fabric Other 4303.90.00
A Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or
more by weight of cotton, weighing more than 52.09
200 g/m2.
2 Denim Fabric Denim 5209.42.00
Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yarn,
including woven fabrics obtained from 54.07
materials of heading 54.04.
100%NYLON 233T TASLON
OWR, .
100% NYLON TASLON 233T
DWR SCHOELLER,
100% NYLON TASLON DWR
SCHOELLER,
3 100% Nylon Taslon 233T/70DX | Dyed 5407.42.00
160D WRD Schoeller.
100% NYLON P/D CRINKLE
TAFFETA,
100% NYLON TASLON 233T.
100% NYLON RECYCLED
WOVEN FABRIC N
4 Printed Fabrics Printed 5407.44.00
Tulles and other net fabrics, not including
woven, knitted or crocheted fabrics; lace in the 58.04
piece, in strips of in motifs, other than fabrics of )
headings 60.02 to 60.06.
5 Mesh Fabric Tulles and other net fabrics 5804.10.00
Textile fabrics, impregnated, coated, covered or
laminated with plastics, other than those of 59.03
heading 59.02.
6 Coatf:d [fabri?, P_U Coated Fabric, | Other 5903.20.90
Lamination Fabric
) Other knitted or crocheted fabrics 60.06
7 | Mesh Fabric Dyed 6006.32.00
| 8 [ RibFabric Other 6006.90.00
B BT k-0
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SL FICEE AMeACHS AT FToTETE A @ 39 (BCT 2023-2024  THSNTF) H.S CODE
NO
ACCESSORIES HS CODE
Skins and other parts of birds, with their
feathers or down, feathers and parts of feathers ‘
(whether or not with trimmed edges) and down, 05.05 l
not further worked than cleaned, disinfected or o
treated for preservation; powder and waste of
feathers or parts of feathers. B
Duck Down, Fake Down, Down

08 Feather, Duck Feather Feathers of a kind used for stuffing; down 0505.10.00 J

Tubes, pipes and hoses, and fittings therefor (for J
5 . 39.17
example, joints, elbows, flanges), of plastics.

10 | heat shrink tube/hose pipe | Other_ 391 7.32.97(_)_4
Other plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of
plastics, non-cellular and not reinforced,
laminated, supported or similarly combined
with other materials. 39.20

Seam Tape, TPU Tape, Shoulder
11 | Tape, Seam Sealing Tape, Film Other
Tape 3920.99.90
Other articles of vulcanised rubber other than
40.16
hard rubber. o
Rubber patch, rubber badge.
stopper. silicon patch , silicon
Badge. Elastic Binder, Foot loop,
Rubber washer, Binding Tape
iz ,D.Ring, O-Ring, Toggle, Rubber Qliey 4016.99.90
puller, Reflective Badge, Fake
Suede Badge/Reflective
Puller,elastic binding
Articles of apparel and clothing accessories, of
B 42.03
leather or of composition leather. o
Patch, Badge, PU Patch, PU Other clothing accessories
Badge, Leather Die Cut, Die Cut
13 | Loop, Leather Sleve Cut, Washer, 4203.40.00
Belt, PU Belt, Leather Puller,
Tag, stopper
Vegetable parchment, greaseproof papers,
tracing papers and glassine and other glazed
. 48.06
transparent or translucent papers, in rolls or
sheets.

14 | Tracing Paper Tracing papers 4806.30.00 |
Toilet paper and similar paper, cellulose
wadding or webs of cellulose fibres, of a kind
used for household or sanitary purposes, in rolls
of a width not exceeding 36 cm, or cut to size or
shape; handkerchiefs, cleansing tissues, towels, 48.18
tablecloths, servietges, bed sheets and similar )
household, sanitary or hospital articles, articles
of apparel and clothing accessories, of paper
pulp, paper, cellulose wadding or webs of
cellulose fibres.

15 | Tissue paper Articles of apparel and clothing accessories 4818.50.00
Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, 48.21
whether or not printed. ) |

Label, Sticker, Hang Tag, Waist
Tag, Joker Tag, Joker Label,
Patch . Badge, Jacron Label, .
16 Jacron Patcﬁ, Patch Label, Hang Rrintied 4821.10.00
BT BT -3

Tag with String, Price Tag, Tag,
Puller 0
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SL PG JfAenS NIy IR W @ 3941 (BCT 2023-2024 wwrenas) | H.S CODE
NO )
Sewing thread of man-made filaments, 54.01
whether or not put up for retail sale. )
Firefly 100% Spun Meta Aramid Fr,
0, o H .
17 :88(;2 2{;32 gi)Ji}'negst?;]rSez\g:ggﬁa\Tv?;;ad. Of synthetic filaments 5401.10.00
Thread
Synthetic staple fibres, carded, combed or
. o 55.06
otherwise processed for spinning.
MICROROLLO FIBERBALL,
18 | MICROROLLO3032R (Polyester Of polyesters 5506.20.00
Fiber), Fake Down | 0 o
Wadding of textile materials and articles
thereof; textile fibres, not exceeding S mm 56.01
in length (flock), textile dust and mill neps.
19 | Padding, Wadding Other 5601.29.00
Nonwovens, whether or not impregnated,
: 56.03
coated, covered or laminated.
20 | Non Woven Interlining Other . 5603.12.90
Rubber thread and cord, textile covered;
textile yarn, and strip and the like of
heading 54.04 or 54.05, impregnated, 56.04
coated, covered or sheathed with rubber or
plastics.
21 Elastic Drawcord, Bungee Drawcord, 5604.10.00
Bungee Cord, string Rubber thread and cord, textile covered T
Twine, cordage, ropes and cables, whether
or not plaited or braided and whether or
. 56.07
not impregnated, coated, covered or
sheathed with rubber or plastics.
Elastic Drawcord, Drawcord, -
2 Drawstring, Loop Cord. String Other 56078600
Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of
heading 58.07; narrow fabrics consisting of 58.06
warp without weft assembled by means of )
an adhesive (bolducs).
Elastic, Elastic Tape, Button Hole
23 | Tape, Button Hole Elastic, elastic Other woven fabrics, containing by weight 5% | 5806.20.00
binder, elastic binding or more of elastomeric yarn or rubber thread
Ribbon Gross Grain Tape, Cotton
24 | Tape. Woven Tape, Webing Tape. 5806.31.00
Twill Tape, Tape, Button Hole Tape Of cotton
Velcro tape (Hook & Loop), Gross
Grain Tape, Cotton Tape, Woven
25 | Tape, Webing Tape, Twill Tape, Tape, 5806.32.90
Button Hole Tape, Ribbon, Binding
Tape Other
Gross Grain Tape, Cotton Tape,
26 % ?;:?:;g%?:g:ﬁ;:??p?m” Of other texthe materials 5806.39.00
Ribbon, Velcro tape (Hook & Loop)
Labels, badges and similar articles of textile
materials, in the piece, in strips or cut to 58.07
shape or size, not embroidered.
Woven Badge, Woven Loop, Woven
27 Puller, Woven Patch, string Woven 3807.1 O'O?w
Woven Patch, Woven Badge, Woven
28 Loop. Woven Puller, string Other 5807'90'00‘
Eml?r0|dery in the piece, in strips or in 58.10
motifs
29 | Embroidery Badge/Embroidery Patch byeidery without visible ground 5810.10.00
BRI #BT "R-23
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NO

FIHTCETA RIS T

FHMICETE A9 ¢ I (BCT 2023-2024  Trolaw)

H.S CODE

Textile fabrics, impregnated, coated, covered or
laminated with plastics, other than those of
heading 59.02.

59.03

30

Interlining

Fusing interlining materials (textile material for
stiffening cuffs and collars)

5903.10.10

Other made up clothing accessories, knitted or
crocheted; knitted or crocheted parts of
garments or of clothing accessories.

61.17

31

Coller Cuff, Rib Cuff, Rib

Other

6117.80.90

Nails, tacks, drawing pins, corrugated nails,
staples (other than those of heading 83.05) and
similar articles, of iron or steel, whether or not
with heads of other material, but excluding such
articles with heads of copper.

73.17

32

Super Tack

Nails, tacks. drawing pins, corrugated nails, staples
(other than those of heading 83.05) and similar
articles, of iron or steel, whether or not with heads
of other material, but excluding such articles with
heads of copper.

7317.00.00

Sign-plates, name-plates, address-plates and
similar plates, numbers letters and other
symbols, of base metal, excluding those of,
heading 94.05.

83.10

Metal Badge. Metal Patch, Name
Plate

Sign-plates, name-plates, address-plates and similar
plates, numbers letters and other symbols, of base
metal, excluding those of, heading 94.05.

8310.00.00

Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage
devices, ""smart cards" and other media for the
recording of sound or of other phenomena,
whether or not recorded, including matrices and
masters for the production of discs, but
excluding products of Chapter 37.

85.23

34

Security Tag, Super Tag, RFID
Hang Tag. RFID Label, RFID
Sticker. RFID Waist Tag, RFID
eastag

RFID TAG imported by Industrial IRC holder VAT
compliant 100% export-oriented textile industry

Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for
example, bells, sirens, indicator panels, burglar
or fire alarms), other than those of heading 85.12
or 85.30.

85.31

35

SUPER TAG

Parts

8531.90.00

Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and
press-studs, button moulds and other parts of
these articles; button blanks.

96.06

36

SNAP SOCKET, SNAP STUD,
Button , Press-fasteners, Snap-
fastener And press-studs And
parts Thrtefor Button

Pres s-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs and
parts therefor

3
)

9606.10.00

37

NYLON BUTTON / PLASTIC
BUTTON / MELAMINE
BUTTON

Of plastics not covered with textile material

9606.21.00

38

Metal Button, Metal Snap,
Button

, Of a base metal, not covered with textile material

9606.22.00)
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SL FOIETR AMCTE AT FIoTIETs W 8 A (BCT 2023-2024  TUroRI) H.S CODE
NO
_ Slide fasteners and parts thereof. 96.07
39 | Metal Zipper Fitte d with chain scoops of base metal 9607.11.00
40 Plastic leper, Nylon Zipper, Other 9607.19.00
Other Zipper
41 Zipper Puller, Slider, Puller Parts 9607.20.00
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COMMERCIAL NAME OF THE H.S CODE-
CUSTOMS TARRIF 2022-2023-DESCRIPTION RAW MATERIALS: NO. I
FABRICS
SL | Artificial fur and articles thereof. 43.04
1 Artificial fur and articles thereof. Fur Fabric 4304.00.00
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by 52.08
weight of cotton, weighing not more than 200 g/m2. )
2 | Plain weave, weighing not more than 100 g/m2 Woven Fabrics. 5208.11.00
3 | 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twill Woven Cotton fabrics (bleached) 5208.13.00
4 | Other fabrics Woven Fabrics. 5208.19.00
5 | Others fabric Woven Fabrics. 5808.29.00
6 | Others fabric SYNTHETIC FABRICS 5208.59.00
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by 52.09
weight of cotton, weighing more than 200 G/m2 )
7 Plain weave Woven Fabrics. 5209.11.00
8 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twili Woven Cotton fabrics (Unbleached) | 5209.12.00 ST
9 | Other fabrics Woven Fabrics. 5209.19.00 w7
10 | Other fabrics Woven Cotton fabrics (Dyed) canvas | 5209.39.00 | ®if@wr
11 | DENIM DENIM FABRICS. 52094200 | CTORTFI
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing less than 85% by
weight of cotton,mixed mainly or solely with man- 52.10
made fibres, weighing not more than 200 g/m2.
12 | Plain weave WOVEN FABRICS OF COTTON 5210.11.00
13 | Other fabrics Woven Fabrics. 5210.19.00
14 | Other fabrics Woven Fabrics. 5210.39.00
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing less than 85%by
weight of cotton, mixed mainly or solely with man- 52.11
made fibres, weighing more than 200 g/m2.
15 | Plain weave Woven Fabrics. 5211.11.00
16 | Other fabrics Woven Fabrics. 5211.19.00
17 | Denim Less Than Denim Fabrics 5211.42.00
18 t(\)n}i'rler fabrics of 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross Fabrics 5211.43.00
/o5 TSl do//
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CUSTOMS TARRIF 2022-2023-DESCRIPTION COMMERCIAL NAME OF THE | H.S CODE-
RAW MATERIALS: NO. T
Other woven fabrics of cotton. 52.12

19 | Unbleached Woven Fabrics. 5212.11.00
Woven pile fabrics and chenille fabrics, other than
fabrics of heading 58.02 or 58.06. 58.01

20 | Cut corduroy woven fabrics 5801.22.00
Rubberized textile fabrics, other than those of
heading 59.02. : 59.06
21 | Kanitted or crocheted woven fabrics 5906.91.00
Textile products and articles, for technical uses,
specified in Note 8 to this Chapter. 60.01
22 | "Long pile" fabrics knit fabrics (Fifoe swiafea =) 6001.10.00
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding
30 cm, containingby weight 5% or more of 02
elastomeric yarn or rubber thread, other than those 60.
of heading 60.01.
23 Containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn knitted fabrics of cotton (it swrfew
containing rubber thread is)) 6002.40.00
Other knitted or crocheted fabrics 60.06
24 | Dyed knitted fabrics of cotton 6006.22.00
25 | printed knitted fabrics of cotton 6006.24.00
ACCESSORIES
Skins and other parts of birds, with their feathers or
down, feathers and parts of feathers (whether or not
with trimmed edges) and down, not further worked 05.05
than cleaned, disinfected or treated for preservation;
powder and waste of feathers or parts of feathers.

1 | Feathers of a kind used for stuffing; down Down/Feather 0505.10.00 | zeifw
Prepared binders for foundry moulds or cores; w8
chemical products and preparations of the chemical W
or allied industries (including those consisting of 38.24 st
mixtures of natural products), not elsewhere IO |
specified or included

2 | Desiccant SUPER DRY / DESICCANT 3824.99.60

_ Polyamides in primary forms 39.08

3 | Polyamide -6,-11,-12,-6,6,-6,9,-6,10 or -6,12: PLASTIC STOPPER 3908.10.00
Self- adhesive plates , sheets, film, foil, tape strip
and other flat shapes, of plastics, whether or not in 39.19
rolls.

4 | Other VELCROQ TAPE,GUM TAPE 3919.90.99
Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of
plastics; stoppers, lids, caps and other closures, of 39.23
plastics

5 Boxes, cases, crates and similar articles POLY BAG (Printed As Per UD) 3923.21.00
Art_icles of appa_rel, clothing accessories and other 43.03
articles of furskin s

Douck down/Fur Fabric/Fake

6§ | Other down/feather 4303.90.00
Transfers (decalcomanias). 49.08

7 | Other HEAT TRANSFAR LABEL 4908.90.00

/[T #Te: da//
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COMMERCIAL NAME OF THE H.S CODE-
CUST X "
STOMS TARRIF 2022-2023-DESCRIPTION RAW MATERIALS: NO. i iE)
Cotton sewing thread, whether or not put up for retail '
sale 52.04
‘s 0 ; COTTON SEWING
8 Containing 85% or more by weight of cotton THREAD/COTTON YARN 5204.11.00
EMBROIDERY THREAD/
g | Other POLYESTER THREAD 5204.15.00
Other woven fabrics of cotton. 52.12
10_| Of yams of different colours POCKETING FABRICS 5212.14.00
Nonwovens, whether or not impregnated, coated, 56 03'
covered or laminated. )
1 FUSIBLE INTERLINING/NON 5603.91.00
Weighing not more than 25 g/m2 WOVEN FUSIBLE INTERLINING T
Rubber thread and cord, textile covered; textile yarn,
and strip and the like of heading 54.04 or 54.05, 56.04
impregnated, coated, covered or sheathed with '
rubber or plastics.
Elastic Cord /Rubber Cord -
12 | Rubber thread and cord, textile covered /Drawcord/Drawsting/ Loop Cord 5604.10.00
JELASTIC
Labels, badges and similar articles of textile
materials, in the piece, in strips or cut to shape or 58.07
size, not embroidered.
Woven Woven Loop/Puller/Patch/Badge/ EL T
13 Woven Labels 5807.10.00 s
14 Other Woven Labels / BADGE / CARE 5807.90.00  \ICT
LABEL -
Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs 58.10 ST |
15 | Of other textile materials Embroidery Patch / Badge 5810.99.00
Rubberised textile fabrics, other than those of 59.06
heading 59.02, )
16 | Reflective tape Reflective tape/piping/sewing tape 5906.99.10
17 | Other SEAM SEALING TAPE 5906.99.90
Screws, bolts, nuts, coach screws, screw hooks,
river, cotters, cotter-pins, washers (including spring 73.18
washers) and similar articles, of iron or steel.
18 | OTHER RIVETS (METAL) 7318.23.90
Stoppers, caps and lids (including crown corks,
screw caps and pouring stoppers), capsules for 83.09
bottles, threaded bungs, bung covers, seals and )
other packing accessories, of base metal
METAL STOPPER, PLASTIC
19 Other STOPPER 8309.90.99
Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage
devices, "smart cards" and other media for the
recording of sound or of other phenomena, whether 85.23
or not recorded, including matrices and masters for )
the production of discs, but excluding products of
chapter 37. '
RFID TAG imported by industrial IRC holder VAT RFID Hangtag / Waisttag/Label /
20 compliant 100% export oriented texitile industry. Sticker 8523.59.20
MY
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COMMERCIAL NAME OF THE H.S CODE-
CUSTOMS TARRIF 2022-2023-DESCRIPTION RAW MATERIALS: NO. v I
Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for
example, bells, sirens, indicator panels, burglar or 85.31 T
fire alarms), other than those of heading 85.12 or ) ST
85.30.
SECURITY TAG RFID SMART TAG T
21 | Other apparatus FOR CLOTH MANAGEMENT IN 8531.80.00 sife
PICESS/DOZEN SIS |
Slide fasteners and parts thereof. . 96.07
22 | Fitted with chain scoops of base metal Zipper/slider 9607.11.00
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