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F“‘ Cotton yarn (other than sewing thread) put up for retail sale. IS Wi 8
01 100% Cotton Yarn - Containing 85% or more by weight of cotton 5207.10.00 3of%a vifzwr
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Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted fabrics; lace in the piece, in
strips or in motifs, other than fabrics of headings 60.02 to 60.06.
01 | Net TFabrics/ Lace - Tulles and other net fabrics 5804.10.00
———— Fabrics nds - -
02 L?EZZ;;A“ Kinds 1 Fman-made fibres 5804.21.00
03 -- Of other textile materials 5804.29.00
04 - Hand-made lace 5804.30.00
Accessories:
Seff-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat shapes, of plastics, whether or not in
rolls.
01 | Heut Transfer Label/ | -Other 3919.10.00
Hologram Sticker/
02 Sticker -Other 3919.90.99
Other plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of plastics, non-cellular and not
reinforced, laminated, supported or similarly combined with other materials.
03 | Heat Transfer Label/ | - Other 3920.10.90
Hologram Sticker/
S[lC'kCl’ . i i SRR S
Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of plastics; stoppers, TR
lids, caps and other closures, of plastics. 9 i
>las bbi ins: Sliver/spinni 40.10 e
04 I ‘lsmFl:griclsn Lace | -- Bobbins: Sliver/spinning can 3923.40.1 (CTSRF
Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading No0s.39.01 to 39.14 Sl
05 Mobilon Tape - Other 3926.20.90
(Plastic)/ Plastic
06 Stoper/Plastic Hook/ | ™ Other 3926.90.99
Plasiic Bone/Plastic
Bukle/ String &
Seal/Ring Slider
(Plastic) For RMG
Paper, paperboard, cellulose wadding and webs of cellulose fibres,coated,
impregnated, covered, surface-coloured, surface-decorated or printed, in rolls or
rectangular (including square) sheets, of any size, other than goods of the kind
described in heading 48.03, 48.09 or 48.10.
07 | Printed Paper Sticker | --- Other 4811.41.90
08 For RMG T Other 4811.49.00
Cartons, boxes, cases, bags and other packing containers, of paper, paperboard, cellulose wadding or
webs of cellulose fibres; box files, letter trays, and similar articles, of paper or paperboard of a kind
___t used in offices, shops or the like.
09 | Carton (Al Kinds) - Box tiles, letter trays, storage boxes and similar articles, of a kind 4819.60.00
Boxes/ Paperboard/ used in offices, shops or the like
L1 Baggage
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Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not printed.

10 | Paper Hangtag/ - Printed 4821.10.00

Paper Price Tag/

Paper Price Ticket

Twine, cordage, ropes and cables, whether or not plaited or braided and whether or not impregnated,
coated, covered or sheathed with rubber or plastics.

1T} String/ String Seal/ -- Other 5607.29.00
Plastic Tag - Of polyethyiene or polypropylene

12 -- Other 5607.49.90
Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow fabrics consisting of warp without
weft assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs).

13 | Satin Ribon/ Paper -- Of cotton 5806.31.00
Ribon/ Ribbon (All -- Of man-made fibres

14 | Kinds)/Elastic --- Other 5806.32.90
Braids in the piece; ornamental trimmings in the piece, without embroidery, other than knitted or
crocheted; tassels, pompons and similar articles.

15 | Snap Tape - Braids, in the piece 5808.10.00

16 -Others 5808.90.00
Woven fabrics of metal thread and woven fabrics of metallised yarn of heading 56.05, of a kind used
in apparel, as furnishing fabrics or for similar purposes, not elsewhere specified or included. 58,10
Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs

17 | Embroidery Badge/ - Embroidery without visible ground 5810.10.00
Embroidery (All - Other embroidery

18 | Kinds) -- Of cotton 5810.91.00

19 -- Of other textile materials 5810.99.00
Textile fabrics, impregnated, coated, covered or laminated with plastics,
other than those of heading 59.02.

- With polyvinyl chloride:

20 Iv|'1_lerlm|ng (Al --- Other 5903.90.90 il Foa
I\IndS) € w
Rubberized textile fabrics, other than those of heading 59.02. o :

21 | Snap Tape/ Tape - Adhesive tape of a width not exceeding 20 cm 5906.10.00 TOTT

- Other
2 ~Knitted or crocheted 3906.97.00 | et |
n -- Other

23 -- Other 5906.99.90
Brassieres, girdles, corsets, brace, suspenders, garters and similar articles and parts thereof, whether
or not knitted or crocheted.

24 | BraCup/ Collar Bon | - Girdles and panty-girdies 6212.20.00

35| Inser ~Ofthers 6212.90.00
Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the like, of base metal, of a
kind used for clothing or clothing accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches, books, awnings,
leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other made up articles; tubular or bifurcated rivets, of
base metal; beads and spangles, ol base metal.

26 | Stopper; - Hooks. eves and eyelets 8308.10.00
Metal Stoper/ Metal - - -

27 Hook/Metal Badge - Other, including parts 8308.90.00
Buckles/ Metal
Lyelet/Hook (Metal)/

String & Seal/ Metal
Clip/Metal Buckle
Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, "smart cards" and other media for the recording
of sound or of other phenomena, whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the
roduction of discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37.
28 | RFID Hangtag/ --- Proximity Cards and tags 8523.59.10
o RFID Price Tag/ - - -

29 --- RFID TAG imported by Industrial [RC holder VAT compliant 8523.59.20

RFID Label . L

100% export- oriented textile industry
Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells, sirens, indicator panels, burgiar or
fire alarms), other than those of heading 85.12 or 85.30,

30 | Security Label/ - Burglar or fire alarms and similar apparatus 8531.10.00
Super Tack/ Tag/

31 Woven Label (All) - Other apparatus 8531.80.00

32 - Parts 8531.90.00
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Slide fasteners and parts thereof.
- Slide fasteners:

33 | Zipper (Al Kinds)/ -- Fitted with chain scoops of base metal 9607.11.00
Zipper Puller/ Snap

34 Fasteners/ Slide -- Other 9607.19.00

35 | Fastener - Parts 9607.20.00

oV | FOE TRIFS IS MRLIR BT TR-08 TS obr T S TN FARIES A7 | @/
e wgww
AT s YT ARG, [ Tats <o @I q ]
TR (1 el ffics, eIA ST (58 W)

@a/s , GG STFH @G, (NFFIH, ARG | TR T @
R =R- Q(Sa)si/w-w/ﬂﬁz/wﬁ fermemat/ 2050 ] IQQ{W Q’ ﬁ) Sifie—1 /0q/3033 &

S T SIS @ ST S G (TSI NI 7F) 8

3-Y | IR, FEBT T, BT/ 5AN/ TIFTAR/TeE/ ARG (I , BIFY/ANS, (TG, B |
Q) IR, SR I8 JRHHIEG , 5T |

r-d3 | B/ e, REPres, e, v/, sBan/ghe 3R, Fhe/amiet 2hes,
AP /AT G, (O, ARG |
o BB qqifes, FEEI 98 IRHEEE, 61T |

81 fra B, SRrmRE, SO I SRS , TR (SRR TRMCER W 99eied &) | @// W
FRov

[ T2 Qi RT3 |
TR B (B3 WTe)
6l SR T @B




AR R-¢(30)83/IT-T/eM1Ze/ 2059/ © DO

/] Bt R-04//
feiETSR

/
¥
7

IREACHH B

JIFC I& SR
08Y /> TAHAIAST, BIFT |

www.cbc.gov.bd

wifir: 0@./50/{0{0

o>, i afodmaz A : TaT TP A Fise,
féra : @a/> GG GARN @re, Ffdmte, TRmwE |
o}, TCARCHE RGO . : 3¢o/IF-FHTEFT/050 ©Ifd: v /0b /050 R |
ov. TRRFAR ST : dosdoobbbe, SIfF: 30/03/3053 e
TR m s - : 0003V Y48E-090¢ OIFL: 03/0n/205> By |
08. P TS ARAGT S o1 3o T -3¢ 8 20 TR ASHTAT #1°1y toATS IILE ISR T
8 IZF.G.(FIGHZ IS ARG WA 53 ey Srat 3ar 7o ¢
w BCT 20-21 Gewas FoTaiees et qZ5, G, (BT FIBTICTE A A 2 Sa
® W et
AR
Vulcanised rubber thread and cord. 4007.00.00 Vulcanised Rubber Thread , Cord,
1 Plates, sheets, strip, rods and profile shapes, of Rubber Thread.
vulcanised rubber other than hard rubber
2 | Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage 8523.59.10 Security, Super tag-VST, Security
devices, "smart cards" and other media for the Aalarm Tag for garments accessories
recording of sound or of other phenomena, Parts,
whether or not recorded, including matrices and Rfid Hang Tag, Rfid Price Tag, Rfid
masters for the production of discs, tag & Label.
but excluding products of Chapter 37.
---Proximity Cards and tags (Security Label)
3 | Gimped yarn, and strip and the like of heading | 5606.00.00 Coated, covered or sheathed with
54.04 or 54.05, gimped (other than those of rubber or plastics. DRAWSTRING)
heading 56.05 and gimped horsehair yarn);
chenilie yarn (including flock chenille yarn); loop
wale-yarn. Twine, cordage, ropes and cables,
whether or not plaited or braided and whether or
not impregnated, coated, covered or sheathed
with rubber or plastics Of sisal or other textile
fibres of the genus Agave (DRAWSTRING)
4 | Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs Embroidery fabrics Of textile (In The
-- Of other textile materials 5810.99.00 piece)
5 | Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, Machanically Made Band Lace in
knitted or crocheted Piece of other Tixtile materials
fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs,
other than fabrics of A deog @
headings 60.02 to 60.06. e sifem
-- Of other textile materials 5804.29.00 CATSIT |
1] Rubber thread and cord, textile covered; textile Rubber Thread & cord (Textile
yarn, and strip and the like Covered)
of heading 54.04 or 54.05, impregnated, coated,
covered or sheathed with
rubber or plastics.
- Rubber thread and cord, textile covered 5604.10.00
7 | Other plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of Transper Heat Seal/Wrapping
plastics, non-cellular and not Film/HDPE Film
reinforced, laminated, supported or similarly
combined with other materials.
--- Non-printed cast polypropylene film 3920.20.20
8 | Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of Rubber thread, Elastic, Elastic Tape,
heading 58.07; narrow fabrics Printed Elastic, Rubber Elastic,
consisting of warp without weft assembled by
means of an adhesive
(bolducs). .
- Other woven fabrics, containing by weight 5% | 5806.20.00
or more of elastomeric yarn or
rubber thread
9 | Other plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of Heat Transfer Label/Seat of plastic
plastics, non-cellular and not
reinforced, laminated, supported or similarly
combined with other materials. 3920.10.90
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10 | Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of Satin Ribbon Woven,

heading 58.07; narrow fabrics

consisting of warp without weft assembled by
means of an adhesive 5806.39.00
(bolducs).

-- Of other textile materials

11 | Travel sets for personal toilet, sewing or shoe or | 9606.21.00,

. I oo 8
clothes cleaning. Buttons, press-fasteners, snap- w7 512
fasteners and press-studs, button moulds and T |
other parts of these articles; button blanks. Of Buttoen (Plastic Metal)
plastics not covered with textile material, ;
Travel sets for personal toilet, sewing or shoe or | 9606.22.00
clothes cleaning. Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-
fasteners and press-studs, button moulds and
other parts of these articles; button blanks. Of a
base metal, not covered with textile material
o¢. Zrornd wfiTs 98T R-08, ot 8 ob ARG AT |
[ © C
| Vs "
AT . Il AR [ %31 ¥FTi© |
€9/ GTBH G e, Fritrter, SrHeTiE | IR AT | Ay
AR R-¢(59)8/FF-IG/IZ/009/ DDV N N L ave i@ /0/20%0 R

SR R SRS 8 ArER SRR & ( S AP -T) 8

> TS, TR, (251 1 ST (97 8 8¢ &), Qv9/y, . @w, FrmEePE-3800 |

b, JIOEAR, FECT ATH, BIFT/ ORI/ IR/ TR/ SEFAE (F5TF) 51/ FETIG , 5RA/ strvdhe,
NG , DI |

5. HfSRE FHEEAT, IR IS FHRNFIIG, 513 |

Yo,  FiCOT WRIFTG, IR0 I FRMIEE, BT | BRRS SRy 30 IRAIGT SRR 4R IR0 R SR B2 |

-, B/ I, feRfPrers, e, vrel/smEeT Eitere, AR /FRree R/ 2fnee, st/
e 2fee 3w /Bear 2ftes, M/ eiarem wRwa, fFie, SRR |

.  Praf sfiram, S5 38 IRMEEE, v (IR v W w1 we) |

&

17 v
(g oy
o« % o



sfeeerrod) AIET AP
FPBUT 4 SAEWITEE
08a/y, (lgs ATIb!, HIF-do00 |

/71 w2-08//

byt sifedEa A e em 3 aEI @ 51 fementdl FficGs,
@9/, UG U (ITe, (NAaIZe, Fifardatey, TAMENE

o AE AEE A g wifad 3 ) CfER-afaLia®/o b0 wiffd. o

oot 9 fTaEe Ae-2508500b b @ wifad so/02/2033

081 4% ﬂl“imm?i oyl Ae-03-07 G 3¢ 8 20 e ety Cofare qjaz SR 7 qrad A, Az
| @rerz ¢ siifefes afde il ool facm Brerd sl 2T 5

[z | o wﬂﬁ‘%{mﬂ“”M'a'fﬁw"f”‘ﬁnﬁv” T sosssose | %, @ @i |

i

!

] i
‘

¢

ONTAINING 837

: D)((iNlMNlN(\

wﬁ' el @ 3GI6R
sﬁm (olqs

3309 11,00 TO %300.99.00

308 7100 TO 508 3900
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i Poly Bag

7 Gum Tape/SkotchTape {except electric insufation tape)
i 2 iron Seal
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| Elastic/Eiastic Binder

327 [ Hanger

33 Plastic Stoper, Metal Stoper

Orawstring/drawcord

Price Tickei

Back Board

Metal Clip/metal Chain

Lace

Cartton

Hangtag, Stiker/Barcode

Hooks

Rivets

Buckle
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T 83080000
TEBT1.00.00 f””_" )

T 15 G000 T

T 739262000, 39269099
TT83099060 T
Tha023900 0 .
- ’"43'27-)’6’%6"”

0392306 T T
0. 39199006 |

T

482390 ¢

8
%
g
I
X
¥
g
g
Kl
:
£l
i
g
E
o~
5?

i

(o) feHig sfels 33MB/amis Tog SOV fooflta aw 2 orpet weliific s1es 55t 274 &3 5 93

BTG/ R0a SIfEE/a0 41w FTT qoF A3y e FACS 20

r

(02) gfevieTa 136 TBMRG/am W0xg Borpad iy BT S AR ) IR 93 GG/ TSI
S FBfAG/S0e R 41 ACE A | OF 3O erea Beslifs ool gagfan @ Sy AT Cwq
TSP APl A0 21 BeoAllrS Aty yiiarad cwom s el R e mm o1, 25

FI0O 9

M%

Kb R i (I EY AT

AT AT BT
A 45 <F'5Y‘T'(FC~ ey

.gﬁf‘!l‘ﬂ ?G
e

XL
- zfa-xrrm-cz%
e f3yeT, BT

¢

i
)
i




/[ oo /I
So O A FRETA= AT
\ & PRI TG FRAAES
©85/>, (TG, B |

www.cbc.gov.bd.

AR T -¢(50) 8Y/FTHA-TT/eAIRe /(A [GEIEITALNY /U 2% Si- 2 [ os/R0%a R
03 | T AECI AN ¢ fow ¢ T e ] e
N ¢a/, ST CAFTH @S, CIMNZE, =i | ,
oy | TS AIEH R ¢S 8 Seox /A @t R OfF/20v0 T th.ou.0%0 R
ov| TG FREIR e B ¢ 3055000 SIS 59.02.3033 R :
08 | I ARCIR [G81w 1 Afefe WHT -3¢ ¢ R0 (TSI SRR e @ @25, 997, (FTe fry Srad Fa e
T 3 o %P, G AR AR
LW e . e AR
01. | BraCup : — 6212.90.00 - o
Elastic Lace , Elastic Tape, Elastic Band, Lace , Lace =
02. | Faprics, Raw Rubber. 5804.29.00 IR et
Metal Eyelet, Metal Hook, Bra Wire ( nylon & metal ),
03. Ring & Slider ( nylon & metal ), Hook & Eye . 8308.10.00
04. | Slider, Snap, Fastener 9607.20.00
String & Séal , Sequins, Pom Pom Ball, Bow or Knot,
05 Bone, Sticker for Placement Print 6217.10.00
06. | Paper Box / Multi Box ' - 4819.10.00
07. | Drawstring 4202.22.00
08. | Satin Tape 5808.90.00
09. | Ring, Socked , Stud for Buttons. 9606.10.00
10. | Fusing Interlining of textile material. 5903.10.10
11. | Rivets of iron or steel : 7318.23.90
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