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I
All Kind of Cotton fabric

Woven fabrics of cotton containing 85%o ot more by weight
of cotton weighing not more than200 glmz
3-thread or 4-thread twill- includins cross twill

5208.13.00

2.

All Kind of woven fabrrc

Woven fabrics of cotton containing 85Yo or more by weight
of cotton weighing not more than200 {m2
Other Fabrics. Dyed. Other Fabrics. Of yams of different
colours.

s208.29.00

J. Woven Fabric/ Twill fabric Woven fabrics of cotton containing 85Yo or more by weight
of cotton weighing not more than200 g/m2

3-thread or 4- thread twill including cross twill

5208.33.00

4.
All Kind of AOP printed

fabric

Woven fabrics of cotton containing 85Yo or more by weight
of cotton weighing not more than200 glmz

Other Fabrics. Dyed. Other Fabrics. Of yarns of different
colours

s208.39.00

5. Woven Fabric Woven fabrics of cotton containing 85%o or more by weight
of cotton weighing not more than200 glm2

Plain weave. weishins more than t00 s/n2

5208.42.00

6. All Kind of woven fabric Woven fabrics of cotton containing 85o/o ot more by weight
of cotton weighing more than 200 glmz. Other fabrics.

Dved

s209.29.00

7. All Kind of woven fabrrc Woven fabrics of cotton containing 85%o or more by weight
of cotton weishine more than 200 slmz. Plain weave.

5209.31.00

8. Woven Fabric Woven fabrics of cotton containing 85oh or more by weight
of cotton weighing more than 200 g/m'
3-thread or 4- thread twill including cross twill

s209.32.00

9. Woven Fabric Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85Yo or more by

weight of cotton, weighing {nore than 200 g/m2

Other fabrics of yarnsof different colours.

s209.39.00

10. All kind of woven fabrrc Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85%o ot more by

weight of cotton, weighing more than 200 glm2. Other

fabrics, Of yarns of different colours. Denim

5209.42.00

ll All Kind of Woven fabric Woven fabrics of cotton containing less than 85%by
weight of cotton,mixed mainly or solely with man-made

fibres, weighing not more than 20Q g/m-.8!ql!ly9gy9-

5210.31.00
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12. All kind of Denim fabric ffin, containing less than 85o/o or more by

weight of cotton, mixed mainly or solely with man-made
foL,i^o .'reiohino nnt more than 211slm'. Denim

521r.42.00

5212.11.00
13. Woven Fabric Other woven fabrics of cotton. Wetghmg not more tnan

200s.1m2. Unbleached

14. All Kind of
Flannel fabric

Othe, *"""" f"brics of cotton. Weighing not more than

?oOo/rn2 F)ved

52r2.t3.00

5309.19.00
15. All Kind of Linen fabric Woven fabrics of flax, contamtng u)7o or more Dy werglrt or

Tl^- f\+Lar
5403.41.00

16. All Kind of Viscose
fabric

Artificial filament yarn (other than sewlng tnreaor, not put uP

for retail sale, including artificial monofilament of less than 67

'lonifav f)f rriscoqe rrvon-
5407.44.00

17. Woven Fabric Woven fabrics of synthetic ttlament yarn, mcluolng wovelr

fabrics obtained from materials of heading54'04' Printed'

Other woven fabrics, containing 85% or more by weight of
fexfired nolvester fi laments:

18. All Kind of Polyester
fabric

h

Wo"e, Atrict of synthetic filament yam, including woven

fabrics obtained from materials of heading54'04' Woven

fabrics obtained from high tenacity yarn of nylon or other

polyamides or of polyesters. Containing 85% or more by
.,,oi-Lt ^f fpvfrrred nolvesfer filaments

5407 .61.00

ss 14.30.00
19. Woven Fabric Woven fabric of synthetic staple tlbres, conmmmg less uralr

85%by weight of such fibres, mixed mainly or solely with

cotton, of a iveight exceeding 170 glmz of yarnsof different

colours.

20. All Kind of Rayon
Fabric

ffiial staple fibres. Containing 85%o or

more bv weieht of artificial staple fibres' Dyed

5s 16.12.00

21 All Kind of Mesh Fabric Trtt"s;.rd 
"th". 

ret fabrics not including woven knitted or

crocheted fabrics lace in the piece in strips or in motifs other

than fabrics of headings 60.02 to 60.06 Tulles and other net
f^t.-i^"

5804.10.00

5804.29.00
22. All Kind of Lace fabric Tulles and other net tabrtcs not lncludmg woven Knltrcu or

crocheted fabrics lace in the piece in strips or in motifs other

than fabrics of headings 60.02 to 60.06 of other textile

'.ofo*ialc
5902.10.00

23. All Kind of Nylon Fabric Tyre cord fabric of high tenacity yarn ot nylon or omer

^ll.,o-ir{oo Pnlweqfers or viscose ravon. Other
6002.40.00

24. Knit Fabric Knitted or crocheted fabric of a wldth not exceeomg ru srr'

containing by weight 5o/o or more of elastomeric yarn or rub!9r

thread, otf,.itt urittose of headin$ 60.01' Containing by weight
1o/^ an -^,a nf clqcfnrneric varn containins rubber thread,

6003.10.00
25. All Kind of Wool fabric Knified or crocheted tabrtcs ot a wldtn not exceeorng ru urrr

other than those of heading 60.01o1 60.02' Of wool or fine
o-i*ol hqir

6003.30.00
26. All Kind of Synthetic

fabric
Knitted or CrOcheted tabncs ot a wldtn not exceeqlng ru sur

^drar rhan thnce nf hendino 60-01. or 60.02 of synthetic fibres
6004.90.00

27.

-,r

All Kind of Spandex
fabric

Knitted or crocheted tabnc of a wldtn exceeomg rv sIIr'

containing by weight 5%o ot more of elastomeric yarn or rubber
rr.-^^,r ^+Lo- denoa ^f hcorlino 6O 01 Other
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28. All Kind of ltuit

Fabric
Other knitted or crocheted fabrics. Of yarns of different colours. 6006.33.00

Accessories :

0l DESICCANT Prepared binders for foundry moulds or cores; chemical product
and preparations of the chemical or allied industries (including
those consisting of mixtures of natural products), not elsewhere
specified or included. Desiccant. Other.

3824.99.60

02 Seam Tape Other plates, steels, film, foil and strip, of plastics, non-cellular
and not reinforced, laminated, supported or similarly combined
with other materials. Of polymers of ethylene. Other. Of polymers
ofpropylene.

3920.10.90

03 All kind of price
ticket

Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of headings
Nos.39.0 I to 39. 14.Other

3926.20.99

04 Elastic Tape Twine, cordage, ropes and cables, whether or not plaited or
braided and whether or not impregnated, coated, covered or
sheathed with rubber or plastics. Other

s607.2t.00

05 Elastic Twine, cordage, ropes and cables, whether or not plaited or
braided and whether or not impregnated, coated, covered or
sheathed with rubber or plastics. Other

5607.29.00

06 StSring Twine, cordage,ropes and cables,whether or not plaited or braidad
and whether or not impregnated,coated,covered or sheathed with
rubber or plastics. Other

s607.90.00

07 Embroidery
LacelPatch

Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs. Embroidery
without visible sround.

5810.10.00

08 Nerrow woven Tape Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow
fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an
adhesive (bolducs). Other

s806.32.90

09 All kind of Interlining Textile fabrics, impregnated, coated, covered or laminated with
plastics, other than those of heading 59.02. With polyvinyl
chloride. Fusing interlining materials (textile materials for
stiffenins cuffs and collars). Other

s903.10. r 0

l0 All kind of Interlining Textile fabrics, impregnated, coated, covered or laminated with
plastics, other than those of heading 59.02. With polyvinyl
chloride. Fusing interlining materials (textile materials for
stiffenins cuffs and collars). Other

5903.20.90

ll Super Tack Nails,tack,srawingpins,corrugatednails,staples(other than those of
heading83.05)and similar articles,of iron or steel,whether or not
with heads of other material, but e4cluding such articles with head
ofcoooer. i

7317.00.00
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Proximity Cards and
Tags

Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage
devices, "smart cards" and other media for the
recording ofsound or ofother phenomena,
whether or not recorded, including matrices and
masters for the production of discs, but excluding
products of Chapter 37, Others

8s23.s9. l 0

{6lRqIq"E s
nBfu-{ EIRa

mlqr<-O

2 RFID TAG
imported by
industrial IRC
holder VAT
compliant 100%
export-oriented
textile industry

Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage
devices, o'smart cards" and other media for the
recording of sound or of other phenomena,
whether or not recorded, including matrices and
masters for the production of discs, but excluding
products of Chapter 37,Others

8523.s9.20
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0l Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton,
Plain weave weighting not more than l00g/m2-yam of Different
Colors

5208.41.00

Require
ment As
per UD

& Export
LIC

02 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton,
Plain weave weighting not more than l00g/m2-Printed

5208.51.00

03 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton,
Plain weave weighting not more than 200glm2-Dyed

s209.31.00

04 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton,
3-thread or 4 thread twill, including cross twill-weighting more than
200glm}-Dyed

s209.32.00

05 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton,
Plain weave weighting not more than2}}glm2-Printed

5209.51 .00

06 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of cotton, containing less than 85% by weight of cotton,
3 or 4 thread twill, including cross twill-Mixed mainly or solely with
man made fibers, weighting not more than 200glm2-Dyed

5210.32.00

07 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of flax, unbleached or bleached-containing 85% or
more by weight of flax

5309. r 1.00

08 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of flax, containing 85o/o or more b1, u'eight of flax,
other

s309.29.00

09 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yam, Dyed-containing 85% or
more by weight of textured polyester filaments

5407.52.00

10 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yam, printed - containing 85% or
more by weight of textured polyester filaments.

5407.54.00

1l Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of artificial filament yam, dyed - containing 85% or
more by weight of artificial filament or strip or the like.

5408.22.00

t2 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of artificial filament yam, yam of different colours -
containing 85% or more by weight of artificial filament or strip or the
1ike5408.23.00

5408.23.00

13 Woven fabrics Wovdn fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing 85% or more by
weight of synthetic staple fibres, Containing 85o/o or more by weight of
polyester staple fibres, unbleached or bleached

5512.1 1.00

l4 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing 85% or more by
weight of synthetic staple fibres, other

5512.19.90

15 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of Synthetic staple fiber, containing less than 85% by
weight of such, mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight not
exceeding l70g/m2, Dyed - of polyester staple fiber, plain weave

55 13.21.00

t6 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of Synthetic staple fiber, containing less than 85% by
weight of such , mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight not
exceeding l70glm2, Dyed - Other woven fabrics of polyester staple
fibres

5513.23.00

t7 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of Synthetic staple fiber, containing less than 85%by
weight of such, mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight not
exceeding 170 glmZ, yam of different colours - of polyester staple
fiber, plain weave

5513.31 .00
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18 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of Synthetic staple fiber, containing less than 85o/oby

weight of such, mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight not

exceeding 170 !m2, Dyed - of polyester staple fiber, plain weave

5514.21.00

Require
ment As
per UD

& Export
LIC

l9 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of Synthetic staple fiber, containing less than 85o/oby

weight of such, mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight not

exceeding 170 glm2, Dyed 3-Thread or 4-Thread twill, including cross

twill

ss14.22.00

20 Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of Synthetic staple flber, containing less than 85% by

weight of such, mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight not

exceeding 170 g/mZ, Dyed - yam of Different Colours

55 14.30.00

2t Woven fabrics Woven fabrics of Synthetic staple fiber, containing less than 85% by

weight of such, mixed mainll' or solely rvith cotton, of a weight not

exceeding 17O glm2, Printed - 3- Thread or 4-Thread trvill, including

cross twill

5514.42.00

22 Woven fabrics Other Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibers, Mixed mainly or solely

with viscose rayon staple fibers - of polyester staple fibers
5515.11.00

23 Woven fabrics Other Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibers, Mixed mainly or solely

with man made filaments - of acrylic or modacrylic staple fibers
5515.21.00

24 Knit fabrics Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30cm, containing

by weight 5o/o or more of elastomeric yarn or rubber thread, other than

those pf heading 60.01 . Containing by weight 5Yo or more of
elastomeric yarn containing rubber thread.

6002.40.00

25 Knit fabrics Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width exceeding 30cm, containing by

weight 5%o or more of elastomeric yarn or rubber thread, other those of
heading 60.01 . Containing by weight 5o/o or more of elastomeric yarn

containing rubber thread.

6004.10.00

26 Knit fabrics Other knitted or crocheted fabrics of cotton, Dyed 6006.22.00

27 Knit fabrics Other knitted or crocheted fabrics, Dyed 6006.32.00

Accessories
28 RFID Taes Proximity cards and tags 8523.59.10

29 Clothing
Accessories

Other made up clothing accessories; parts of garments or of clothing
accessories, other than those of heading 62.12

6217.t0.00

30 Plastic / Metal
Washer

Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button moulds

and other parts of these articles ; button blanks, other
9606.29.00
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Yearly
Import

Entitlement
I Woven Fabrics

of cotton
Woven Fabrics of cotton, Containing
mixed mainly or solely with man-nrade fibres. rveighing nol ror. than 200
g/m2, plain *"ur".

5210.41.00

Requiren:ent
of Export
L/C & UD

I

i
I

i

I

I

I

I

I
I

I

I

I
I
I

,

2 Denim Fabrics Woven Fabrics of cotton, Contai
mixed mainly or solely u'ith man-nride fibr"s, weighiirg mo.re than 20a lmz,
Denim.

5211.42.00

3 Cotton Fabrics Woven Fabrics of cotton, Con
u'eighing not more than 200 g/m2. prain rveave, weighing riore tlran too e/m2

5208.42.00

4 Cotton Fabrics Woven Fabrics of cotton, Containing
m.ixed mainly or solely witlr man-mide ,ibrrs, vreighing nol rorc than 200
g/m', Dyed

52 t r.3l .00

5 Knit Fabrics Other knitted or crochCiea fabrlcs, D!7 6006.42.00
6 Cotton Fabrics Woven Fabrics of cotton, Containing @

weighing more than 200 glnf , plain weave
5209. r t.00

7 Conon Fabrics Woven Fabrics of cotton, Contain
mixed mainly or solely rvith man-made fibres. rveighing mire than 20a !m2 ,
Plain weave

52 r r.5 t.00

8 Viscose rayon
Fabrics

Woven fabrics of artificial filanrent
from materials of heading 54.05, \\,oven I'abrics obiained from high tenacity
)'arn of viscose rayon.

5408. r 0.00

9 Trvill Fabrics Woven Fabrics of cotton, Containing
werghing not more than 200 g/m2 . 3-thread or 4-threid twiil, including cross
twill

5208.33.00

t0 Synthetic Fabrics Woven Fabrics ofsynthetic filanrcnt yam
from rnaterials of heading 54.04,other $,oven flabrics containing g5olo or more
by weight of Synthetic filaments, printed

540',7.74.00

Accessories

ll

Metal Beads. lvletal
Buckle, O Ring, D
Ring

CIasps, li"ames with clasps, buckles
the like, of base metal of a kind used lor ctothing or clothing acceisories,
footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches, books, awnings, leather goods, travel
goods or saddlery or for other made up articles; tubular or bifurcated rivets, of
base metal; beads and spangles, of base nretal, other, including parts.

8308.90.00

t2 Elastic / elastic
binder

Narrow woven fabrics. other than goo
consisting of rvarp rvithout rveft assembled by nreairs olan adhesive
(bolducs), other woven fabrics, contai'ing by rveigtrt 5oZ or more of
elastomeric yam or rubber thread.

5806.20.00

t3 Hanger Loop /
Plastic Loop /Satirl
mobilon upe

Narrorv woven fabrics, other than good@
consisting of warp without we{l assenbled by means of an adhesive
(bolducs), other woven fabrics, containing b1, neight 5rZ or more of
elastomeric yarn or rubber thread, other.

5806.32.90

t4 Metal bar, plate 9606.22.00

l5

Heat seal Label

other plates, sheeh, film, foi! and strip, of plastiCI. non-ceilurar and not
reinforced, laminated, supported or sinrilarly cornhined with other materials,
in printed fory!. 3920.20. t 0
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! Button of Press
I

BCT lc>u-lo>bq-{qfiG-fr

Embroidery ,n ,nr Ot".t s8 r 0.99.00

Safety pins & othei Sewing needles

Tj"r]T,lIil.t.r, for.ule in lhe hand,.of iron or sreel, safety pins ana otrcrpins of.iron or steel, not etseufiere specified 
", 

i,rrl;l;l:3;;,i pi*'*a
other pins.

7319.40.00

.Man/Woman Shirts
pocket fitted \yith
plastic Beads.

Othcr made up.
accqssories. other than those of head ing 62.l i. acccssories.

62t?.t0.00

Arlicles of apparel und .,ot
leatheq other clothing accessoiies

Stoppers, cap
stoppers), capsules for bottles, threaded bungs. bung, .or"rr, ,"i, .na oth.,packing accessories, of.base metal, Other.

press-studs and parts therefore

Buttons, press
other parts of these articres, bunon branks. fr!.r-t ttrn.;r, ;;il-i;ners and

Plastic beads Otherarticler of p
to 39.14. Statuettes and other ornamentat articles

3926.40.00

S.v, Alarm/ Tag Electric rorn

lfl*,lr paners, burgrar oi nr. u-irmr), oir,ritr,- rd;;iffiing as.rz o,85.30, Parts.

8531.90.00

Narrgry woven

":f::j::_".1ff?_yil!"rt weft asiemurLeo uy means of an adhesive (bolducs)
, .fabri 

cs co n s ist i n g o f rva rp rv i th o u t t". ft ; JJ;ffi ilffi ;"i ;;"rffi $:(bolducs)
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