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1 Metal Chain §|ide fa§tener§ and parts thereof. 9607.11.00
-- Fitte d with chain scoops of base metal
Sewing needles, knitting needles, bodkins, crochet hooks,
5 Sewing needles, embroidery stilettos and similar articles, for use in the hand, of | 7319.90.00
knitting needles iron or steel; safety pins and other pins of iron or steel, not
elsewhere specified or included.
Paper and paperboard, coated on one or both sides with kaolin
(China clay) or other inorganic substances, with or without a
3 Multi-ply binder, and with no other coating, whether or not surface- 4810.92.00
coloured, surface-decorated or printed, in rolls or rectangular
(including square) sheets, of any size.
4 Bobbins, spools, cops and similar supports of paper pulp, paper 4822.10.00
Paper Hanger _ or paperboard (whether or not perforated or hardened). 4822.90.00
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1 Drawcords Twine, cordage, ropes and cables, whether or not plaited or braided --Other 5607.90.00
and whether or not impregnated, coated, covered or sheathed with
rubber or plastics.
2 Neck Tape Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow -- Imported by 5806.32.10
fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an industrial IRC holder
adhesive (bolducs). VAT compliant satin
ribbon
3 Rubber Label Articles of apparel and clothing accessories (including gloves, mittens -- Other 4015.90.00
and mitts), for all purposes, of vulcanised rubber other than hard
rubber.
4 Hangtag String/Cotton . . --- Other 4821.90.90
String Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not printed.
5 sLace/ Fabrics Lace Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or -Hand-made lace 5804.30.00
crocheted
fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other than fabrics of --Of other textile 5804.29.00
materials
Headings 60.02 to 60.06. --Of man-made fibres 5804.21.00
6 Security tag/Alarm Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, "smart cards" --- RFID TAG 8523.59.20
tag/Alarm and other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena, imported by Industrial
Button/Chips whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the IRC holder VAT
production of discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37. compliant 100%
exportoriented
textile industry
7 Tag pin/Safety Pin Sewing needles, knitting needles, bodkins, crochet hooks, embroidery | - Other 7319.90.00
stilettos and similar articles, for use in the hand, of iron or steel; -- Safety pins and 7319.40.00
safety other pins
pins and other pins of iron or steel, not elsewhere specified or
included.
Nails, tacks, drawing pins, corrugated nails, staples (other than those 7317.00.00
of heading 83.05) and similar articles, of iron or steel, whether or not
with heads of other material, but excluding such articles with heads of
copper.
8 Snap Button Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button --Other 9606.29.00
moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks. -Press-fasteners, snap- | 9606.10.00
fasteners and press-
L studs and parts
! therefore
9 Twill Tape Other made up clothing accessories; parts of garments or of clothing -Accessories 6217.10.00
accessories, other than those of heading 62.12.
10 Valvat/Velcro Tape Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat shapes, | Self adhesive tape in 3919.90.00
rolls exceeding 20cm
imported by Industrial
IRC holder
of plastics, whether or not in rolls. VAT compliant 3919.10.00
manufacturers
-—-Other 3919.90.99
Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow --- Other 5806.32.90
fabrics .
consisting of warp without weft assemoled by means of an adhesive *
(bolducs).
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11 Heat Seal Label Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow Other 3919.90.99
fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an
adhesive (bolducs).
12 Mobilon Tape Labels, badges and similar articles of textile materials, in the piece, in -Other 5807.90.00
strips or cut to shape or size, not embroidered.
13 Ribon/Label Labels, badges and similar articles of textile materials, in the piece, in -Woven 5807.10.00
strips or cut to shape or size, not embroidered.
14 Lycra Yarn Synthetic filament yarn (other than sewing thread), not put up for —Elastometric 5402.44.00
retail
sale, including synthetic monofilament of less than 67 decitex. Other, of nylon or 5402.45.00
. other polyamides
15 Rubber Thread and Synthetic filament yarn (other than sewing thread), not put up for -Other 5402.49.00
Elastic retail sale, including synthetic monofilament of less than 67 decitex.
16 Clip Otbher articles of iron or steel. —-other. 7326.90.90
17 Hologram Sticker Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat shapes, | Self adhesive tape in 3919.90.10
rolls exceeding 20cm
imported by Industrial
IRC holder
VAT compliant
manufacturers
of plastics, whether or not in rolls. - Other 3919.10.90
18 Heat Transfer Sticker | Esters of other inorganic acids of non-metals (excluding esters of
hydrogen halides) and their salts; their halogenated, sulphonated,
r nitrated or nitrosated derivatives.
Polymers of ethylene, in primary forms. - Other 3926.20.90
- Polyethylene having a specific gravity of less than 0.94
Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading --- Plastic coil used as | 3926.90.10
Nos. 39.01 to 39.14. contraceptive and coil
inserter
19 Puller with Metal
badge, Plastic/Metal ¢ ” i . %
Ring, Buckle, Plastic 1(\;the; 9agtllctles3 gfll‘)tlastlcs and articles of other materials of heading —-Other 3926.90.99
Sil String (as RMG 08370210372
Accessories)
20 Rubber Patch/Label Articles of apparel and clothing accessories (including gloves, mittens -—--Other 4015.19.00
and mitts), for all purposes, of vulcanised rubber other than hard
rubber.
21 Badge/Lather Badge Articles of apparel and clothing accessories, of leather or of - Other clothing 4203.40.00
composition leather. accessories
22 Polyester Ribon Label | Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow - Fabrics consisting of 5806.40.00
fabrics warp without weft
assembled by means of
an adhesive
consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs)
(bolducs).
23 Woven Main Slide fasteners and parts thereof. - Parts 9607.20.00
Label/Size Label/Care
Label (all type) Labels, badges and similar articles of textile materials, in the piece,in | - Other 9607.19.00
strips or cut to shape or size, not embroidered. X
bt - Other 5807.90.00
24 Embroidery Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs - Embroidery without 5810.10.00
Label/Embroidery visible ground
Badge
25 Embroidery Lace Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs - Of cotton 5810.91.00
26 Embroidery Lace Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs - Of man-made fibres 5810.92.00
Fabrics
27 100% Polyester, Textile fabrics, impregnated, coated, covered or laminated with --- Other 5903.20.90
Tricot, Taffeta, Mesh plastics,
f abrll?s‘(all type), other than those of heading 59.02. -- Fusing interlining 5903.10.10
nterlining materials (textile
material for stiffening
cuﬂfs#nd collars)
Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs — Of cotton 5810.91.00
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28 Reflective Tape Rubberised textile fabrics, other than those of heading 59.02. —- Reflective tape 5906.99.10
29 O/Metal Ring Other articles of iron or steel. - Other 7326.19.00
30 Metal Badge Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets | - Other, including parts | 8308.90.00
and the like, of base metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing -- Hooks, eyes and 8308.10.00
eyelets
accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches, books, awnings, -- Tubular or 8308.20.00
leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other made up articles; bifurcated rivets
tubular or bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and spangles, of base
metal.
31 RFID Tag Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, ""smart cards" —- RFID TAG 8523.59.20
and other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena, imported by Industrial
whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the IRC holder VAT
production of Discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37. compliant 100%
exportoriented
textile industry
32 Sewing Thread Sewing thread of man-made filaments, whether or not put up for retail | Of artificial filaments 5401.20.00
sale.
33 Plastic Button, Button | Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button - Of plastics not 9606.21.00
of Base Metal moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks. covered with textile
material
-- Of a base metal, not 9606.22.00
covered with textile
material
34 Printed Paper, Hang --Printed 4821.10.00
Tag Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not printed.
5 A
35 Sticker/hangtag Sticker imported by 4821.10.00
Sticker Industrial IRC holder
VAT compliant electric
Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not printed. fan
motor or water pump
motor manufacturing
industry
o Belt Leather Articles of apparel and clothing accessories, of leather or of = Belts and bandoliers | 4203.30.00
composition
leather.
37 Metal Stopper, D- Stoppers, caps and lids (including crown corks, screw caps and —Crown corks 8309.10.00
Ring, O-Ring pouring
stoppers), capsules for bottles, threaded bungs, bung covers, seals and —-- Other 8309.90.90
other packing accessories, of base metal.
ni Flastiz Stoppers Atrticles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of plastics; stoppers, - Stoppen, lids, caps 235000
> i and other closures
lids, caps and other closures, of plastics.
39 Hooks Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets -- Hooks, eyes and 8308.10.00
and the like, of base metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing eyelets
accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches, books, awnings,
leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other made up articles;
tubular or bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and spangles, of base
metal.
40 Leather Patch Articles of apparel and clothing accessories, of leather or of -- Other clothing 4203.40.00
composition accessories
leather.
41 Washer Rubber ‘.\; --- Rubber cot/apron 4016.99.10
gage,Rubber patch, Other articles of vulcanised rubber other than hard rubber.
adge
42 Super Tag, Security --- Proximity Cards 8523.59.10
Tag, RFID and tags
Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, "smart cards" -- RFID TAG 8523.59.20
and imported by Industrial
other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena, IRC holder VAT
whether compliant 100%
or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the production of | exportoriented
discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37. textile industry
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43 Metal Hook Metal Hook 7309.00.00

Reservoirs, tanks, vats and similar containers for any material (other
than

compressed or liquefied gas), of iron or steel, of a capacity exceeding
300

L, whether or not lined or heat-insulated, but not fitted with
mechanical or

thermal equipment.

4“4 Rivets Screws, bolts, nuts, coach screws, screw hooks, river, cotters, cotter- —Other 7318.22.90

pins,
washers (including spring washers) and similar articles, of iron or
steel.

45 Supper Tag | Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells, sirens, | Burglar or fire alarms 8531.10.00
indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those of heading and similar apparatus
85.12 or 85.30.
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All Kinds of Knit Yarn I S
1. Polyester, Lycra, 5205.11.00 TO 5205.48.00 Aot Yo%
Nylon,Viscose polyester yarn,
All Kinds of Melange Yarn AR 89,00
Viscose Yarn 5206.11.00 TO 5206.45.00 354,
Cotton Combed & Pima yarn 5207.10.00 TO 5207.90.00
Cotton Carded Yarn 5402.11.00 TO 5402.49.00
2. All Kinds of Knit Fabrics 6001.10.00 TO 6001.99.00, 6002.40.00 TO e Yo 8
6002.90.00, 6003.10.00 TO 6003.90.00,
6004.10.00 TO 6004.90.00, 6005.21.00 TO m B‘If?{WT
6005.90.00, 6006.10.00 TO 6006.90.00 NS
3. All Kinds of Woven Fabrics 5208.11.00-5208.59.00, 5209.11.00- 5209.59.00,
5210.11.00-5210.59.00, 5211.11.00-5211.59.00,
5212.11.00-5212.25.00, 5309.11.00-5309.29.00,
5407.10.10-5407.94.00, 5408.10.00-5408.34.00,
5512.11.00-5512.99.00, 5513.11.00-5513.49.00,
- 5514.11.00-5514.49.00, 5801.10.00 —5801.90.00
Accessories :
4. Label (All Kinds) 5807.10.00-5807.90.00
5. Interlining 5903.10.10-5903.90.00
6. Button (metal/plastic) 9606.10.00-9606.30.00
7 Sewing Thread (All sorts) 5401.10.00, 5403.49.00, 5204.11.00, 5508.10.00,
5508.20.00, 5401.20.00, 5403.39.00, 5404.19.00
8. Coller Bon, Insert 6217.10.00
9. Tissue Paper hard 4803.00.00
10. Poly Bag 3923.29.90, 3923.21.00
11. Gum Tape/SkotchTape 3919.10.00, 3919.90.00
12. Iron Seal 8308.90.00
13. Pading 5811.00.00
14. | Zipper 9607.11.00-9607.20.00
15. Elastic/Elastic Binder 4015.90.00
16. | Hanger 3926.20.90, 3926.90.99 eI Yo @
17. Plastic Stoper, Metal Stoper 8309.90.90 FIF{WT
18. Drawstring/drawcord 5402.39.00 ﬁﬁ‘@
19. | Price Ticket 4821.90.00 e (ery
20. Back Board 4823.90.99
21. Metal Clip/metal Chain 7315.12.00
22. Lace 5404.90.00
23. Carton 4819.10.00, 4819.20.00
24. | Security Alarm (For 9030.89.00
Garments use)
25. | Hangtag, Stiker/Barcode 5807.90.00 .
26. Coller & Cuff Rib 6001.10.00, 6002.90.00
27. Eyelets/Hooks 8308.10.00
28. Rivets 7318.23.90
29. Buckle 8308.90.00
30. Metal/Plastic beads 7018.10.00
31. Metal/Plastic Sequence 7018.90.00
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