গণপ্রজাতন্ত্রী বাংলাদেশ সরকার

কাস্টমস বন্ত কমিশনারেট ৩৪২/১, সেগুন বাগিচা, ঢাকা-১০০০।

//পৃষ্ঠা নং-08//

০১। প্রতিষ্ঠানের নাম ও ঠিকানা ঃ মেসার্স ডজের ল্যান্ড এ্যাপারেলস লিমিটেড, হরিহরপাড়া, পঞ্চবটি, ফড্ল্লা, নারায়ণুগঞ্জ।

০২। বন্ত লাইসেম্স নং- ও তারিখ 🖒 R ২ 🕒 /কাস-এসবিডব্লিউ/২০১৩ তারিখ- ১২

णातिश- 22/20/2006 23)

০৩। মুসক নিবন্ধন নং-১৯২৮১০১১২০৬

তারিখ ১৮/১২/২০১২।

০৪। বন্ধ লাইসেন্সের পৃষ্ঠা নং-০২-এর ক্রমিক ১৫ ও ২০ অনুষায়ী পণ্য ভৈরিতে ব্যবহার্য কাঁচামাল সমূহের প্রেণীবিন্যাশ, এইচ. এস কোডসমত ও পণাভিত্তিক বার্ষিক আমদানি প্রাপাতা নিয়ে উল্লেখ করা হলোঃ

ক্ৰমিক নং	প্রথম তফশিল বাংলাদেশ কাস্টমস ট্যারিফ ২০১২-২০১৩ অনুযায়ী পণ্যের বিবরণ	এইচ, এস, কোড নম্বর	বার্ষিক আমদানি প্রাপ্য
1.	COTTON YARN (OTHER THAN SEWING THREAD) CONTAINING 85% OR MORE	5205.11.00 TO 5205.48.00	বার্ষিক আমদানি প্রাপ্য
	BY WEIGHT OF COTTON) COTTON YARN (OTHER THAN SEWING THREAD) CONTAINING LESS THAN	5206.11.00 TO 5206.45.00	৬০% হিসাবে ১৫১.২০
	85% BY WEIGHT OF COTTON)	5402 11.00 TO 5402.69.00	টন এবং রপ্তানি ঝণপর
	SYNTHETIC FILAMENT YARN (OTHER THAN SEWING THREAD) YARN (OTHER THAN SEWING THREAD) OF SYNTHETIC STAPLE FIBRES	5509.11.00 TO 5509.99.00	ইউডির চাহিদা মোতারে
2	WOVEN FABRICS OF COTTON, CONTAINING 85% OR MORE BY WEIGHT OF COTTON WEIGHING NOT MORE THAN 200 GM/2	5208.21.00 TO 5208.59.00	রপ্তানি ঝণপত্র ও ইউনি
3.	WOVEN FABRICS OF COTTON, CONTAINING \$5% OR MORE BY WEIGHT OF COTTON, WEIGHING MORE THAN 200 GM2	5209.21.00 TO 5209.59.00	চাহিদা মোতাবেক
4.	WOVEN FABRICS OF COTTON, CONTAINING LESS THAN 85% BY WEIGHT OF COTTON, MIXED MAINLY OR SOLELY WITH MAN- MADE FIBERES, WEIGHING	5210.21.00 TO 5210.59.00	
5.	NOT MORE THAN 200 GM2 WOVEN FABRICS OF COTTON, CONTAINING LESS THAN 85% BY WEIGHT OF COTTON,MIXED MAINLY OR SOLELY WITH MAN-MADE FIBERES, WEIGHING	5211.31.00 TO 5211.59.00	
	MORE THAN 200 G/M2 ORTHER WOVEN FABRICS OF COTTON	\$212.12.00 TO \$212.25.00	-
7.	WOVEN FARRICS OF SYNTHETIC FILAMENT YARN INCLUDING WOVEN	5407.41.00 TO 5407.94.00	
8.	FABRICS OBTAINED FROM MATERIALS OF HEADING 54,04. WOVEN FABRICS OF ARTIFICIAL FILAMENT YARN, INCLUDING WOVEN	5408.10.00 TO 5408.34.00	1
9.	FABRICS OBTINED FROM MATERIALS OF HEADING 54.05. WOVEN FABRICS OF SYNTHETIC STAPLE FIBERS, CONTAINING 85% OR MORE	5512.11.00 TO 5512.99.00	-
	BY WEIGHT OF SYNTHETIC STAPLE FIBERS	5513.11.00 TO 5513.49.00	-
10.	WOVEN FABRICS OF SYNTHETIC STAPLE FIBERS, CONTAINING LESS THAN 85% BY WEIGHT OF SUCH FIBRES, MIXED MAINLY OR SOLELY WITH COTTON, OF A WEIGHT NOT EXCEEDING 170 GM2		
11.	WOVEN FABRICS OF SYNTHETIC STAPLE FIBERS, CONTAINING LESS THAN 85% BY WEIGHT OF SUCH FIBERS, MIXED MAINLY OR SOLELY WITH COTTON, OF A WEIGHT EXCEEDING 170 GM2	5514.11.00 TO 5514.49.00	
12.	CONTAINING 85% OR MORE BY WEIGHT OF ARTIFICIAL STAPLE FIBRES	5516.11.00 TO 5516.94.00	1
13.	WOVEN PILE FABRICS AND CHENILLE FABRIC, ORTHER THAN FABRICS OF	5801.21.00 TO 5801.90.00	
14.	PILE FABRICS, INCLUDING "LONG PILL" FABRICS AND TERRY FABRIC, KNITTED OR CROCHEDTED.	6001.10.00 TO 6001.99.00	
15.	KNITTED OR CROCHETED FABRICS OF WIDTH NOT EXCEEDING 30 CM, CONTAINING BY WEIGHT 5% OR MORE OF ELASTOMERIC YARN OR RUBBER THEAD, OR THER FALL OR THE FALL OF THE FA	5002,40.00 TO 6002,90.00	1
16.	KNITTED OR CROCHETED FABRICS OF WIDTH NOT EXCEEDING 30 CM, ORTHER THAN THOSE OF HEADING 60.01 OR 60.02	6003,20.00 TO 6003,30.00	
17.	KNITTED OR CROCHETED FABRICS OF A WIDTH EXCEEDING 30 CM, CONTAINING BY WEIGHT 5% OR MORE OF ELASTOMERK YARN OR RUBBER THREAD DORTHER THOSE OF HEADING 60.01.	6004.10.60 TO 6004-90.00	
18.	WARP KNIT FABRIC (INCLUDING THOSE MADE ON GALLOON KNITTING MACHINES), OTHER THAN OF HEADINGS 60.01 TO 60.04.	6005.21.00 TO6005.90.00	
19.	ORTHER KNITTED OR CROCHETED FABRICS	6006.21.00 TO 6006.90.00	
ccessories	:		
20.	Label (All Kinds)	5807,10,00-5807,90,00	
21.	Interlining	5903.10.10-5903.90.00	
22.	Button (metal/plastic)	9606.10.00-9606.30.00	7
23.	Sewing Thread (All sorts)	5401.10.00, 5204.11.00,	1
20.	Sawing Triedad (All socies)	5508.10.00, 5508.20.00, 5401.20.00	
24.	Coller Bon, Insert	6217,10.00	1
25.	Tissue Paper (Apparel)	4818,50,00	1
26.	Poly Bag	3923.29.90, 3923.21.00	1
27.	Gum Tape/SkotchTape (except electric insulation tape)	3919.10.00, 3919.90.00	7
28.	Iron Seal	8308.90.00	1000
29.	Pading	5811.00.00	রপ্তানি ঋণপত্র ও
30.	Zipper	9607.11.00-9607.20.00	
31.	Elastic/Elastic Binder	4015.90.00	ইউডির চাহিদা
32.	Hanger	3926.20.90, 3926.90.99	1
33.	Plastic Steper, Metal Stoper	8309.90.90	মোতাবেক
	Drawstring/drawcord	5402.39.00	1
34.		4821.90.00	1
35.	Price Ticket	4823.90.99	1
36.	Back Board	7315.12.00	1
37.	Metal Clip/metal Chain	5404.90.00	1
38.	Lace	4819.10.00, 4819.20.00	1
39.	Carton	4819.10.00, 4819.20.00 5807.90.00	1
40.	Hangtag, Stiker/Barcode	8308.10.00	1
41.	Hooks	7319 23 00	1
42.	Rivets	7318.22.90	-
43.	Buckle Coller & Cuff Rib	7318.23.00 6001.10.00.6002.90.00	

এককালিন বন্ডিং ক্যাপাসিটি = ২০০.৭৮ (দুইশত দশমিক সাত আট) মেট্রিক টন।

এস এম সেলিম আহমেদ সহলারী বাজার কর্মকর্তা কাস্টমস বন্ধ কমিশনারেট, ঢাকা

Ho with

ড মোঃ সহিদুল ইসলমি কমিশনার কাস্টমস বস্ত কমিশনারেট -ঢাকা

গণপ্রজাতন্ত্রী বাংলাদেশ সরকার কাস্টমস বস্ত কমিশনারেট, ঢাকা (দক্ষিণ) ৩৪২/১ সেগুন বাগিচা, ঢাকা।

www.cbc.gov.bd

নথি নং ৫(১৩)১০৮/কাস-বভ/লাই:/ডয়েজল্যান্ড/২০১৩/পার্ট-০১/২০২২/বৃত্তি ১০

তারিখ: 🗸 🏈 /০৯/২০২৩খ্রি:

০১ । প্রতিষ্ঠানের নামঃ

ঃ মেসার্স ডয়েসল্যান্ড এ্যাপারেলস লিঃ,

ঠিকানা-

ঃ বি-৬৮/৬, সামাদ মেম্বার রোড,পশ্চিমপাড়া, জালকুড়ি,সিদ্ধিরগঞ্জ,নারায়নগঞ্জ,বাংলাদেশ।

০২। বন্ড লাইসেন্স নং-

ঃ ১৫২৩/কাস-এসবিভব্লিউ/২০১৩ তারিখ: ২২/১০/২০১৩ খ্রিঃ,

০৩। ই-বিন নং-

ঃ ০০০৩৯০৯০৩-০৩০৫, তারিখ-০১.০৮.২০১৯ খ্রি:।

০৪। প্রতিষ্ঠানের বন্ড লাইসেন্সের দ্বিতীয় পৃষ্ঠায় বর্ণিত ক্রমিক নং- ১৫ ও ২০ অনুযায়ী প্রদত্ত প্রাপ্যতা শীটে প্রতিষ্ঠানের পণ্য তৈরীতে ব্যবহার্য নিম্নবর্ণিত কাঁচামালের নাম ও এইচ.এস কোড বন্ড লাইসেন্সে সংশোধনপূর্বক নিম্নে উল্লেখ করা হলো।

ক্রমিক নং	BCT (2023-2024) মোতাবেক ফেব্রিস্ত্র, ইয়ার্গ এবং এস্ত্রেসরিজ এর নামের তালিকা ঃ	কাঁচামালের নাম	এইচ এস কোড	আমদানি প্রাপ্যতা অনুযায়ী
	Woven Fabric & Knitted Fabric			
1	Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton, weighing not more than 200 g/m2 Of yarns of different colours 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross	Woven fabrics	5208.43.00	
2	Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing 85% or more by weight of synthetic staple fibres-Other-Other	Woven fabrics	5512.19.90	
3	Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width exceeding 30 cm, containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn or rubber thread, other those of heading 60.01- Containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn but not containing rubber thread	knitted fabrics / polyester	6004.10.00	
4	Other knitted or crocheted fabrics-Of synthetic fibresDyed	knitted fabrics / polyester	6006.32.00	
	YARN			
5	Cotton sewing thread, whether or not put up for retail sale. Not put up for retail sale: Containing 85% or more by	YARN	5204.11.00	
	weight of cotton	-		_
	ACCESSORIES			
6	Other plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of plastics, non-cellular and not reinforced, laminated, supported or similarly combined with other materialsOf polymers of ethyleneother	Seam Seal Tape, Heat transfer Sticker	3920.10.90	রপ্তানি ঋনপত্র ও ইউডির
7	Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat shapes, of plastics, whether or not in rolls Other Other	Heat seal tape/ Polyflex Tape (All Kinds)/ (Hologram Sticker/label) / Barcode Sticker	3919.90.99	চাহিদা অনুযায়ী
8	Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat shapes, of plastics, whether or not in rolls Self adhesive tape in rolls exceeding 20cm imported by Industrial trc holder VAT compliant manufacturers	Gum Tape/ Adhesive Tape/ Scotch Tape	3919.90.10	
9	Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading Nos. 39.01 to 39.14 Other Taflon tape/PTFE tape	Heat Transfer Label/Seal	3926.90.50	
10	Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading Nos. 39.01 to 39.14 Other Other	Plastic Tag/Plastic Hangtag/ Plastic label/ Heat Transfer label/ Seal /Plastic Sticker/Garments sequence/ string/ 3D lenticular label/ plastic seal/ Hot Fix Sticker (Plastic)/ Plastic stone/ Plastic Ring.	3926.90.99	
11	Paper, paperboard, cellulose wadding and webs of cellulose fibres, coated, impregnated, covered, surface-coloured, surface-decorated or printed, in rolls or rectangular (including square) sheets, of any size, other than goods of the kind described in heading 48.03, 48.09 or 48.10 Self-adhesive Other	Salf adhasive sticker/	4811.49.00	

ত্তিত্বতি আলী ভত্তমান সহকারী কান্ট্রন্ বভ ক্মিশ্নারেট (দক্ষিণ) ধারণা।

ক্রমিক নং	BCT (2023-2024) মোতাবেক ফেব্রিব্র, ইয়ার্ণ এবং এক্সেসরিচ্চ এর নামের তাশিকা ঃ	কাঁচামাশের নাম	এইচ এস কোড	আমদানি প্রাপ্যতা অনুযায়ী
12	Paper, paperboard, cellulose wadding and webs of cellulose fibres, coated, impregnated, covered, surface-coloured, surface-decorated or printed, in rolls or rectangular (including square) sheets, of any size, other than goods of the kind described in heading 48.03, 48.09 or 48.10.— Gummed or adhesive paper and paperboard:—— Selfadhesive—Other	Gum Tape/Printed Tape	4811.41.90	
13	Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not printed Printed	HangTag/Price Ticket/Sticker (All Kinds)/ Sewing ticket/ paperboard labels (All kinds) / adhesive hangtag/ sticker/ photo Inlay card.	4821.10.00	
14	Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not printed OtherOther	Paper Band/Card/sticker tag/ label (All Kinds)	4821.90.90	
15	Transfers (decalcomanias) Transfers (decalcomanias), vitrifiable Other	Heat transfer label/ paper/ pvc free transfer paper	4908.90.00	
16	Cotton sewing thread, whether or not put up for retail sale Not put up for retail sale: Other	Sewing Thread (Cotton)	5204.19.00	
17	Cotton sewing thread, whether or not put up for retail sale Not put up for retail sale: Containing 85% or more by weight of cotton	Sewing Thread (Cotton)	5204.11.00	
18	Sewing thread of man-made filaments, whether or not put up for retail sale - Of synthetic filaments	Sewing Thread (Syntactic)	5401.10.00	
19	Synthetic filament yarn (other than sewing thread), not put up for retail sale, including synthetic monofilament of less than 67 decitex. - Other yarn, single, untwisted or with a twist not exceeding 50 turns per metre Elastometric	Spandex yarn Elastomeric/Licra yarn/ Lacra yarn	5402.44.00	রপ্তানি ঋনপত্র ৩
20	Rubber thread and cord, textile covered; textile yarn, and strip and the like of heading 54.04 or 54.05, impregnated, coated, covered or sheathed with rubber or plasticsRubber thread and cord, textile covered	Rubber thread and cord/Elastic cord.	5604.10.00	ইউডির চাহিদা অনুযায়ী
21	Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs) Other woven fabrics	Ribbon narrow woven fab. of manmade fibers imp./ Woven Tape/Piping/Twil Tape/Gross Grain Tape/ Velcro Tape/Neck Tape/ Tape Manmade Fifber	5806.40.00	
22	Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs) Other woven fabrics Of cotton	Neck tape /tape manmade fiber)/Woven Tape/ Piping /Twil Tape/ Gross Grain Tape / Velcro	5806.31.00	
23	Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs) Woven pile fabrics (including terry towelling and similar terry fabrics) and chenille fabrics	Satin ribbon / Woven Tape/Piping/Twil Tape/ Gross Grain Tape/ Tape ManmadeFifber narrow woven fabrics of other textiles.	5806.10.00	
24	Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs — Embroidery without visible ground	Embroidery badge/ Embroidery Lace/ strips or motifs	5810.10.00	
25	Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs)Other woven fabrics, containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn or rubber thread	Elastic / Elastic Binder/ Elastic ring/ Elastic Tape	5806.20.00	
26	Labels, badges and similar articles of textile materials, in the piece, in strips or cut to shape or size, not embroidered Woven	Woven Label (All Types)/ Pocket Flasher/Badge (All Kinds) / main label/ Logo/ Heat Seal/ tassel and similar articles of textiles material in pcs of woven	5807.10.00	



ক্রমিক নং	BCT (2023-2024) মোতাবেক ফেব্রিক্স, ইয়ার্ণ এবং এক্সেসরিজ এর নামের তাশিকা ঃ	কাঁচামালের নাম	এইচ এস কোড	আমদানি প্রাপ্যতা অনুযায়ী
27	Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other than fabrics of headings 60.02 to 60.06 Mechanically made lace Of man-made fibres	All kinds Lace/lace fabrics of manmade fibers.	5804.21.00	
28	Rubberized textile fabrics, other than those of heading 59.02 Reflective Tape	Reflective Tape	5906.99.10	
29	Textile fabrics, impregnated, coated, covered or laminated with plastics, other than those of heading 59.02 With polyvinyl chloride:- Fusing interlining materials (textile material for stiffening cuffs and collars)	Fusing interlining materials (textile material for stiffening cuffs and collars)	5903.10.10	
30	Other knitted or crocheted fabrics- Of artificial fibres- Other	Other of artificial fibres	6006.90.00	
31	Other made up clothing accessories; parts of garments or of clothing accessories, other than those of heading 62.12 Accessories	All kinds of drawstring, draw cord, collar, cuff, pocketing, Shoulder Pad, twill tape, tape with button/ other made up clothing accessories (All kinds).	6217.10.00	
32	Screws, bolts, nuts, coach screws, screw hooks, river, cotters, cotter-pins, washers (including spring washers) and similar articles, of iron or steel Rivets Other	Rivets/Buckle	7318.23.90	
33	Screws, bolts, nuts, coach screws, screw hooks, river, cotters, cotter-pins, washers (including spring washers) and similar articles, of iron or steel Other washers Other	Rivets/Buckle	7318.22.90	
34	Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the like, of base metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches, books, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other made up articles; tubular or bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and spangles, of base metal Hooks, eyes and eyelets	Eyelet/ Hook & Eyes/ Metal Cord End/ Buckle/Nicked Buckle/Waist Buckle/ Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the like	8308.10.00	রপ্তানি
35	Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the like, of base metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches, books, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other made up articles; tubular or bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and spangles, of base metal Tubular or bifurcated rivets	Metal Rivets	8308.20.00	রপ্ত্যান ঋনপত্র ও ইউডির চাহিদা অনুযায়ী
36	Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the like, of base metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches, books, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other made up articles; tubular or bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and spangles, of base metal Other, including parts	Iron Seal/Metal Clip/ Metal Studs/Ring /D-ring/D-ring Clip/Clasps/ Frames with Claps /Beads/Badge/ Metal Plate/ base metal	8308.90.00	
37	Stoppers, caps and lids (including crown corks, screw caps and pouring stoppers), capsules for bottles, threaded bungs, bung covers, seals and other packing accessories, of base metal Other-Other	Stoppers (plastic or metal)/ Iron Seal/Base metal/ Metal seal/Container seal	8309.90.90	
38	Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, "smart cards" and other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena, whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the production of discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37 Proximity Cards and tags	Proximity Cards and tags/ label AF- Alarm sticker	8523.59.10	
39	Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, "smart cards" and other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena, whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the production of discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37 Other	Supper Tag/Security Alarm Tag/Smart Security RFID Tags/ Pocket Security/Paper Label RFID/Barcode	8523.49.90	
40	Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of plastics; stoppers, lids, caps and other closures, of plastics Of other plastics Airtight storage bags with zipper	Storage Bags with Zipper/ Hanger Poly Bag/Plastic Washer	3923.29.10	
41	Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells, sirens, indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those of heading 85.12 or 85.30 Burglar or fire alarms and similar apparatus	Bells/Sirens/Indicator Panels/ Burglar or Alarms/ Security Tag/Security Tack /VST/RFID Label Sensor Tag/ Gray fish tag/ cone steel pin .(signaling apparatus)	8531.10.00	



ক্রমিক নং	BCT (2023-2024) মোতাবেক ফেব্রিক্স , ইয়ার্ণ এবং এক্সেগরিজ এর নামের তালিকা ঃ	কাঁচামালের নাম	এইচ এস কোড	আমদানি প্রাপ্যতা অনুযায়ী
42	Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells, sirens, indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those of heading 85.12 or 85.30 Other apparatus	Bells/Sirens/Indicator Panels/Burglar or Alarms/Security Tag/Security Tack /VST/RFID Label Sensor Tag	8531.80.00	
43	Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks Buttons:Other	Pearl Button / Plastic Button/ google eye buttons of plastic, Metal Button/Aglet/ Ring/alloy plate buttons of base metal	9606.29.00	রপ্তানি
44	Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks Buttons: Of a base metal, not covered with textile material	Metal Button/Aglet/Ring/alloy plate buttons of base metal, not covered with textiles materials.	9606.22.00	ঋনপত্র ও ইউডির চাহিদা অনুযায়ী
45	Slide fasteners and parts thereofSlide fasteners: Other	Plastic Zipper/Puller/Fastener	9607.19.00	
46	Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks Buttons: Of plastics not covered with textile material	Pearl Button / Plastic Button/ google eye buttons of plastic, not covered with textiles materials.	9606.21.00	
47	Slide fasteners and parts thereofSlide fasteners: - Parts	Parts Zipper/Puller/ Fastener/ Metal charm (Butterfly)	9607.20.00	

০৫. ইতিপূর্বে জারীকৃত আমদানি প্রাপ্যতা পৃষ্ঠা নং-০৪ অপরিবর্তিত থাকবে।

প্রাপকঃ ব্যবস্থাপনা পরিচালক

মেসার্স ডয়েসল্যান্ড এ্যাপারেলস লিঃ, বি-৬৮/৬, সামাদ মেম্বার রোড,পশ্চিমপাড়া, জালকুড়ি, সিদ্ধিরগঞ্জ ,নারায়নগঞ্জ ,বাংলাদেশ। [সাদিয়া আফরোজ] উপ কমিশনার

নখি নং ৫(১৩)১০৮/কাস-বন্ড/লাই:/ডয়েজল্যান্ড/২০১৩/পার্ট-০১/২০২২

অনুলিপি অবগতি ও প্রয়োজনীয় কার্যক্রম গ্রহণের জন্য প্রেরণ করা হলোঃ

১-৮। কমিশনার, কাস্টম হাউস, ঢাকা/চউগ্রাম/বেনাপোল/মোংলা/আইসিডি(কমলাপুর),ঢাকা/বন্ড কমিশনারেট, চউগ্রাম/পানগাঁও, কেরানীগঞ্জ,

সিস্টেম এনালিষ্ট, কাস্টমস বন্ড কমিশনারেট, ঢাকা (উল্লিখিত তথ্যাদি বন্ড কমিশনারেটের ওয়েবসাইটে Upload করার জন্য অনুরোধ

১০-১৪। উপ/সহকারী কমিশনার/সহকারী কমিশনার, ডিইপিজেড (পূর্ব/পশ্চিম), সাভার, ঢাকা/আদমজী ইপিজেড, নারায়ণগঞ্জ/সিইপিজেড, চউগ্রাম/কুমিল্লা ইপিজেড, কুমিল্লা/ ঈশ্বরদী, ইপিজেড, পাবনা/বাংলাবান্দা তেতুলিয়া, পঞ্চগড়।

পি এ টু কমিশনার, কাস্টমস বন্ড কমিশনারেট, ঢাকা (কমিশনার মহোদয়ের সদয় অবগতির জন্য)। 136

উপ কমিশনার

[সাদিয়া আফরোজ]

1