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Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton, weighing more than 200 g/m2. -
01 |-Dyed:
-- 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twill

Dyed Woven Fabrics 5209.32.00
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2 Fleece Fabrics/ Far Fabrics/ Sherpa Fabrics 6001.29.00
3 | (SIS onifee =TS 6001.99.00
(}) Ffe @3p. @ @ites [eaet [es (et g3es-
@R | v 3@ MRe™ s FIIITeTa T G35 97 (T ST st
01 Rubber Rubber Patch/ Silicon Patch 4016.99.90 I dom 8 3ofer
ST (IR
2.2
ok | ZUIIYE SIS TG ARG BT 72 0¢ (AT S0 i AR ® A | ’Oa:
e
[ T ST |
AT : YT AR T SRR
TTRE IR eI forg FRMTIET 0%
Q-y, [ fogr 7919, FB94F, EIRENS |
A T ¢(S0)pY/FA-IT/MR3/2005/ DL (» é; — o9 2 Siffe: 2 Y/03/3020 R: | %
ST T SIS 8 STiEAT ! AR T (@ TR R ( J TIPS 9F) 8- E,
5-q1  FAR,FIEOT ZACH, GIFl/SBAT/ IR /TS (FHEF), TIl/FO6T I8 SIS,
BBATT/ATS, (FAINE, GBI | ‘
b-38 | ot/ whmee e, Ao, viwl/ArdfHirers, soat/sler ifk"izws i/ Svest 2ficers,
TReriE/Seat 2firers, Terwmidty Feanr e, siml FiEhT 2ere, oa/sImar I, SISt B AT |
sel  TEBT @mIfeE, FEBTE IS FREAET, Uil | ofts [Eafl « newmm 36 Up Load 3919 &y Seaid &4t
T
Su1 P @ B FRmim, SrBTT I8 SREIED, et (wfed), SRR M sefen e | /L?
san s s e Wn_'
\&°
[ s AT |
Tof SRR
FRHET AT




<)

/%81 ®R-30/

FILASTSIT R I
FPOTH I8 IARHIEG
©83/5, (1T AMGT BIFT-d000 |
www.cbc.gov.bd

A R-2(50) 5y /IPT-IT/MZz/ 2005/ ) ) €Y j

D
ClIERE

Jobr/R03%

0S|  aAfSHITTR W : GPTRT AT T fog,
& : @-23, T B @, IR, GRS, Tareee |
o} | IS TEOM W : 0L /IPT-GIEFE/200) , SR 13/50/2005 B |
09| IR ™ 8wy : 00080k ¢Y8-090Y , SIfAE 29/50/055 TP |
08 | mwmﬁmaﬂ——ﬁam 3¢ 8 0 (SMIF &G TS MG A SBITT 2ol
CoRITS AR JIGIITER TN 8 «Z6. G, (T IS IEH TR 48 g Srard a1 e
w3 PG A BCT(2022-2023) Ten «GB5 G S
T PSR A @ Kot @ Arrord
sAfaae
YARN/ KNITTED FABRIC
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by
weight of cotton, weighing not more than 200 g/mo.
Plain weave fabrics/ Twill
01 | Fabrics/ Cross Twill Fabrics/ 5208.19.00
Flannel Fabrics - Other fabrics
Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by
weight of cotton, weighing more than 200 g/m:
Cotton printed fabrics/
_02 Denim fabrics - Other fabrics 5209.49.00
Sewing thread of man-made filaments, whether or not
put up for retail sale
03 | Sewing Thread - Of synthetic filaments 5401.10.00
Artificial filament yarn (other than sewing thread), not
put up for retail sale, including artificial monofilament of
less than 67 decitex
04 | Viscose/Rayon fabrics, -- Other 5403.39.00
Viscose Polyester Rayon
fabrics/ Vlscqse wn'th B Ao @
elastane fabrics/ Viscose
05 Polyester with elastane Of viscose rayon 5403.41.00 28fe vz
fabrics/ Viscose Polyester - ayo o (RIS
Rayon with elastane fabrics/
Viscose Rayon with
elastane fabrics
Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including
woven fabrics obtained from materials of heading 54.04
Polyester Fabric/
Taffeta Fabric/
06 | 100% Polyester woven - Printed 5407.94.00
printed fabrics/
Fabrics/ Mesh Fabrics .
Rubberised textile fabrics, other than those of heading
59.02
Knitted or Crocheted
07 Rubberised Fabrics -- Knitted or crocheted 5906.91.00
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30
cm, containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric
yarn or rubber thread, other than those of heading 60.01
08 Rib Fabrics/ Rib fabrics with | - Containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn containing rubber 6002.40.00
elastane thread
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09 - Other 6002.90.00
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30
cm, other than those of heading 60.01 or 60.02
10 - Of cotton 6003.20.00
11 | Knitted Or Crocted Fabrics | - Of synthetic fibres 6003.30.00
12 - Other 6003.90.00
Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width exceeding 30
cm, containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric
yarn or rubber thread, other those of heading 60.01
Knitted Fabrics/ Lace
Fabrics/ Rib Fabrics/
13| Rib fabrics with elastane - Other 6004.90.00
Warp knit fabrics (including those made on galioon
knitting machines), other than of headings 60.01 to
60.04
14 | Warp Knit of Printed — Dyed 6005.22.00
Synthetic Fabrics/ Knitted
or Warp Fabrics of Woven/
15 Warp Knit Unbleached or 6005.24.00
Bleached -- Printed
Other knitted or crocheted fabrics
16 | Knitted Printed Fabrics with | - Dyed 6006.22.00
17 | Sequence/ Embroidery -- Printed 6006.24.00
Other furnishing articles, excluding those of heading
94.04
Cotton Fabric Chembery of
18 Woven - Knitted or crocheted 6304.11.00
ACCESSORIES IS 4G 8
Other inorganic acids and other inorganic oxygen EXCERIIEG
compounds of non-metals
19_| Silica Gel — Other 8112050 | o
Leather further prepared after tanning or crusting,
including parchment dressed leather, of bovine
(including buffalo) or equine animals, without hair on,
whether or not split, other than leather of heading 41.14
20 | Al Kind of Leather Patch -- Other 4107.99.00
Articles of apparel, clothing accessories and other
articles of furskin
Other Clothing Accessories/
2l Fake Leather Label - Articles of apparel and clothing accessories 4303.10.00
Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not
printed
Hang Tag / Price Tag/
Barcode Sticker/ All
22 | Kind of Paper Label/ Hang | — Other 4821.90.90
Tag Other
Transfers (decalcomanias)
23 | Hit Transfer Label - Other 4908.90.00
Other made up clothing accessories; parts of garments
or of clothing accessories, other than those of heading
62.12
24 All kind O.f garments - Accessories 6217.10.00
accessories
Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices,
"smart cards"” and other media for the recording of
sound or of other phenomena, whether or not recorded,
including matrices and masters for the production of
discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37
25 | RFID Tag/ Security Tag — Proximity Cards and tags 8523.59.10
| [5FTIR oBT R-5//
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Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for
example, bells, sirens, indicator panels, burglar or fire
alarms), other than those of heading 85.12 or 85.30

26 | Super Tag VST/ Super Tack | - Other apparatus 8531.80.00
Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-
studs, button moulds and other parts of these articles; S g 8
button blanks 25R &
Horn Button/ Bon Button/ )
Pearl Button/ Snap Button/ QreTIF
27 | Shell Button/ Plastic Button/ | -- Of plastics not covered with textile material 9606.21.00
Metal Button/ Button/
All kind of Button
Slide fasteners and parts thereof
28 | Slide Fastener/ Zipper -- Other 9607.19.00
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YARN/ KNITTED FABRIC
Woven fabrics of artificial filament yarn, including
woven fabrics obtained from materials of heading 7 Ao 8
54.05 2T vzt
01 | Viscose Fabrics - Woven fabrics obtained from high tenacity yarn of viscose rayon | 5408.10.00 (ISIEF
Other woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres
02 | Polyester Viscose Fabrics - Mixed mainly or solely with viscose rayon staple fibres 5515.11.00
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SL Name of the Raw Materials according to the Commercial name of the Raw Heading/H.S. | Yearly import
NO: BCT 2022-2023 Materials: CODE No. Entitlement
{A) YARN/ KNIT FABRICS

Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width exceeding 30 cm, containing by weight
5% or more of elastomeric yam or rubber thread, other those of heading 60.01

01 Knitted Fabrics - Containing by weight 5% or more of
elastomeric yarn but not containing 6004.10.00
rubber thread
02 90% Polyester 10% Spandex - Containing by weight 5% or more 6004.10.00
of elastomeric yarn but not containing
rubber thread
Other Knitted Or Crocheted Fabrics
03 Knitted Printed Fabrics With Sequance/ Embroidery | - Printed 6006.34.00
04 90% Poly 10% Spandex/ 95% Poly 5% Spandex Other knitted or crocheted fabrics 6006.33.00
-- Of yarns of different colours
05 | 65% Poly 35% Cotton Other knitted or crocheted fabrics 6006.33.00
' -- Of yarns of different colours
(B) ACCESSORIES E T
Paper Or Paperboard Labels Of All Kinds, Whether Or Not Printed 4T @
06 Hang Tag Sticker/ Price Tag/ Barcode Sticker/ All 4821.10.00 Tofa
Kind Of Paper Labe! - Printed e )
Synthetic Filament Yarn (Other Than Sewing Thread), Not Put Up For Retail sifEwr
Sale, Including Synthetic Monofilament Of Less Than 67 Decitex oIS
07 Synthetic Thread/ Yam/ Lycra Yam/Spandex 5402.44.00
(Polyurethane) Filament Yarn - Elastometric U
08 Nails, Tacks, Drawing Pins,
Corrugated Nails, Staples (Other
Than Those Of Heading 83.05)
And Similar Articles, Of Iron Or
Super Tack/ Tuck/ Steel, Whether Or Not With Heads | 2 7-00-00
Of Other Material, But Excluding
Such Articles With Heads Of
Copper
Discs, Tapes, Solid-State Non-Volatile Storage Devices, "Smart Cards" And
Other Media For The Recording Of Sound Or Of Other Phenomena, Whether
Or Not Recorded, Including Matrices And Masters For The Production Of Discs,
But Excluding Products Of Chapter 37
09 . —- RFID TAG imported by Industrial IRC
sg:g 'gzg(‘;e; c;ggg LZ%/gSl{.gzr Tag/ RFID Label/ holder VAT compliant 100% export 8523.59.20
oriented textile industry
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SL Name of the Raw Materials according to the Commercial name of the Raw Heading / H.S. | Yearly Import
NO: BCT 2022-2023 Materials: CODE No. Entitlement
Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells, sirens, indicator EGH
panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those of heading 85.12 or 85.30 Yoo 6
10 Super Tag VST : - Parts 8531.90.00 2T
IRy
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Accessories:
1 Metal Beads 8308.90.00 Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the like, of
base metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing accessories, footwear, jewellery
wris-watches, books, awning, leather goods, travel goods or saddler or for other
made up articles, tubular or bifurcafeed rivets, of base metal beads and spangles of
o o e base metal. Other, including parts.
"2 | Plastic Beads 3926.90.99 Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading Nos. 39.01 to
39.14. Other.
3 | Reflective Piping Tape 5906.99.10 Rubberised textile fabrics, other than those of heading 59.02. Reflective Tape.
Ta Bar / Base Matal 8309.90.90 Stoppers, caps and lids (including crown corks, screw caps and pouring stoppers),
capsules for bottles, threaded bungs, bung covers, seals and other packing
accessories, of base metal. Other.
5 Price Tag 4821.10.00 Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not
L Printed. Printed.
6 | Plastic Loop 3926.20.90 Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of
Heading Nos. 39.01 to 39.14, Other
7 Security Label / Sticker 8530.90.00 Electrical signaling, safety or traffic control equipment, for railways, tramways, roads,
8531.90.00 inland water-ways, parking facllities, port installations or airfields (other than those of
heading 86.08). Parts.
8531.90.00 Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example, bells, sirens,
indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those of heading 85.12 or
85.30
-Parts
8 Security Alarm (all 8512.30.00 Electrical lighting or signaling equipment (excluding articles of heading 85.39) I -
Kinds) windscreen wipers, defrosters and demisters, of a kind used for cycles or motor o B8fsq
vehicles. Sound signaling equipment. wifewr
8523.59.10 Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, "smart cards" and other media for oot
the recording of sound or of other phenomena, whether or not recorded, including
matrices and masters for the production of discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37.
---Proximity Cards and tags
9 | Snap Button 9606.10.00 Buttons, Press-fasteners, snap- fasteners and press-studs, button moulds and other
parts of these articles, button blanks. Press- fasteners snap- fasteners and press-studs
and parts therefor Buttons.
Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button moulds and
9606.22.00 other parts of these articles; button blanks
--Of a base metal, not covered with textile material
10 | Pom Pom Trim Tape 5804.29.00 Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted fabrics, lace in
the piece, in strips or in motifs, other than fabrics of headings 60.02. to 60.06. of
other textile materials.
11 | Twill Tape 5806.20.00 Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07 narrow fabrics consisting of
warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs). Other woven
N fabrics, containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn or rubber thread.
12 Tape (All Kinds) 5806.39.00 Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07 narrow fabrics consisting of
warp without weft assembled by means of an adhesive (bolducs). Of other textile
materials.
13 | Rhine Stone 7018.10.00 Glass beads, imitation pearls, initation precious or semi-
Precious stones and similar glass small wares, and articles thereof other than
imitation jewellery, glass eyes other than prosthetic articles, statuette es and other
ornaments of lamp worked glass, other than imitation jewellery glass micro spheres
not exceeding 1mm in diameter. Glass beads imitation pearts imitation precious or
semi- precious stones and similar glass small wares.
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' 15_‘l Fabrics P'z'\tch' 5804.29.00 Tulles and other net tabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted fabrics acz -
i the piece, in strip or in motifs, other than fabrics of heading 60.02 to 60.06. Cécimer
) [ | text_ile_materials.
Yﬁg S{{e S>ti_c-[<_e_r(All k‘ind) 3926.10.00 Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading Nos. 36.01 C
N o ! 39.14, Articles of apparel and clothing accessories.
16 ﬁto\'y)lzrﬁg“ 4821.90.00 Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not

| I — Printed. Other.
Zipper puller/head /
runner/cap

7307.29.00
Other.

fabrics

| Collar Cuff " 6117.90.00

|

_Embroi s

Barcode Label Plastic. 3919.90.99
3 Touten T 9606.29.00
54 Polyester Yarn 5402.33.00 | Synthetic filament

" 9607.20.00 :_—Slide fasteners and parts thereof. Parts.

Cotton sewing thread, whether or not put up for retail sale. Other.
Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other

Flat_sjimf plastics, whether or notin rolls. Other. o
Buttons, Press-fasteners, snap- fasteners and press-stud, button moulds and other
parts of these article, button blaﬂk_s,_Other,

e - —

synthetic monofilament of less than 67 decitex. Of polyesters.

— —

Tub—é—or pipe fitti;g—s (for exaﬁw—ple, coupling, elbows, sleeves) of iron or steel.

Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted fabrics, lace in
the piece, in strips of in motifs, other than fabrics of headings 60.02. to 60.06. of
other textile materials. o o o ~
Other made up clothing accessories, knitted or crocheted, knitted or crocheted parts
of_ga4rments or of clothing accessories. Parts ..

yarn (other than sewing thread) not put up for retail sal'e-,i‘naaaiqg

Rubber ~

‘> 25 Fabrics (Knii/ Woven i

allkinds): .. Vo
Twill Fabrics 5208.33.00 Woven fabrics of

o . Plain Wea.e, «

68% Poly, 28% Ray, 4% 6006.32.00
‘Spandex Fabrics. |
printed Woven fabrics | 5212.25.00
of cotton '

olcotton

95% Polyester 5% i 5513.23.00

spandex Fabrics \

"l

i
'

Woven fabrics of

_'4_0_16‘.99.90 Other articles of vulcanized rubber other than hard rubber. Other.

| more than 200 g/m. 3-Thread or 4- Thread twill, including cross twill.

Of yarns cf aifferent Colours.

"60% Rayon 40% " 6006.33.00 Ctner anitiec cr crocheted fabrics.
EQ‘)’S&OJ_@EZW_ 3 Of varns of ¢ Herent Colours.
100% Cotton Fabrics 5208.42.00 Woven fadrcs of

i more than 22C 2 ™
Other knittec Cr -rocreted fabrics. Dyed. ) :

Other woven faorics of cotton. Printed.

cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton , weight_not

Polyester Fabrics 5407.44.00 | Woven Fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including woven fabrics obtained from ;
(Woven) ! materials of heading 54.04. Printed other woven Fabrics, containing 85% or more by |
o 3 weight of textured polyester filaments. - B — ‘
Polyester Fabrics (Knit) 6006.32.00 Other knitted or crocheted fabrics. Dyed. o 33fm
/ Poly Lining Fabrics [ — : - ) et
7100% Polyester 6006.33.00 Other knittec or crocheted fabrics. Eoukn

s
cottor containing 85% or more by weight of cotton , weight not‘\

~zre than 100 g/m2.

o

-

synthetic staple fibres, containing less than 85% by weight of such

fiores , mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight not exceeding 170 g/m2.
Other woven fabrics of polyester staple fibres.

Pile Fabrics, including long pile fabrics and tery fabrics,
Knitted or crocheted. Of man-made fibres.

T

" T00% Polyester Micro " 6001.92.00
solid FlﬂeeAcg__Fabri__cs.
51% Rayon 32% Poly 6001.29.00

Terry Fabrics

YamaliKinds : ___
100% Cotton Dyed
Melange Yarn.

5205.23.00

polyester/ Cotton 5509.53.00
combed

| Rawyam. L
100% Cotton Combed 5205.24.00

not put up for re

|

Melange 1

pile Fabrics, including long pile fabrics and tery fabrics,
Kgi_t}ed or crocheted. Of oge_r_tg}tile materials other. o
Pile Fabrics, including long pile fabrics and tery fabrics,
Knitted or crocheted. Of other textile materials other.

Cotton yarn (other than sewing thread), containing 85% or more by weight of cotton,
not put up for retail sale. Measuring less than 232.56 decitex but not less than 192.31
decitex (exceeding 43 metric number but not exceeding 52 metric number).

Yarn (other than sewing thread)of synthetic staple fibres, not put up for retail sale.
Mixed mainly or solely with cotton.

[
Cotton yarn {other than sewing thread), containing 85% or more by weight of cotton,

tail sale. Measuring less than 192.31 decitex but not less than 125

Knit wax. Yar

30/1, Linen 90% Poly :
| 10%tnen(Yarm) L
30/1, 90% <05 Poly : 95% | 5306,20.00
Cotton 10% Linen (Yarn)

5509.21.00 varn (other than

decit_el(exceeding 52 metric number but not exceeding 80 metric number).

le (foided) or cabled

sewing thread) of synthetic staple fibres, not put up for retail sale.

—
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43 | 100% Linen Yarn 5306.10.00 Flax Yarn. Single.

44 | Spandex bare Yarn 20D 5402.49.00 Synthetic filament yarn (other than sewing thread), not put up for retail sale, aiﬁ;_;;ma

& 40D including synthetic monofilament of less than 67 decitex. Other yarn, Single, with a mj,a |

N twist exceeding 50 turms per metre. s

45 | Nylon filament Yarn 5402.19.00 Synthetic filament yarn (other than sewing thread), not put up for retail sale, )

including synthetic monofilament of less than 67 decitex. Other.

(%) effetir @ ARETER STy b1 Affe G T-3¢ 8 0 S AfediTE *felf LERTS GAZI FIGINIETR T 8 926,97, (G
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Ghe | SIS AW TR (OIS efSEMFS W8P Import Entilement
W) @8, P, BIG
01. Yarn 5202.00.00 5203.00.00
02. pocketing fabrics 4212.14.00 5512.11.00, 5513.11.00
03. Slze Label 5807.90.00 5807.90.00, 5807.10.00
04. Care Label 5807.90.00 5807.90.00, 5807.10.00
05. : Size Tape 5807.10.90 : 5807.10.90
I i
06. I Pocket Freshing 5807.10.00 5403.10.00
| 07. | Leather pator . 4104.39.00 6107.10.00
08. Metal Ziper 9607.11.00 9607.11.00
e worerm 8 37w wifewT S
09. Swing Thrade 5204.11.00 5204.11.00
10. Button 9606.22.00 9606.22.00
11. Tream Label 4821.10.90 4821.10.00
12. Rebats (Metal) 7318.23.00 7318.23.90
13. Poly bag 3923.10.00 3923.10.00
14. Selo Tape 3912.20.00 3912.20.00
15. PVC Tape 3908.10.10 3908.10.00
16. Nailon Taping 7326.10.10 7326.11.00
17. Metal Cleap 7326.90.90 7326.90.90
18. Elastic 6001.10.10 6001.10.00, 5806.10.00
19 | carton 4819.10.00, 4819.20.00,
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