oyl

o |
09 |
o8|

/78t Redol/

HRESR IRFTH TR
JIPBI IS IREAIES, Tt (wE)
08/S , G1e+ FIfeIBT, BI¥-doco |

SRESITT WI

o

@ REE R 8 O
R W s wifae

o
o
-3
©
o
3
8

www.chc.gov.bd

TR R €(50)08/TFA-IG/So52/4b-00/008/ DHE0LR”

G TR T ACEST e

ve, @ Bif% e 5 |

200 /FH-GHICE/don] BifF d0/ob/s553fRs |
008¢>L8R-0800 T 38/ob- /056 3 |

offf- 29 .95.20%0 .

T TRET RS 5 7o T -3¢ 8 R0 (SIS &S oyt G efSBIeTa 1 ToRTS JIY FOREE
6 RS 2029-2038 SR R FIGTT G2F P (ITC TR e Beerd a1 =e°m:

T FZEI TO TGS FIBTNT @ GRG.«FHIeq 3940 fgaet (BCT 2023-2024 GTONITF) :

T FoMEITR T

FioreeR 941 (First Schedule Bangladeh
Customs Tariff 2039-3038 St

G259,
[<aiv)

SUPER DRY

Chlorides, chloride oxides and chloride hydroxides; bromides and
Bromide oxides; iodides and iodide oxides
CALCIUM CHLORIDE

2827.20.00

GUM TAPE, SCOTCH TAPE, ADHESIVE TAPE,
PERFORMANCE TAPE, SIDE TAPE, OTHER
TAPE

Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other fiat
shapes,

of plastics, whether or not in rolls

OTHER

3919.90.10

Size sticker, plastic leg sticker

Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat
shapes,

of plastics, whether or not in rolls

OTHER

3919.90.99

POLY BAG, POLY BAG OF POLYSTER OF
ETHYLENE, SACK AND BAG(INCLUDING CONES)

Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of plastics;
stoppers,

lids, caps and other closures, of plastics.

Of polymers of ethylene , Of other plastics

3923.21.00

Plastic tag pin { FOR RMG)

Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of heading
Nos. -

39.01 t0 39.14.

OTHER

3926.90.99

Rubber tube

Other articles of vulcanised rubber other than hard rubber
Other inflatable articles
OTHER

4016.95.00

Lather patch/fake lather/artificial lather/rubber patch

Articles of apparel and clothing accessories, of leather or of
composition leather
Other clothing accessories

4203.40.00

FUR

Artificial fur and articles thereof

4304.00.00

SELF ADHESIVE PAPER AND PAPER BOARD

Paper, paperboard, cellulose wadding and webs of cellulose fibres,
coated, impregnated, covered, surface-coloured, surface-decorated
or

printed, in rolls or rectangular (including square) sheets, of any size,
other than goods of the kind described in heading 48.03, 48.09 or
48.10

OTHER

4811.41.90

10.

HANGTAG WITH STRING JACRON LABEL /
PRICE TICKET/PRICE TAG/JOGAR TAG

Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not printed.
OTHER/PRINTED

4821.10.00

11.

PAPER STICKER

Paper or paperboard labels of all kinds, whether or not printed.
OTHER

4821.90.90

12.

Woven cotton fabric

Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton,
weighing not more than 200 g/mz.
Other fabrics Of yams of different colors

5208.39.00

oI 7BT-55
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13. Woven cotton fabric Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton, | 5208.42.00
weighing not more than 200 g/mzPlain weave, weighing more than
100 g/mz2 !
14. Woven cotton fabric Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton, | 5209.49.00
weighing more than 200 g/mz
QOther fabrics Printed
15. Woven cotton fabric Woven fabrics of cotton, containing less than 85%by weight of 5211.32.00
cotton,
mixed mainly or solely with man-made fibres, weighing more than
200
g/m2
3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twill
16. Sewing thread Sewing thread of man-made filaments, whether or not put up for | 5401.10.00
retail
sale. Of synthetic filaments
17. | LINING 100% POLYESTER FABRIC Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yam, including woven fabrics 5407.42.00
Woven nylon fabric obtained from materials of heading 54.04
DYED
18. WOVEN NYLON FABRIC Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yam, including woven fabrics 5407.43.00
obtained from materials of heading 54.04
OF YARN DIFFERENT COLOURS
19. WOVEN NYLON FABRIC Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yarn, including woven fabrics 5407.44.00
obtained from materials of heading 54.04
PRINTED
20. WOVEN FABRIC Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yam, including woven fabrics 5407.52.00
obtained from materials of heading 54.04
Dyed
21. Woven fabric viscose rayon Woven fabrics of artificial filament yarn, including woven fabrics 5408.10.00
obtained from materials of heading 54.05
Viscose
22. WOVEN FABRIC Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing less than85% by | 5513.13.00
weight of such fibres, mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight
not exceeding 170 g/m2
Other woven fabrics of polyester staple fibres
23, Of polyester staple fibres, plain weave Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing less than85% by | 5513.21.00
weight of such fibres, mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight
not exceeding 170 g/m2
Of polyester staple fibres, plain weave
24. Woven polyester fabric Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing less than 85% by | 5514.23.00
weight of such fibres, mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight
exceeding 170 g/m2.
Other woven fabrics of polyester staple fibres
25. Woven fabric Woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres, containing less than 85% by | 5514.29.00
weight of such fibres, mixed mainly or solely with cotton, of a weight
exceeding 170 g/m2.
Other woven fabrics
26. PADDING Wadding of textile materials and articles thereof; textile fibres, not 5601.21.00
exceeding 5 mm in length (flock), textile dust and mill neps. OF
COTTON
27. PADDING/QUILTING Wadding of textile materials and articles thereof; textile fibres, not 5601.22.00
exceeding 5 mm in length (flock), textile dust and mill neps. OF
MAN MADE FIBRES
28. STRING, DRAWCORD, DRAWSTING Twine, cordage; ropes and cables, whether or not plaited or braided 5607.90.00
and whether or not impregnated, coated, covered or sheathed with
rubber or plastics. OTHER
29. Elastic wiasband Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow 5806.20.00
fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an
adhesive (bolducs).
Elastic wiasband
BRI oT-5%




i

U:@E_gg* ZZ

[C2 e G I FioIeE afar (First Schedule Bangladeh 2P,
< Customs Tariff 2029-2038 SFRIAr S\
30. WOVEN TAPE/ALL KIND OF Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of heading 58.07; narrow 5806.31.00
TAPE/VELCRO TAPE/COTTON fabrics consisting of warp without weft assembled by means of an
TAPE/TWILL TAPE(RE CYCLEABLE gfghciigﬁ (bolducs).
31. MAIN LABLE, SIZE LABLE, CARE Labels, badges and similar articles of textile materials, in the piece, 5807.10.00
LABLE, JOKER LABLE, LABLE in i
strips or cut to shape or size, not embroidered
ACCESSORIES
32. SHERPA 100% POLYESTER FABRIC Pile fabrics, including "long pile" fabrics and terry fabrics, knitted or 6001.29.00
crocheted OTHER TEXTILE MATERIALS
33, RIB FABRICS Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30 cm, other | 6003.30.00
than
those of heading 60.01 or 60.02 OF SYNTHETIC FIBRES
34, | Dyed /other/KNIT FABRICS OF YEARN Warp knit fabrics (including those made on galloon knitting 6005.21.00
DIFFERENT COLORS ARTIFICIAL FIBRES machines), 6005.22.00
POLYESTER KNIT FABRICS other than of headings 60.01 to 60.04 Unbleached or bleached 6005.23.00
Dyed 6006.32.00
Of yams of different colours
35. Knit fabric Other knitted or crocheted fabrics 6006.23.00
Of yams of different colours
36. Knit fabric Other knitted or crocheted fabrics 6006.31.00
Unbleached or bleached
37. Super tuck/tacks Nails, tacks, drawing pins, corrugated nails, staples (other than those | 7317.00.00
of heading 83.05) and similar articles, of iron or steel, whether or not
with heads of other material, but excluding such articles with heads
of
copper
38. BASE METAL PLATE Sign-plates, name-plates, address-plates and similar plates, 8310.00.00
numbers
letters and other symbols, of base metal, excluding those of, heading
94.05. .
39. Sewing machine needles Sewing machines, other than book-sewing machines of heading 8452.30.00
84.40;
fumiture, bases and covers specially designed for sewing machines;
sewing machine needies.
40. Proximity Cards and tags Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, "smart cards® . | 8523.59.10
and other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena,
whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the
production of discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37.
Proximity Cards and tags
41. RFID TAG imported by Industrial IRC holder VAT Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices, "smart cards" 8523.59.20
compliant 100% and other media for the recording of sound or of other phenomena,
export-oriented textile industry whether or not recorded, including matrices and masters for the
production of discs, but excluding products of Chapter 37.
RFID TAG imported by Industrial IRC holder VAT compliant 100%
export-oriented textile industry
42. Security tag Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus {for example, bells, 8531.80.00
sirens, indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other than those
of heading 85.12 or 85.30
Other apparatus
43. Button rivet and Other Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button 9606.29.00
moulds and other parts of these articles; button blanks
Other
44. | Button moulds and other parts of buttons; button blanks | Buttons, press-fasteners, snap-fasteners and press-studs, button 9606.30.00
mouids and other parts of these articles; button blanks
Button moulds and other parts of buttons; button blanks
BT “jBl->0
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45, Piastic vision zipper/nylon zipper Slide fasteners and parts thereof. 9607.19.00

Slide fasteners

46. | Tailors' dummies and other lay figures; automata and | Tailors' dummies and other lay figures; automata and other animated | 9618.00.00
other animated displays, used for shop window dressing
displays, used for shop window dressing
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; i cm: o= B firsm e
| 01 | ®nil fahinc?tcnrcm:nn _ . B002 20.00 | AR
Warp knitted fabirics (including those made on e e B 11
, lgon machines): b Tar e e e =B oyl pyile weer s e
| 02 | Knit fabrcs of dyed cotlon BUCS22.00 | foosws evrgrs o A e
i | Woven fabrics cotton, containing 85% or more ' D ] =
by weight of colton, weighing not more then |
2
L3 | Waven fabeecs of plain weave, weighing mare than B20812.00
{ | "a0g/mé unblasched Il ——
04 | WWoven tabrics of 3-thread or d-lhroad swil £504 13 00
neludng crogs twil untdeachea
0% | Wouen fabrics of plain weave we ghing nal Hsgre  &306 21 )
| han 300g/m¢ bisacheq s :
Ui Viovarn fabrics of plaes wesve we Frung meore man . B208 7 00
120g/m- Bleachad I
07 Waven fabncs of plarm wegwe e - gy mfn e dei s o S B
tran 100gm?. dyed )
L8 | Woven fabncs of 3.fvead o & Fraas e B0 N o
NN Ehoss fwill, Byes 5
08 | Weven fabrics of plain weave wepiEng o T EXORZ0 0D
100gim?, prini=d = _ |
Woven fabrics of cotton, contairmng B5% or
more by weight of cotton. weighing more than
200 gim2:
10| Woven fabnes of plain weave, unoisgehed E209.11.00
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