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ITEM NAME AS PER BCT.2O23-2024 H.S CODESL.

No

COMMERCIAL NAME
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-- -r---:-^i ...l..]rar
dlscs ano rlngs)' trl ultvuruar

Rrabber Tube ffirt^h mnttlnc 2nn ottltst

4006.90.00
I 96.06

Buttons, Press-fasteners' sniap-Tastenels arru Pr

oarts of these anrcles; outtol

lilza

r Lilaill\D.i,

fG plastics not coGred with textile materia 9606.21.00
2. nastic SnaP Button (all

kinds of Plastic Butto!)- 83.08
elasptiEmes with clasps, buckles,.bucKle-clasps, no"1"-'^Ill"^ rivErEto qrrv rrrv rrr\v

of base metal, of a find-used for clothing or clothing accessories' footwear' jewellery'

wrist-watches, books, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or saddlery or for other .
made up artictes; tuou[i oi [iturcated ,irett, it base-metal; beads and spangles' of

basemetal , =:; ; ;;;-,:::;: 8308.90.00
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Metal StoPPer
(Juler, [luruuurB P4LD

55.15
Otner woven fabrics of sYnt 1( )tlc sEple TlDres. \Jr PolyElN'I elayrs

la filrrac 5515.11.004. I viscose Fabrics Mixed malnly or solely wllll vrDu'ueE rqyvr

83.09
Stoppers, caps andlids (including crown corks' screw caps ano Pourrlrg u..,PPsro7'

Afi[;il[otti"r, tnie)aOeO bu-ngs, bung covers, seals and other packing

accessories of base metSl = , ,
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-,
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Othef made Up ClOthing aCCeSSOneS, Knl1eo ot GIUUITt.'i'u' NrrrLtsv vr vrvvrrvlvY r-'
qarments gr of clothing acce9sories' r,

6117.90.00
6. Cup and Collar - . .. l 39'14 39.26

othgr anlcles oT plasllos arru
Other

3926.90.99
7. Plastic Seal /Plastic D-

Rino/ Plastics Sticker/ 8310.00.00
8. Metal Badge /Plate (all

Kinds of Metals)

Sion-olates, name-plates' aooress-plares ar
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ffiandfittingstherefor(forexampte,Joln[S,eloowS'
flanqes). of Plastics. 3917.39.90
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SL COMMERCIALNAME ITEM NAME AS PER BCT.2O22-2023 H.S CODE

Other knitted or crocheted fabrics 60.06
0l Knitted Dved Fabric - Dved 6006.32.00
02 Of Yams of different colours other Knitted

Fabric
- Of yarns of different colours 6006.33.00

Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods, of plastics; stoppers, lids, caps and other closures, ol
olastics.

39.23

03
Poly Bag

- Boxes, cases, crates and similar articles 3923.10.00
04 -- Other 3923.29.90

Glass beads, imitation pearls, imitation precious or semi-precious stones and
similar glass small wares, and articles thereof other than imitation jewellery, glass
eyes other than prosthetic articles; statuettes and other ornamenb of lamp worked
glass, other than imitation jewellery; glass micro spheres not exceeding 1 mm in
diameter.

70.18

05 Glass beads imitation pearls, imitation precious
of semi-precious stones and similar glass small

wares. Rhinestone

- Other 7018.90.00

Nonwovens, whether or not impregnated, coated, covered or
laminated.

56.03

06 description Fusible Interlining ,non woven
fusible Interlinins

-- Weighing not more than25 glm2 5603.91.00

Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton, weighing not
more than 2O0 olm2.

52.08

07 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twill
100% cotton woven dyed Fabric

- 3-thread or 4{hread twill, including cross twill s208.33.00

08 Plain weave, Weighing more then 100 g/m2
printed cotton Fabric

- Plain weave, weighing more than 100 g/m2 5208.52.00

Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85% or more by weight of cotton, weighing more
than 200 o/m2.

52.09

09 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twill
Fabric

- 3-thread or 4{hread twill, including cross twill 5209.32.00

Woven fabrics of cotton, containing Iess than 85% by weight bf cotton, mixed mainly
or solely with man-made fibres, weighing not more than 200 g/m2.

52.10

10 Plain weave fabric. - Plain weave 5210.11.00
Other woven fabrics of cotton, 52.12

H Printed fabric * Printed 52t2.15.00
Woven fabrics of synthetic filament yarn,
including woven fabrics obtained from
materials of headinq 54.04.

54.07

Containing 85% or more by weight of non
textured polyester lllaments I 00%Polyester

woven t'abric

- Containing 85 7o or more by weight of non- textured
polyester filaments.

5407.61.00

s_q{H el&t-qs
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SL COMMERCIAL NAME ITEM NAME AS PER BCT.2022-2023 H.S CODE

l3 Other woven Unbleached or bleached polyester
' fabric

- Unbleached or bleached 5407.91.00

Other woven fabrics of svnthetic staole fibres. 55.15
t4 Mixed mainly or solely with wool or fine animal

hair
- Mixed mainly or solely with wool or fine animal hair s515.22.00

Tyre cord fabric of high tenacity yarn of nylon or other polyamides, polyesters or
viscose ravon.

59.02

l5 Of nylon or other polyamides Nylon tire code
dipped fabric tire cord

- Of nylon or other polyamides: 5902.10.00

Woven fabrics of cotton, containing 85o/o or more by weight of cotton, weighing more
than 200 o/m2.

52.09

l6 3-thread or 4-thread twill, including cross twill
100%o cotton woven Fabric

- 3-thread or 4{hread twill, including cross twill 5209.12.00

Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other flat shapes, of plastics,
whether or not in rolls.

39.19

17 Other -* Other 3919.90.99
Woven fabrics of artificial filament yarn, including woven fabrics
obtained from materials of headinq 54.05.

54.08

l8 Printed fabric - Printed s408.34.00
Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven, knitted or crocheted fabrics; lace
in the piece, in strips or in motifs, other than fabrics of headings 60.02 to 60.06.

58.04

1r Tulles and other net fabric lace fabrics mesh
fabric.

Tulles and other net fabrics, not including woven,
knitted or crocheted fabrics; lace in the piece, in strips
or in motifs, other than fabrics of headings 60.02 to
60.06.

s804.10.00

Other woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres. 55.15
20 Mixed mainly or solely with wool or fine animal

hair all kind of wool fabric
- Mixed mainly or solely with wool or fine animal hair: s515.13.00
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NAME

ITEM NAME AS PER BCT.2022-2023 H.S CODE YEARLY
IMPORT

Entitlement
0l Other Plinted

Knitted Fabric
Other knitted or crocheted fabrics

--- Printed

6006.34.00

LIC
Requirement as

per UD &
Export

02 Supper Tag Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (lbi
example, bells,sirens, indicator panels, burglar or
fire alarms), other than those of
heading 85.12 or 85.30
-- Other apparatus

8s3 1.80.00
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SL Name 0f Raw Materials Raw Materials Description As Per BCT Book
(2020-20211

H.S Code Yearly Import
Entitlement

(A) Accessories

I Plastic Ending Cap
Other articles of plastics and articles of other
materials of headine Nos.39.01 to 19.14. -Others 3926.90.99

<slfr{B'rE s
iFCrdRnr

Flslr{s
qlqfirstrB^r

2 Rubber Ending Cap
Other articles of vulcanised rubber other than
hard rubber 4016.99.90

J

Paper Jacron label/Badge/
Patch lbr RMG.
(Non-Adhesive)

Paper or paperboard labels ofall kind, whether
or not printed 4304.00.00

4

Paper llang taglPice
ticket/Wasit tag for RMG
(Non-Adhesive)

Paper or paperboard labels of all kind, whether
or not printed 4821.10.00

5
Wasit Band (Printed) for
RMG.

Braids in the piece, ornamental trimming in the
piece, without embroidery, other than knitted or
crocheted, tassels, pompons and similar articles.-
Other

5808.90.00

6 Plastic Washer for RMG.
Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods,
of plastic, stoppers, lids, caps and other closures,
of plastics- Other

3923.90.90

. tcqfs qFrIiKqi
\lC E{-sfiqqr*

WDa

ffi@
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SL Name Of Raw Materials Raw Materials Description As Per BCT Book(2020-2021) H.S Code Yearly Import
Entitlement

Security Alarm/ Pencil

Tag/Supper tag VST
Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for example,
bells, sirens, indicator panels, burglar or fire alarms), other
than those of heading 85. I 2 or 85.30- Parts

8531.10.00

<6tfr qr+"rq s

AWrErful
c{lvtrfit

\[lrrflRr{t'B. r

2 MetalClip

Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks,
eyes, eyelets and the like, of base metal, of a kind used tbr
clothing or clothing accessories, footwear, jewellery,
wrist-watches, books. awnings, Ieather goods, travel goods
or saddlery or fol other made up articles; tubular or
bifurcated rivets, ofbase metal; beads and spangles, of
base metal-- Other, including pafts

8308.90.00

J
Wool Fabric Woven fabrics of carded w6ol or of carded tlne anirn.al

hair-- Other 5 I l 1.90.00

4 All Kinds of Wool Fabric
Other woven fabrics of synthetic staple fibres-

- Mixed mainly or solely with wool or fine animal hair:
ss 15.13.00

5
Key Chain Chain and parts thereof, ofiron or steel-

-- Other chain 7315.t2.00

6
RFID/Seorrity

label/Sticker/Hangtag

Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices,
"smart cards" and other media for the recording of sound
or of other phenomena, whether or not recorded, including
matrices and masters fbr the production of discs, but
excluding products ofChapter 37--- Other.

8523.59.20

7
Leather Zipper Puller Articles of apparel and clothing accessorieso of leather or

of composition leather-Other clothing accessqries
4203.40.00

8 Jvletal key chain lock/Ring

Clasps, frames rvith clasps, buckles. buckle-clhsps, hooks,
eyes, eyelets and the like, of base metal, of a kind used tbr
clothing or cloth ing accessories. tbotrvear, jewel lery,
wrist-rvatches, books, arvnings, leather goods, travel goods
or saddlery or for other made up articles; tubular or
bifurcated rivets, ofbase metal; beads and spangles, of
base metal-- Other, including pafts

8308.90.00
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SL Name Of Raw Materials Raw Materials Description As Per BCT Book(2020-2021) H.S Code Yearly Import
Entitlement

9 Plastic Eyelet
Other articles of plastics and articles of other materials of
heading Nos. 39.01 to 39.14-

--- Other
3926.90.99
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SL
Name Of Raw

IVlaterials

Raw Materials Description As Per BCT Book
(2020-2021)

H.S Code
Yearly
Import

Entitlement

0l Shrinkable Tube

Tubes, Pipes and hoses and fittings therefor (for example,

ioints" elbows flanges) of plastics-PVC Shrinkable Tube

(Plain)
39t7.23.10

Requirement

as per UD &
Export L/C

02 Tape (All Kinds)

Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip and other

flat shapes of plastics whether or not in rolls-Self-
Adhesive tape in rolls exceeding 20 cm imported by

industrial IRC holder VAT compliant manufactures.

3919.90.10

03 Folding Carlon

Caftons, boxes, Cases, bags and other packing containers

of paper paperboard, cellulose wadding or webs of
cellulose fibers; box files, letter trays and similar articles
of paper ol paperboard of a kind used in offices shops or

the like-Fotding Cartons, Boxes and Cases, of non-

con ugated paper and paperboald.

4819.20.00

04 Denim Fabric
WoVen labrics of cotton, containing 85 7o or rnore by
weight of cotton r.r,eighing more than 200 g/m2.- Denim

5209.42.00

05 Velcro Tape

Narrow woven fabrics other than goods of heading 58.07;

narrow fabrics consisting of wrap without weft assembles

,by means of an adhesive bolducs-Fabrics Consisting of
warp without weft assernbled by means of an adhesive

(bolducs).

5806.40.00

06 Woven Tape

Narror,v woven f'abrics other than goods of heading 58.07;

nan'ow tabrics consisting of wrap without wetl assembles

by means of an adhesive bolducs-Of Cotton t.

5806.31.00

07 Metal Plate/Badges

Clasps frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-clasps, hooks,

eyes, eyelets and the like of base metal, of a kind used for
clothing ol clothing accessories fbotwear, jewelry, wrist-
watches, books, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or
saddler or tbr other made up articles tublal ol bifurcated
rivets of base metal beads and spangles of base metal-

Other Including parts.

8308.90.00

/ -qrm 1&r x-1s77



'Name Of Raw
Materials

Raw Materials Description As Per BCT Book
(2020-2021)

H.S Code
Yearly
Import

Entitlement

08 Metal Stopper

Stoppers, Caps and lids (lncluding crown corks, screw

caps and pouring stoppers)capsules for bottles, threaded

bungs, bung covers, seals and other packing accessories of
base metal- Other

8309.90.90

Requirement

as per UD &
Export L/C

09
Alarm Tag/ Super

Tag/ Security

Discs tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage devices smart

cards and other media tbr the recording of sound or of
other phenomena whether or not recorded, including

matrices and masters fbr the production of discs, but

excluding products-Rfid Tag imported by industrial IRC

holder VAT compliant 100% export oriented textile

industry.

8523.59.20
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SL Name Of Raw Materials H.S Code Yearly Import
Entitlement

OI Brace/ Suspender 62 I 2.90.00. 6212.t0.00,
62 I 2.20 .00. 62 t 2.30.00

Requirement as per

UD & Export L/C02 Belt (All kinds) 62t7.90.00
03 Beads/ Imitation Pearls/ Stone Etc: 70r8.I0.00
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01

Nails, Tacltq Orawing Pin, corrugated nails, staples and siimilar arlicles, of
iron or steel, whetheror not with heads of otter matefial, but exeluding such
articles wilh head: glpryqlry4l

rc17 m.00

rst6qt.t'rq\etEft'{
afrqtarctrq-o i

a2 Spring Washers and olher Lsck Washers 7318.21,00

03 Olhers Washers 7318.?2,0A

04
Nails, taeks, Siaples ,Screws, bolts, nuts, screw hooks, rivets, cotters, cotter-
pins,lashers and similar articles (Rivels). 7616.10.00

05 Tubutar or bifurcated Rivets 8308,20.00

00 Ctoth, Grill, netting and fenclng of Aluminum Wire 76't6.91 .00gll Hooks, eyes and ev$qts of meta{ base _ - _ 8308.10"00
UU] uther, Including Farts 830r.90"00

09 Burglar or fire alarrns and similar apparatus (security Alarm) 8543,70.90

1U Braids/Movilon Tape 5808.10.00
11 Press.fastener€; snap-fa$teners and ptee-studs and lq$5$CrefofE$blq 96t]6.10.00

IL Button Moulds and olhei parts of buttons; Button blanks, 9606.30.00

13 Polymers of vinyl chtoride(PVC Sheet) 3921.12 00
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