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CHEMICAL -
1 | ANTIFOMING AGENT/DEFOAMING AGENT 3809.10.00, 3809.91.00,
3402.11.10 TO 3402.90.90
2 | WETTING AGENT/DETERGENT 3402.11.10 TO 3402.90.90
3 | ANTICREASING AGENT/BINDER 3906.10.00 TO 3906.90.00,
3809.91.00, 3824.10.00 TO
3824.99.90
4_| CUSTIC SODA 2815.11.00 TO 2815.30.00
5 | PER OXIDE STABILIZER/FINISHING AGENT 3809.10.00 TO 3809.91.00 &
3910.00.00, 3809.10.00 TO
3906.10.00
6 | ACRYLIC POLYMER IN PRIMARY FORMS 3906.90.00 TO 3906.10.00
(OTHER)
7 | SEQUESTARING AGENT 3809.91.00, 3809.91.00,
2931.10.00 TO 2931.90.00
8 _| STAIN REMOVEER/OIL 3402.11.10 TO 3402.90.90
9 | ACETIC ACID 2915.21.00
10 | CORE NUTRALIZING AGENT 3809.91.00
11| PER OXIDE KILLER CHEMICAL BASED 3809'9"30;’653379"00'00 To
12 | ENZYME FOR BIO-POLISHING AGENT (TEXTILE 3507.90.90, 3910.00.00,
CHEMICAL) 3507.90.90
13 3809.91.00, 3809.10.00, 59,63 (feareg wifii <4
LEVELLING AGENT 3906.90.00 1R) (U5
14 3809.91.00, 3809.10.00,
DIE BARTH SEQUESTARING AGENT 3906.90.00 ’
15 3824.90.90, 2805.11.00 TO
LIQUID ALKALI 2805.19.00
16 3402.90.90, 3809.91.00,
SOAPING AGENT 3906.90.90 ,
17 3809.91.00, 3809.90.00,
FIXING AGENT 3911.90.00
18 | ENZYME (ALL KINDS) 3507.10.00 TO 3509.90.90
19 3403.19.00 TO 3403.20.00,
SOFTNER FOR WHITE (TEXTILE AUXILLIRIES) 34039100, 3809.91.00
20 | SOFTNER FOR COLOUR 3809.91.00,3809.10.00
21 3809.91.00, 3809.10.00,
SILICON SOFTNER 3910.00.00 ]
22 [ OPTICIAL BRIGHTNER (COTTON) BRIGHTENING 3204.20.00, 3204.90.00
AGENT S
23 | OPTICAL BRIGHTNER POLYESTER 3204.20.00
24 | HYDRO SULPHIDE (HYDROS) 2833.19.00, 2833.11.00,
- 3809.91.00, 3402.90.90
25 | LEVELLING AGENT(POLYESTER) (TEXTILE 3809.91.00, 3402.90.90,
AUXILLIRIES), PAC 2827.32.00_
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26 | DISPERSING AGENT (POLYESTER) 3809.91.00, 3402.90.90
27 | SOAPING AGENT (POLYESTER) (TEXTILE ' 3402.90.90 to 3809.91.00
AUXILLIRIES)
28 | UV PROTECTION AGENT 3809.91.00
29 | ACID BUFFER (POLYESTER) 3809.91.00
30 | HYDROFOBIC (POLYESTER) 3891.91.00
31 | BUFFE FOR REACTIVE DYES AGENT 3906.90.00, 3204.16.00
32 | SINGLE PACK DETERGENT STABLIZER 3824.90.90, 3809.91.00,
WETTING/DETERGENT 3402.90.90
33 | FERROUS 2833.29.90 TO 2833.29.10
34 | OXIDIZING AGENT FOR COTTON DYEING 2904.99.00, 3809.91.00
35 | ANTI REDUCTION FINISHING AGENT 3809.91.00 a
36 | ANTI BECTERIA FINISHING AGENT 3824.90.90, 3809.91.00
37 | DE COLOR POLYMER/CATIONIC POLYMER,
ANTICREASE AGENT, 2915.11.00, 3402.90.10.00,
STABLIZER, PEROXID E KILLER, ACRYLIC, 3906.90.00
HYDROZEN PER OXIDE o
38 | Prepared binders for foundry moulds or cores;
chemical products and preparations of the chemical or
allied industries (including those consisting of mixtures 3824.99.99
of natural products), not elsewhere specified or included
------ Other Per Oxide Stablizer/Sequestering Agent
39 | Anticreasing Agent, Other 3824.99.99
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Fabrics
Other knitted or crocheted fabrics

-- Of wool or fine animal hair

01 Knit Fabrics 6006.10.00
-- Of cotton:

02 | Knit Fabrics -- Of yarns of different colors 6006.23.00

03 | Knit Fabrics - Printed 6006.24.00
-- Of synthetic fibers:

04 | Knit Fabrics - Unbleached or bleached 6006.31.00

05 | Knit Fabrics -- Dyed - 6006.32.00

06 | Knit Fabrics ~-- Of yarns of different colors 6006.33.00

07 | Knit Fabrics - Printed 6006.34.00
-- Of artificial fibers:

08 | Knit Fabrics -- Unbleached or bleached 6006.41.00

09 | Knit Fabrics - Dyed T 6006.42.00

10 | Knit Fabrics -- Of yarns of different colors 6006.43.00

11 | Knit Fabrics (Printed) -- Printed 6006.44.00

12 | Knit Fabrics (Other Printed) - Other - 6006.90.00

Woven pile fabrics and chenille fabrics, other than fabrics of heading 58.02 or 58.06.

13 Woven Pile Fabrics - Of wool or fine animal hair 5801.10.00
- Of cotton:

14 | Woven Pile Fabrics -- Uncut weft pile fabrics 5801.21.00

15 | Woven Pile Fabrics -- Cut corduroy 5801.22.00

16 | Woven Pile Fabrics -- Other weft pile fabrics 5801.23.00

Woven Pile Fabrics -- Warp pile fabrics.

17 . 5801.27.00
- Of man-made fibers:

18 | Woven Pile Fabrics -- Uncut weft pile fabrics 5801.31.00

19 | Woven Pile Fabrics -- Other weft pile fabrics 5801.33.00

20 | Woven Pile Fabrics -- Warp pile fabrics 5801.37.00

21 | Woven Pile Fabrics - Of other textile materials 5801.90.00 |
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—Yarn (other than sewing thread) of artificial staple fibers, not put up for retail sale.
- Containing 85% or more by weight of artificial staple fibers:
-- Single yarn

22 | AllKinds of Yarn — Multiple (folded) or cabled yarn: 5510.11.00
23 All Kinds of Yarn --- Other 5510.12.90
24 | AliKinds of Yarn - Other yarn 5510.90.00
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YARN2
1 SILK YARN ALL KIND 5001.00.00 TO 5007.90.00
2 ALL KIND OF WOOL YARN COTTON 5101.11.00 TO 5113.00.00
YARN CARDED OR COMBED
3 ALL KINDS OF COTTON YARN CARDED 5201.00.00 TO 5212.25.00
OR COMBED
4 | COTTON YARN SEWING THREAD 5204.11.00 TO 5205.48.00
5 CARDED BCI OR COMBED YARN 5205.11.00 TO 5205.48.00
6 | SYNTHETIC FILAMENT YARN (ALL 5401.10.00. TO 5408.34.00,
KINDS OF) 5408.10.10 TO 5408.34.00
7 SYNTHETIC FILAMENT YARN OF NYLON 5402.11.00 TO 5402.39.00
8 SYNTHETIC FILAMENT YARN OF 5402.11.00 TO 5402.39.00
POLYESTER / POLYESTER YARN
9 SYNTHETIC FILAMENT YARN OF 5402.11.00 TO 5402.49.00
POLYPROPYLENE/LYCRA
YARN/SPANDEX YARN
10 | ARTIFICIAL FILAMENT YARN OF 5403.10.00 TO 5403.49.00
VISCOSE YARN
11 | ARTIFICIAL FILAMENT YARN OF 5403.10.00 TO 5403.49.00
VISCOSE RAYON YARN BTG @ Aer=ied b1fRT Greie
12 | SYNTHETIC MONOFILAMENT YARN OF 5404.11.00 TO 5405.00.00
ELASTOMERIC
13 ALL KINDS OF FABRICS 6001.10.00 TO 6002.90.00, 5208.11.00 TO
5212.25.00
14 Other knitted or crocheted fabrics - Dyed Mesh Fabrics 6006.32.00
15 Narrow woven fabrics, other than goods of
headmg. 58.07; narrow fabrics consisting of Valero Fabrics 5806.39.00
warp without weft assembled by means of an
adhesive (bolducs). Of other textile materials
16 Other plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of
plastics, non-cellular and not reinforced,
laminated, supported or similarly combined
with other materials. -- Of unsaturated |[ abel Roll/Ink Rolls/Ribon Roll 3920.63.10
polyesters --- Unprinted polyester film in roll Plastic/Polyester R
form imported by Industrial IRC holder VAT
compliant plastic products manufacturing
industry
17 Cotton, carded or combed Cotton, Carded or Combed, 5203.00.00
18 Synthetic filament yarn (other than sewing
thread), not put up for retail sale, including
synthetic monofilament of less than 67 decitex.
- High tenacity yam of nylon or other
polyamides, whether or not textured:
19 | --Ofpolyesters Polyester Yam 5402.33.00
20 | -- Other, of polyesters Polyester Yam 5402.47.00 A\ ( J v gm"
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21 - Other yam, single, with a twist exceeding 50 5402.52.00
turns Polyester Yamn
per metre: -- Of polyesters
22 - Other yarn, multiple (folded) or cabled: --- Of 5402.62.00
Polyester Yam
polyesters
Artificial filament yarn (other than sewing
thread), not put up for retail sale, including
artificial monofilament of less than 67 decitex.
23 -- High tenacity yarn of viscose rayon 5403.10.00
24 -- Of viscose rayon, untwisted or with a twist 5403.31.00
notexceeding 120 turns permetre
25 -- Of viscose rayon, with a twist exceeding 5403.32.00
120turns per metre .
26" | -- Of cellulose acetate Viscose Yam 5403.33.00
27 -- Other 5403.39.00
28 -- Of viscose rayon 5403.41.00
29 -- Of cellulose acetate 5403.42.00
30 | --Other 5403.49.00
31 . . All Kind of Mixed Yam 5510.30.90
Yarn (other than sewing thread) of artificial
staple fibres, not put up for retail sale., Other
32 |Yarn (other than sewing thread) of artificial staple Viscose Yarn
fibres, not put up for retail sale. Single yarn 5510.11.00
Multiple (folded) or cabled yarn
33 |Yarn (other than sewing thread) of artificial staple Viscose Yarn 5510.12.90
fibres, not put up for retail sale., Other
34 |Yarn (other than sewing thread) of artificial staple Viscose Yarn 5§510.30.90
fibres, not put up for retail sale., Other
Fabrics 2
35 | Containing by weight 5% or more of Knit Fabric 6002.40.00
elastomeric yarn containing rubber thread e
36 | Other Knit Fabric 6002.90.00
37 | Containing by weight 5% or more of Knit Fabric
elastomeric yarn but not containing rubber 6004.10.00
thread
38 | Other Knit Fabric 6004.90.00
39 | Unbleached or bleached Knit Fabric 6006.21.00
40 | Dyed Knit Fabric 6006.22.00
41 Other Of yarns of different colours Knit Fabric 6006.42.90
DYES $
42 REACTIVE DYES 3204.11.00 TO 3204.19.00
43 DISPERSE DYES 3204.11.00 TO 3204.19.00
44 | PIGMENT PREPARATION BASED 3204.11.00 TO 3204 90.00
THEREON DYES @9.¢q (fogig Wi i ) .
45 | BASIC DYES & PREPARATION BASED 3204.11.00 TO 3204.90.00 5
THEREON DYES
46 OTHERS ORGANIC PRODUCT DYES 3204.11.00 TO 3204.90.00
47 | SYNTHETIC ORGANIC PRODUCT DYES 3204.11.00 TO 3204.90.00
48 | SYNTHATIC ORGANIC PRODUCT DYES 3201.11.00 TO 3201.90.00
OPTICAL BRIGHTNER
CHEMICAL 3
49 ANTIFOMING AGENT/DEFOAMING 3809.10.00, 3809.91.00, 3402.11.10 TO
AGENT 3402.90.90
50 | WETTING AGENT/DETERGENT 3402.11.10 TO 3402.90.90
51 ANTICREASING AGENT/BINDER 3906.10.00 TO 3906.90.00, 3809.91.00,
3824.10.00 TO 3824.99.90
52 | CUSTIC SODA 2815.11.00 TO 2815.30.00 (
53 | PER OXIDE STABILIZER/FINISHING 3809.10.00 TO 3809.91.00 & 3910.00.00, e\
AGENT 3809.10.00 TO 3906.10.00
54 | ACRYLIC POLYMER IN PRIMARY FORMS 3906.90.00 TO 3906.10.00 N o
(orHER) (o TG
55 | SEQUESTARING AGENT 3809.91.00, 3809.91.00, 2931.10.00 TO srﬁﬁa ﬁ ?gﬁl"\'ﬂfr‘“’
2931.90.00 TTI ey, TP
56 STAIN REMOVEER/OIL 3402.11.10 TO 3402.90.90 st C
57 ACETIC ACID 2915.21.00




=71 R-9C=

[GaREs JHEIEE | G3p. @, @S 32/03/203¢ . TS ¥3/03/20%Y
1= . =t sioreEE e s
Ao AR (g AT 1. O |
58 CORE NUTRALIZING AGENT 3809.91.00
59 | PER OXIDE KILLER CHEMICAL BASED 3809.91.00, 3507.10.00 TO 3507.90.90
60 | ENZYME FOR BIO-POLISHING AGENT 3507.90.90, 3910.00.00, 3507.90.90
(TEXTILE CHEMICAL)
61 | LEVELLING AGENT 3809.91.00, 3809.10.00, 3906.90.00
62 | DIE BARTH SEQUESTARING AGENT 3809.91.00, 3809.10.00, 3906.90.00
63" | LIQUID ALKALI 3824.90.90, 2805.11.00 TO 2805.19.00
64 SOAPING AGENT 3402.90.90, 3809.91.00, 3906.90.90
65 | FIXING AGENT 3809.91.00, 3809.90.00, 3911.90.00
66 ENZYME (ALL KINDS) 3507.10.00 TO 3509.90.90
67 | SOFTNER FOR WHITE (TEXTILE 3403.19.00 TO 3403.20.00, 3403.91.00,
AUXILLIRIES) 3809.91.00
68 | SOFTNER FOR COLOUR 3809.91.00,3809.10.00
69 | SILICON SOFTNER 3809.91.00, 3809.10.00, 3910.00.00 e .00 (SRfE) &1, B9
70 | OPTICIAL BRIGHTNER (COTTON)/ 3204.20.00, 3204.90.00
BRIGHTENING AGENT
7 OPTICAL BRIGHTNER POLYESTER 3204.20.00
72 HYDRO SULPHIDE (HYDROS) 2833.19.00, 2833.11.00, 3809.91.00, 3402.90.90
73 LEVELLING AGENT(POLYESTER) 3809.91.00, 3402.90.90, 2827.32.00
" | (TEXTILE AUXILLIRIES), PAC
74 DISPERSING AGENT (POLYESTER) 3809.91.00, 3402.90.90
75 | SOAPING AGENT (POLYESTER) (TEXTILE 3402.90.90 to 3809.91.00
AUXILLIRIES)
76 UV PROTECTION AGENT 3809.91.00
77 ACID BUFFER (POLYESTER) 3809.91.00
78 HYDROFOBIC (POLYESTER) 3891.91.00
79 BUFFE FOR REACTIVE DYES AGENT 3906.90.00, 3204.16.00
80 SINGLE PACK DETERGENT STABLIZER
WETTING/DETERGENT 3824.90.90, 3809.91.00, 3402.90.90
81 | FERROUS 2833.29.90 TO 2833.29.10
82 | OXIDIZING AGENT FOR COTTON
DYEING 2904.99.00, 3809.91.00
83 ANTI REDUCTION FINISHING AGENT 3809.91.00
84 ANTI BECTERIA FINISHING AGENT 3824.90.90, 3809.91.00 (
85 | DE COLOR POLYMER/CATIONIC
POLYMER, ANTICREASE AGENT, “
STABLIZER, PEROXID E KILLER, 2915.11.00, 3402.90.10.00, 3906.90.00 W SEH (.'5“—ir
ACRYLIC, HYDROZEN PER OXIDE cﬂ‘ﬂ@@ 'g%?“ ‘im@vi,
86 | Prepared binders for foundry moulds or cores; _Zﬂ-;sﬂ‘fi 5 !
3 ) wEwe).
chemical products and preparations of the st €
chemical or allied industries (including those
consisting of mixtures of natural products), not 3824.99.99
elsewhere specified or included------ Other Per
Oxide Stablizer/Sequestering Agent
87 | Anticreasing Agent, Other 3824.99.99
SALTS
88 | Sulphates; alums; peroxosulphates 2833.11.00, 2501.00.20
(persulphates). - Disodium sulphate/Glaumber
salt/ Sodium sulphates/ Sodium sulphates 839.00 (FR*S f&reR) @ VT
Anhydrous
89 | Sulphates; alums; peroxosulphates 2833.19.00
(persulphates).
- Sodium sulphates: - Other. Sodium Sulphates
Anhydrous
90 SODA ASH/SODA ASH LIGHT 2836.20.00, 2815.12.00 TO 2805.19.00
ACCESSORIES 3
91 | SEWING THREAD 5401.11.00, 5204.19.00
92 | BUTTON 9606.10.00
93 | POLY BAG/BLISTER BAG 3923.29.19
94 | PAPER CARTON 3921.19.00
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95 | ELASTIC 6217.10.00
96 | ZIPPER 9607.19.00
97 | FOLDER CARTON/BOXER 4819.20.00
98 | LABEL(WOVEN/PRINTED) 5807.10.00, 5807.90.00
99 | HANG TAG (PAPER) 4821.10.00
100 | TISSUE PAPER 4803.00.00
101 | TAGPIN 7319.90.00
102 | GUMTAPE 3919.90.10
103 | SCORTCH TAPE 3919.30.00
104 | PP BAND 8309.90.20
105 | METAL CLIP 8309.90.20
106 | CARTON PAPER 4911.10.00
107 | HANGER (PLASTIC) 3916.90.00
108 | SICKER 4821.10.00
109 | LACE FABRICS/OTHER LACE 5804.21.00, 5804.29.00, 5804.30.00
110 | LABEL ROLL/INK ROLLS/RIBON ROLLS 8443.91.00
111 | BUTTON(PLASTIC/Metal) 9606.21.00, 9606.22.00
112 | ELASTC/COTTON TAPE 5806.20.00
113 | LABEL(WOVEN/PRINTED) WHITE LABEL 5807.10.00, 5807.90.00
ROLLS 25§ asite BIfdA! OIS
114 | HANG TAG, PAPER) SUPER TAG, 4821.10.00
STICKER (STUDE STICKER,
TRANSPARENT STICKER, 3D STICKERS)
115 | Snap Button, Other Button 9606.10.00
116 | Silicon Label, Adhashive Label 4015.90.00
117 | Metal Clip Logo, Metal Badge 9606.29.00
118 | Folder Carton, Plastic Box, Paper Box 4819.20.00
119 | Adhashive Sticker (Printed/White) 4821.10.00
120 | Hard Tag/Alarm tag/Security labels) For 8531.80.00
Garments
121 | Metal Tips /Metal Stoper) others 8309.90.90
122 | Woven/Synthetic Fabrics (others) 5407.10.90
123 | Reflcting Tape of Plastic (others) 3920.10.90
124 | Zipper Puller (paris) 9607.20.00
125 |[Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-| Metal Rivets, Metal Coin 8308.20.00
clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the like, of base with String
metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing
accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches,
books, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or C
saddlery or for other made-up articles; tubular or ({»
bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and
spangles, of base metal. - Tubular or bifurcated cﬂ\,ﬂ/ﬂ
rivets W ﬂ%
126 Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape, strip CSST;@‘% z\'ﬁ;ﬁmﬂ\—ﬁ'ﬁ
fand other flat shapes, of plastics, whether or not in Valcro Tape 3919.90.99 acr%“‘ﬁ :}‘fﬁq . @t !
rolls. Other. gt €
127 |Articles for the conveyance or packing of goods,
of plastics; stoppers, lids, caps and other closures,
of l:;)lastics (inifuding cone:): --Of polymers of Poly Bag 3923.21.00
ethylene.
128 |Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage
devices, "smart cards" and other media for the
recording of sound or of other phenomena,
whether or not recorded, including matrices and Proximity cards 8523.59.10

masters for the production of discs, but excluding
products of Chapter 37. --- Proximity Cards and
tags
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129

Discs, tapes, solid-state non-volatile storage
devices, "smart cards" and other media for the
recording of sound or of other phenomena,
whether or not recorded, including matrices and
masters for the production of discs, but excluding

products of Chapter 37. --- Proximity Cards and
tags

RFID Tag

8523.59.20

130

Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape; strip
and other flat shapes, of plastics, whether or not
in rolls---Performance Tape/Closure/ Side Tape

Performance Tape/ Closure/
Side Tape

3919.90.20

131

Clasps, frames with clasps, buckles, buckle-
clasps, hooks, eyes, eyelets and the like, of base
metal, of a kind used for clothing or clothing
accessories, footwear, jewellery, wrist-watches,
books, awnings, leather goods, travel goods or
saddlery or for other made-up articles; tubular or
bifurcated rivets, of base metal; beads and
spangles, of base metal.

Metal Clip Logo/
Metal Base

8308.90.00

132

Self-adhesive plates, sheets, film, foil, tape,
stripand other flat shapes, of plastics, whether
or not in rolls. - In rolls of a width not
exceeding 20 cm----- Other

Scotch Tape Self Adhesive
In Roll

3919.90.99

133

Other plates, sheets, film, foil and strip, of
plastics, non-cellular and not reinforced,
laminated, supported or similarly combined
with other materials - Of polymers of
propylene: ---- Other

Heat Transferable

3920.10.90

Baths, shower-baths, sinks, wash-basins, bidets,
lavatory pans, seats and covers, flushing cisterns
and similar sanitary ware, of plastics.

134

--- Of polymers of ethylene

Plastic Stopper

3923.21.00

135

- Stoppers, lids, caps and other closures

Stoper/Size Ring/Plastic
Base/Badge/Matel/Lids/Caps

3923.50.00

136

Other articles of vulcanised rubber other than
hard rubber. ---- Other

Elastic/Elastic Binder

4016.99.90

137

Transfers(decalcomanias)
- Transfers (decalcomanias), vitrifiable:
-~ Other

Heat Transfer Label/ *
Transfer Label

4908.90.00

138

Electric sound or visual signaling apparatus (for
example, bells, sirens, indicator panels, burglar
or fire alarms), other than those ofheading
85.12 or 85.30.
- Burglar or fire alarms and similar apparatus

Super Tag

8531.10.00

139

Slide fasteners and parts thereof.
- Slide fasteners:
-- Fitted with chain scoops of base metal

Zipper (Metal) Slide Fastner
And Parts Fitted with chain
scoops of base metal

9607.11.00

140

inked or

otherwise prepared for giving impressions,

Typewriter or similar ribbons,

whether or not on spools or in cartridges; ink-
pads, whether or not inked, with or without
boxes. - Ribbons: --- Computer printer ribbons

Ink Ribbon/Ribbon Roll
Ribbon

9612,10.10

141

Embroidery without visible ground other
embroidery.

Embroidery/Embroidery
Fabric

5810.10.00
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Yarn (other than sewing thread) of artificial staple fibres, not put up forretail sale.

Yam (other than sewing thread) of artificial staple fibres, not put up forretail sale.

T -- Single yam
-- Multiple (folded) or cabled yarn :

Prepared binders for foundry moulds or cores; chemical products andpreparations of the chemical or allied industries
including thoseconsisting of mixtures of natural products), not elsewhere specified orincluded
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Accessories:-
Embroidery in the piece, in strips or in motifs
EMBROIDERY/ - Embroidery without visible ground 5810.10.00
I« EMBROIDERY FABRIC | - Other embroide
‘abric:-

Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width not exceeding 30 cm,containingby weight 5% or more of elastomeric yam or rubber thread,other than
those of heading 60.01.

1. - CEntaining by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn containing rubber thread | 6002.40.00

E WNITFABRICS [——— 6002.90.00

Knitted or crocheted fabrics of a width exceeding 30 cm, containing byweight 5% or more of elastomeric yarn or rubber thread, other those
ofheading 60.01

_ - Containing by weight 5% or more of elastomeric yam but not containing rubber | 6004.10.00
KNIT FABRICS | thread

6004.90.00

7 &
Other knitted or crocheted fabrics
Y -- Unbleached or bleached 6006.21.00

— KNIT FABRI —_
3. LS --= Other kg 25% Free 6006.42.90
_ -- Of yarns of different colours

q) TR

BCT (2022- : G%5 G (TS
2023) twrenIF TAINS WHToR . BCT (2023-
: BCT (2022-2023) twrens= et FvaeR BCT (2023-2024) wrenss 2024) TTeTCES
o Sulphates;alums; - Sulphates;alums; peroxosulphates(persulphates)
peroxosulphates(persulphates) Disodium Disodium Sulphate/ Disodium Sulphate//Glauber 2833.11.00,
Sulphates:alums: Sulphate/ Disodium Sulphate Salt / Sodium Sulphate / Sodium Sulphate 2501.00.20
peroxosulphates ‘ Anhydrous
(persulphates) Sulphates;alums; Sulphates;alums; peroxosulphates(persulphates) 2833.19.00
peroxosulphates(persulphates) -Sodium Sulphate:- Other, Sodium
-Sodium Sulphate:- Other, Sodium Sulphate | SulphateAnhydrous ¢ ’
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